AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

CONCURRENT RESOLUTIONS—OCT. 2, 2008 122 STAT. 5209

by HIV/AIDS not only through the Minority AIDS Initiative,
but through all available programs; and

(5) supports the continuing efforts of the Minority AIDS
Initiative to stop the spread of HIV/AIDS and urges effective,

compassionate treatment and care to individuals affected by
HIV/AIDS.

Agreed to October 2, 2008.

ADJOURNMENT—HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES  oct.2, 2008
AND SENATE [H. Con. Res. 440]

Resolved by the House of Representatives (the Senate concur-
ring), That when the House adjourns on any legislative day on
a motion offered pursuant to this concurrent resolution by its
Majority Leader or his designee, it stand adjourned until 11 a.m.
on Saturday, January 3, 2009, or until the time of any reassembly
pursuant to section 2 of this concurrent resolution, whichever occurs
first; and the Senate may adjourn or recess at any time from
Thursday, October 2, 2008, through January 3, 2009, on a motion
offered pursuant to this concurrent resolution by its Majority Leader
or his designee until such time as specified in that motion, but
not beyond noon on January 3, 2009, and it may reassemble pursu-
ant to section 2 of this concurrent resolution.

SEC. 2. The Speaker of the House and the Majority Leader of
the Senate, or their respective designees, acting jointly after con-
sultation with the Minority Leader of the House and the Minority
Leader of the Senate, shall notify the Members of the House and
the Senate, respectively, to reassemble at such place and respective
time as they may designate if, in their opinion, the public interest
shall warrant it.

Agreed to October 2, 2008.

ENROLLMENT CORRECTIONS—H.R. 6063 Oct. 2, 2008

[S. Con. Res. 105]

Resolved by the Senate (the House of Representatives concurring),
That in the enrollment of the bill H.R. 6063, an Act to authorize
the programs of the National Aeronautics and Space Administra-
tion, and for other purposes, the Clerk of the House of Representa-
tives shall make the following corrections:

In section 601(b)(2)(A)(iii) of the bill, strike “Orbiter”.

In section 611(d)(1) of the bill, strike “first President” and insert
“President”.

In section 611(e)(3) of the bill, strike “correctly” and insert “cur-
rently”.



122 STAT. 5210 CONCURRENT RESOLUTIONS—OCT. 3, 2008

Oct. 3, 2008

[H. Con. Res. 442]

Nov. 20, 2008

[H. Con. Res. 435]

' In section 611(e)(7) of the bill, strike “extention” and insert “exten-
sion”.

In section 612 of the bill, strike “operations” and insert “oper-
ational”.

In section 1119 of the bill, strike “The Report” and insert “The
report”.

Agreed to October 2, 2008.

ENROLLMENT CORRECTIONS—S. 3001

Resolved by the House of Representatives (the Senate concur-
ring), That in the enrollment of the bill S. 3001, the Secretary
of the Senate shall make the following corrections:

(1) In section 201(1), strike “$11,045,052,000” and insert

“$10,943,840,000”.

(2) In section 202(a), strike “$11,799,660” and insert

“$11,799,660,000”.

Agreed to October 3, 2008.

CAPITOL VISITOR CENTER CEREMONIES—
EMANCIPATION HALL AUTHORIZATION

Resolved by the House of Representatives (the Senate concur-
ring), That Emancipation Hall may be used on December 2, 2008,
for ceremonies and activities held in connection with the opening
of the Capitol Visitor Center to the public. Physical preparations
for such ceremonies and activities shall be carried out in accordance
with such conditions as the Architect of the Capitol may prescribe.

Agreed to November 20, 2008.



		Superintendent of Documents
	2012-09-27T11:01:05-0400
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




