AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

122 STAT. 5210 CONCURRENT RESOLUTIONS—OCT. 3, 2008

Oct. 3, 2008

[H. Con. Res. 442]

Nov. 20, 2008

[H. Con. Res. 435]

' In section 611(e)(7) of the bill, strike “extention” and insert “exten-
sion”.

In section 612 of the bill, strike “operations” and insert “oper-
ational”.

In section 1119 of the bill, strike “The Report” and insert “The
report”.

Agreed to October 2, 2008.

ENROLLMENT CORRECTIONS—S. 3001

Resolved by the House of Representatives (the Senate concur-
ring), That in the enrollment of the bill S. 3001, the Secretary
of the Senate shall make the following corrections:

(1) In section 201(1), strike “$11,045,052,000” and insert

“$10,943,840,000”.

(2) In section 202(a), strike “$11,799,660” and insert

“$11,799,660,000”.

Agreed to October 3, 2008.

CAPITOL VISITOR CENTER CEREMONIES—
EMANCIPATION HALL AUTHORIZATION

Resolved by the House of Representatives (the Senate concur-
ring), That Emancipation Hall may be used on December 2, 2008,
for ceremonies and activities held in connection with the opening
of the Capitol Visitor Center to the public. Physical preparations
for such ceremonies and activities shall be carried out in accordance
with such conditions as the Architect of the Capitol may prescribe.

Agreed to November 20, 2008.



PROCLAMATIONS






PROCLAMATION 8213—DEC. 20, 2007 122 STAT. 5213
Proclamation 8213 of December 20, 2007

To Implement an Amendment to the Dominican
Republic-Central America-United States Free Trade
Agreement

By the President of the United States of America
A Proclamation

1. On August 5, 2004, the United States entered into the Dominican
Republic-Central America-United States Free Trade Agreement (the
“Agreement’’;) with Costa Rica, the Dominican Republic, El Salvador,
Guatemala, Honduras, and Nicaragua (the ‘“Agreement countries”;).
The Congress approved the Agreement in section 101(a) of the Domini-
can Republic-Central America-United States Free Trade Agreement Im-
plementation Act (the “CAFTA-DR Act’’;) (19 U.S.C. 4011).

2. The Parties to the Agreement entered into an amendment to the
Agreement on July 27, August 6, and August 14, 2007 (the “Amend-
ment’’;). The terms of the Amendment are contained in letters of un-
derstanding between the United States and the Agreement countries
described in sections 1634(a)(2) and 1634(b)(2) of the Pension Protec-
tion Act of 2006 (Public Law 109-280, 120 Stat. 780).

3. Section 1634 of the Pension Protection Act authorizes the President
to proclaim modifications to the Harmonized Tariff Schedule of the
United States (HTS) as necessary to carry out the understandings de-
scribed therein subject, in the case of certain provisions of the Amend-
ment, to the consultation and layover requirements in section 104 of
the CAFTA-DR Act (19 U.S.C. 4014).

4. Section 203(o) of the CAFTA-DR Act (19 U.S.C. 4033) authorizes the
President to proclaim, as part of the HTS, the provisions set out in
Annex 4.1 of the Agreement.

5. Executive Order 11651 of March 3, 1972, as amended, established
the Committee for the Implementation of Textile Agreements (CITA),
consisting of representatives of the Departments of State, the Treasury,
Commerce, and Labor, and the Office of the United States Trade Rep-
resentative, with the representative of the Department of Commerce as
Chairman, to supervise the implementation of textile trade agreements.
Consistent with 3 U.S.C. 301, when carrying out functions vested in
the President by statute and assigned by the President to CITA, the of-
ficials collectively exercising those functions are all to be officers re-
quired to be appointed by the President with the advice and consent
of the Senate.

6. Section 604 of the Trade Act of 1974, as amended (the “1974 Act’’;)
(19 U.S.C. 2483), authorizes the President to embody in the HTS the
substance of relevant provisions of that Act, or other acts affecting im-
port treatment, and of actions taken thereunder.

NOW, THEREFORE, I, GEORGE W. BUSH, President of the United
States of America, acting under the authority vested in me by the Con-
stitution and the laws of the United States of America, including but
not limited to section 203 of the CAFTA-DR Act, section 1634 of the
Pension Protection Act, section 301 of title 3, United States Code, and
section 604 of the 1974 Act, do proclaim that:



		Superintendent of Documents
	2012-09-27T11:02:25-0400
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




