
PROGRAM No. 4573S Term 09/01/2009 through 08/31/2010     
TITLE Pressure Sensitive Labels

BASIS OF             
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AWARD UNIT RATE COST UNIT RATE COST UNIT RATE COST UNIT RATE COST

I. PRINTING , TRIMMING, AND DELIVERY:
1. Printing individual labels in single ink color:

(a) Makeready and/or setup charge…per order
(1) Format A 28 242.00 6,776.00 180.00 5,040.00 70.00 1,960.00 47.25 1,323.00
(2) Format B 56 242.00 13,552.00 225.00 12,600.00 95.00 5,320.00 47.25 2,646.00
(3) Format C 22 249.00 5,478.00 205.00 4,510.00 105.00 2,310.00 47.25 1,039.50

(b) Running…per 100 copies
(1) Format A 751 6.00 4,506.00 2.50 1,877.50 1.30 976.30 3.10 2,328.10
(2) Format B 2,463 8.00 19,704.00 6.50 16,009.50 1.50 3,694.50 3.10 7,635.30
(3) Format C 555 10.00 5,550.00 9.50 5,272.50 2.85 1,581.75 3.10 1,720.50

2. Printing sheet labels in single ink color (including cost of kiss cutting):
(a) Makeready and/or setup charge…per order

(1) Format A 14 242.00 3,388.00 205.00 2,870.00 60.00 840.00 50.00 700.00
(2) Format B 4 242.00 968.00 275.00 1,100.00 100.00 400.00 50.00 200.00
(3) Format C 2 249.00 498.00 255.00 510.00 105.00 210.00 40.00 80.00

(b) Running…per 100 copies
(1) Format A 310 NO BID 2.50 775.00 1.30 403.00 8.00 2,480.00
(2) Format B 49 NO BID 6.50 318.50 1.50 73.50 6.00 294.00
(3) Format C 220 NO BID 9.50 2,090.00 2.85 627.00 3.00 660.00

3. Printing each additional ink color (including floodcoating):
(a) Makeready and/or setup charge…per order

(1) Format A 24 108.00 2,592.00 70.00 1,680.00 40.00 960.00 21.00 504.00
(2) Format B 54 110.00 5,940.00 115.00 6,210.00 47.50 2,565.00 21.00 1,134.00
(3) Format C 15 114.00 1,710.00 125.00 1,875.00 50.00 750.00 21.00 315.00

(b) Running…per 100 copies
(1) Format A 770 8.00 6,160.00 2.50 1,925.00 0.50 385.00 2.10 1,617.00
(2) Format B 1,561 8.00 12,488.00 6.50 10,146.50 0.50 780.50 2.10 3,278.10
(3) Format C 555 11.00 6,105.00 9.50 5,272.50 0.50 277.50 2.10 1,165.50

II. DIE-CUTTING
1. Making die, any size…each 1 250.00 250.00 225.00 225.00 75.00 75.00 0.00 0.00
2. Die-Cutting:

(a) Makeready and/or setup charge…per order 13 75.00 975.00 50.00 650.00 10.00 130.00 21.00 273.00
(b) Running…per 100 copies 949 5.60 5,314.40 3.75 3,558.75 1.20 1,138.80 2.10 1,992.90

III. STOCK/PAPER…per 100 square inches:
(a) 60# White Uncoated Label Paper 10,059 0.40 4,023.60 0.23 2,313.57 0.074 744.37 0.10 1,005.90
(b) 60# Colored Fluorescent Label Paper 6,146 0.55 3,380.30 0.33 2,028.18 0.075 460.95 0.10 614.60
(c) White Vinyl 62,061 0.28 17,377.08 0.29 17,997.69 0.16 9,929.76 0.10 6,206.10
(d) Colored Vinyl 21,957 NO BID 0.42 9,221.94 0.161 3,535.08 0.15 3,293.55

IV. ADDITIONAL OPERATIONS:
(a) Numbering:

(1) Makeready and/or setup charge…per order 2 100.00 200.00 50.00 100.00 20.00 40.00 10.00 20.00
(2) Running…per 100 copies 1,000 25.00 25,000.00 0.35 350.00 1.30 1,300.00 2.00 2,000.00

(b) Clear Coat with weather/humid resistant covering:
(1) Makeready and/or setup charge…per order 51 114.00 5,814.00 50.00 2,550.00 6.50 331.50 18.00 918.00
(2) Running…per 100 copies 2,315 11.00 25,465.00 4.75 10,996.25 0.50 1,157.50 3.15 7,292.25

(c) Matte Laminate:
(1) Makeready and/or setup charge…per order 58 33.00 1,914.00 35.00 2,030.00 5.25 304.50 23.00 1,334.00
(2) Running…per 100 copies 1,489 5.00 7,445.00 0.23 342.47 2.60 3,871.40 4.00 5,956.00

(d) Special Adhesive:
(1) Makeready and/or setup charge…per order 6 10.00 60.00 100.00 600.00 8.00 48.00 0.00 0.00
(2) Running…per 100 copies 92 8.00 736.00 16.50 1,518.00 2.15 197.80 0.00 0.00

(e) Shrink-film packaging…per package 10,374 0.20 2,074.80 0.20 2,074.80 0.12 1,244.88 0.15 1,556.10
CONTRACTORS TOTALS $195,444.18 $136,638.65 $48,623.59 $61,582.40

DISCOUNT 0.00% $0.00 0.00% $0.00 1.00% $486.24 1.00% $615.82
DISCOUNTED TOTALS $195,444.18 $136,638.65 20 DAYS $48,137.35 20 DAYS $60,966.58

                              
WHITLAM LABEL
CENTER LINE , MI
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MARTIN STUART DECAL

CHICAGO, IL
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CLEVELAND, OH

                              
DOUGLAS SCREEN PRINTERS
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