
 TITLE:  "Litigation Copying (including scanning to CD-ROM/ DVD-ROM color copying)"  / PROGRAM: 2810-M
TERM: September 1, 2010 to August 31, 2011 (w/Options)

Basis Doc 1 Solutions, LLC National Legal Impact Legal Technologies
Item No. DESCRIPTION of STATE 050 CODE  28033 STATE: 050 CODE: 62554 STATE 050 CODE  44167

Award UNIT RATE COST UNIT RATE COST UNIT RATE COST
I. COMPLETE PRODUCT: (Except Items II. through V.):  

BLACK IMAGE ONLY: 216 x 279 mm (8-1/2 x 11") up to and  
including 432 x 279 mm (17 x 11"):
Running Per 100 Copies  

(a) Autofeed Materials………………………………………….per page unit 15,000 x 3.60 54,000.00 0.06 900.00 3.00 45,000.00
(b) Light Iintervention…………………………………………..per page unit 9,000 x 5.50 49,500.00 0.09 810.00 5.00 45,000.00
(c) Medium Intervention………………………………………..per page unit 4,000 x 7.90 31,600.00 0.13 520.00 8.50 34,000.00
(d) Heavy Intervention………………………………………….per page unit 5,000 x 9.90 49,500.00 0.17 850.00 10.00 50,000.00
(e) Glass Placement……………………………………………...per page unit 7,000 x 11.50 80,500.00 0.25 1,750.00 12.50 87,500.00

COLOR COPYING:  
(f) Color copying 216 x 279 mm (8-1/2 x 11")…per leaf copied one side only 500 x 49.00 24,500.00 0.85 425.00 60.00 30,000.00
(g) Color copying 216 x 279 mm (8-1/2 x 11")…per leaf copied face and back 200 x 89.00 17,800.00 1.65 330.00 100.00 20,000.00
(h) Color copying 432 x 279 mm (17 x 11")…….per leaf copied one side only 300 x 75.00 22,500.00 1.50 450.00 79.00 23,700.00
(i) Color copying 432 x 279 mm (17 x 11")…...per leaf copied face and back 100 x 110.00 11,000.00 3.00 300.00 110.00 11,000.00
(j) Black & White Transparencies (includes all materials required)……….  

……………………………………………………………per page size unit 3,000 x 36.00 108,000.00 0.75 2,250.00 40.00 120,000.00
(k) Color Transparencies (includes all materials)…………….per page size unit 2,000 x 79.00 158,000.00 1.25 2,500.00 80.00 160,000.00
(l) Die cut Tab Dividers (includes composition, die-cutting, paper, collating,  

and inserting):  
1. Leaves duplicated/copied face only (Xerox 5090 or 5390 or equal)……. 5,000 x 14.50 72,500.00 0.25 1,250.00 15.50 77,500.00
2. Leaves duplicated/copied face and back (Xerox 5090 or 5390) or equal 2,000 x 14.50 29,000.00 0.25 500.00 15.50 31,000.00
3. Custom Tabs Print Face only (body and/or tab)………………………… 3,000 x 21.50 64,500.00 0.50 1,500.00 22.50 67,500.00
4. Custom Tab Print Face and Back (body and/or tab)……………………. 1,000 x 21.50 21,500.00 0.60 600.00 22.50 22,500.00

(m) Oversized items (INCLUDES cost of paper):  
1. Black image only.  Over 432 x 279 mm (17 x 11") up to 914 x 2 732 mm  

(36 x 108")…………………………………………………per square foot 10,000 x 0.49 4,900.00 0.79 7,900.00 0.60 6,000.00
2. Color copy or equal)  Over 432 x 279 mm (17 x 11") up to 914 x 2 732 mm  

(36 x 108")…………………………………………………per square foot 10,000 x 3.90 39,000.00 8.00 80,000.00 3.75 37,500.00
(n) Blow Backs from CD or DVD  

1. Black and White………………..……………………..per page-size unit 1,500 x 0.04 60.00 0.09 135.00 0.055 82.50
2. Color……………………………………………………per page-size unit 500 x 0.49 245.00 0.85 425.00 0.60 300.00
3. Over-size Black and White………….…………………..per square foot 7 x 0.49 3.43 0.79 5.53 0.60 4.20
4. Over-size color………… …………………………. ……per square foot 2 x 3.90 7.80 8.00 16.00 3.75 7.50

II. SCANNING:  
(a) Black and white scanned to TIFF, PDF, or JPEG with minimum 300  

dpi burned to CD or DVD. Cost must include the scanning, computer  
indexing, second pass verification, creating a load file and provide a  
viewer  

1. Autofeed………………………………...………………………..per scan 15,000 x 0.03 450.00 0.07 1,050.00 0.035 525.00
2. Light intervention………………………………………………..per scan 45,000 x 0.05 2,250.00 0.10 4,500.00 0.055 2,475.00
3. Medium intervention…………………………………………….per scan 22,000 x 0.07 1,540.00 0.14 3,080.00 0.085 1,870.00
4. Heavy intervention……………………………...……………….per scan 14,000 x 0.09 1,260.00 0.18 2,520.00 0.105 1,470.00
5. Glass placement…………………………………………………..per scan 8,000 x 0.119 952.00 0.28 2,240.00 0.125 1,000.00
6. Over-sized…………………………………………………per square foot 200 x 0.49 98.00 3.00 600.00 0.40 80.00

 
(b) Color scanned to TIFF, PDF, JPEG with a minimum 300 dpi burned to  

CD or DVD. Cost must include the scanning, computer indexing  
second pass verification, creating a load file and provide a viewer  

1. Autofeed…………………………………………...…………….per scan 2,000 x 0.49 980.00 0.85 1,700.00 0.35 700.00
2. Light intervention……………………………………………….per scan 3,000 x 0.49 1,470.00 0.85 2,550.00 0.35 1,050.00
3. Medium intervention……………………………………………per scan 2,500 x 0.49 1,225.00 0.85 2,125.00 0.35 875.00
4. Heavy intervention………...……………………………………per scan 1,000 x 0.49 490.00 0.85 850.00 0.35 350.00
5. Glass placement………………………………………………….per scan 2,000 x 0.49 980.00 0.85 1,700.00 0.35 700.00
6. Over-sized…………………………………………………per square foot 100 x 3.50 350.00 10.00 1,000.00 0.50 50.00

    (c)   1.Uncorrected searchable Optical Character Recognition (OCR) scanning  
…………………………………………………….. ………………per scan 15,000 x 0.01 150.00 0.03 450.00 0.01 150.00

2. Corrected searchable Optical Character Recognition (OCR) scanning  
……………………………………   ………………………………per scan 200 x 0.01 2.00 50.00 10,000.00 0.03 6.00

III. OBJECTIVE, SUBJECTIVE, AND IN-TEXT CODING  
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(a) Biblographic objective coding, up to 30 key strokes per field….per 100 fields 5,200 x 6.25 32,500.00 50.00 260,000.00 6.00 31,200.00
(b) Cost for each additional 30 key strokes of objective coding per field  

……………………………………..…………………………per 100 fields 65 x No Charge 50.00 3,250.00 No Charge
(c) Bibliographic subjective coding, up to 30 key strokes per field..per 100 fields 680 x 6.25 4,250.00 50.00 34,000.00 6.50 4,420.00
(d) Cost of each additional 30 key strokes of subjective coding………...per field 50 x No Charge 50.00 2,500.00 No Charge
(e) In-text coding (to include, but will not be limited to names, locations, dates,  

and important numbers)………………………………………..per 100 fields 120 x 7.25 870.00 50.00 6,000.00 6.00 720.00
(f) Cost for each additional 30 key strokes of in-text coding …………..per field 16 x No Charge 50.00 800.00 No Charge
(g) Document boundaries (based on 4 pages per document 1:4 ratio)  

1. Standard (physical) document boundaries…….………...per 100 boundaries 400 x No Charge 50.00 20,000.00 No Charge
2. Logical (relational-ship) document boundaries...……….per 100 boundaries 175 x No Charge 50.00 8,750.00 No Charge

IV. PAPER:  Per 100 leaves  
(a) White Offset Book, 75 g/m² (50 lb.), White Bond, 75 g/m² (20 lb.) or White  

Plain Copier, Xerogaphic, 75-90 g/m² (20-24 lb.)…………………………. 19,000 x No Charge NO BID No Charge
(b) White Writing, 75 g/m² (20)………………………………………………. 2,000 x No Charge NO BID No Charge
(c) Colored Writing, 75 g/m² (20 lb.)………………………………………… 4,000 x No Charge NO BID No Charge
(d) White Vellum Finish Cover 175 g/m² (65 lb.)…………………………… 100 x No Charge NO BID No Charge
(e) Colored Vellum Finish Cover 175 g/m² (65 lb.)………………………… 200 x No Charge NO BID No Charge
(f) White Index, 165 - 200 g/m² (90 - 110 lb.)………………………………… 100 x No Charge NO BID No Charge
(g) Colored Index, 165 - 200 g/m² (90 - 110 lb.)………………………………. 200 x No Charge NO BID No Charge
(h) Clear Mylar or Acetate, .10 mil. Thickness……………………………….. 20 x No Charge NO BID No Charge

V. ADDITIONAL OPERATIONS:  
(a) Stitching/stapling with one or two stitches………………………..per book 4,000 x 0.49 1,960.00 No Charge 0.25 1,000.00
(b) Binding, plastic coil……………………………………………….per book 500 x 0.98 490.00 2.50 1,250.00 1.00 500.00
(c) Binding, ACCO…………………………………………………….per book 1,000 x 0.98 980.00 1.00 1,000.00 2.00 2,000.00
(d) Binding, Wire-O…………………………………………………….per book 200 x 0.98 196.00 3.50 700.00 1.00 200.00
(e) Binding, plastic comb binding……………..…………………….per book 100 x 0.98 98.00 2.50 250.00 1.25 125.00
(f) Binding, tape……………………………………………………….per book 100 x 0.98 98.00 3.50 350.00 1.00 100.00
(g) Binding, velo……………………………………………………….per book 400 x 0.98 392.00 2.50 1,000.00 1.00 400.00
(h) Folding (continuous folds)……………………...………….per 100 folds 100 x 8.50 850.00 5.00 500.00 2.50 250.00
(i) Lamination, up to and including 432 x 279 mm (17 x 11").….per sq. foot 1,000 x 1.89 1,890.00 2.00 2,000.00 2.00 2,000.00
(j) Oversized lamination (over 432 x 279 mm (17 x 11")) including up to 36"  

wide by unlimited length………………………………………per sq. foot 500 x 1.89 945.00 6.00 3,000.00 2.50 1,250.00
(k) Hand collating……………………………………………………….per leaf 10,000 x No Charge 0.05 500.00 0.01 100.00
(l) Stuffing and sealing envelopes…………………………………..per each 500 x 0.09 45.00 0.05 25.00 0.10 50.00

(m) Padding:  Pad 100 sheets per pad with backboards……………..per pad 100 x 1.00 100.00 2.00 200.00 0.75 75.00
(n) Pressure Sensitive Labels, 216 x 279 mm (8 1/2 x 11") copied one side…  

……………………………………………………………………per sheet 300 x 0.49 147.00 0.02 6.00 0.45 135.00
(o) Scoring/Perforating………………………………..running rate/100 forms 20 x 1.99 39.80 15.00 300.00 3.00 60.00
(p) Drilling (each run)…………………………………………...per 100 sheets 100 x 1.00 100.00 1.00 100.00 1.00 100.00
(q) Physical Bates Stamping, sequentially with no missing numbers……..  

……………………………………………………………………..per 100 500 x 3.90 1,950.00 5.00 2,500.00 4.00 2,000.00
(r) Physical Bates Stamping, sequentially with listed missing numbers or  

broken lots…………………………………………………………per 100 300 x 3.90 1,170.00 5.00 1,500.00 4.00 1,200.00
(s) Electronic Bates stamping………………………………………..per 100 1,000 x 1.00 1,000.00 3.00 3,000.00 1.00 1,000.00
(t) Video replication (includes all materials)……..……………per video tape 5,000 x 7.00 35,000.00 10.00 50,000.00 5.00 25,000.00
(u) Pickup and/ or delivery from/ to Cheyenne, WY……...per each round trip 2 x 40.00 80.00 250.00 500.00 80.00 160.00

CONTRACTOR TOTALS $935,964.03 $541,762.53 $953,940.20
DISCOUNT if any NET NET 2% 10 days

DISCOUNTED TOTALS $935,964.03 $541,762.53 $953,940.20

AWARDED
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