AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

11

108TH CONGRESS
2D SESSION S. 2 1 0 1

To decrease the matching funds requirement and authorize additional appro-
priations for Keweenaw National Historical Park in the State of Michi-

gan.

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES

FEBRUARY 23, 2004
Mr. LEVIN introduced the following bill; which was read twice and referred
to the Committee on Energy and Natural Resources

A BILL

To decrease the matching funds requirement and authorize
additional appropriations for Keweenaw National Histor-
ical Park in the State of Michigan.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. FUNDING FOR KEWEENAW NATIONAL HISTOR-

ICAL PARK.
(a) MATCHING FUNDS.—Section 8(b) of Public Law

102-543 (16 U.S.C. 410yy—7(b)) is amended by striking

~N~ oo o b~ WO N P

“$4” and inserting “$1”.



2

(b) AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS.—Section
10 of Public Law 102-543 (16 U.S.C. 410yy—9) is amend-
ed—
(1) 1 subsection (a)—
(A) by striking “$25,000,000” and insert-
ing “$50,000,000”; and
(B) by striking “$3,000,000” and insert-
ing “$25,000,000”; and
(2) in subsection (b), by striking “$100,000”
and inserting “$250,000".
O

*S 2101 IS



		Superintendent of Documents
	2013-07-16T13:40:21-0400
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




