ED
NT
N
(e}

H.Con.Res. 212 Agreed to July 21, 2005

One Nundred Ainth Congress
of the
Mnited Dtates of America

AT THE FIRST SESSION

Begun and held at the City of Washington on Tuesday,
the fourth day of January, two thousand and five

Concurrent Resolution

Resolved by the House of Representatives (the Senate concur-
ring), That, in the enrollment of the bill H.R. 3377, the Clerk
of the House shall make the following corrections in section 5
of the bill:

(1) In the matter amending section 157(g)(1) of title 23,
United States Code, strike “$92,054,794,521” and insert
“$92,054,794”.

(2) In the matter amending section 163(e)(1) of such title,
strike “$90,410,958,900” and insert “$90,410,958”.

(3) In the matter amending section 2009(a)(1) of the
Transportation Equity Act for the 21st Century strike
“$135,616,438,356” and insert “$135,616,438”.

(4) In the matter amending section 2009(a)(2) of such Act
strike ‘$59,178,082,192” and insert “$59,178,082”.

(5) In the matter amending section 2009(a)(3) of such Act
strike “$16,438,356,164” and insert “$16,438,356”.

(6) In the matter amending section 2009(a)(4) of such Act
strike “$32,876,712,329” and insert “$32,876,712”.

(7) In the matter amending section 2009(a)(6) of such Act
strike “$2,958,904,110” and insert “$2,958,904”.

Attest:

Clerk of the House of Representatives.

Attest:

Secretary of the Senate.



		Superintendent of Documents
	2013-05-22T11:46:10-0400
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




