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refer to the overall system that in-
cludes grievances and appeals handled 
at the MCO or PIHP level and access to 
the State fair hearing process. (Pos-
sible subjects for grievances include, 
but are not limited to, the quality of 
care or services provided, and aspects 
of interpersonal relationships such as 
rudeness of a provider or employee, or 
failure to respect the enrollee’s rights.) 

§ 438.402 General requirements. 

(a) The grievance system. Each MCO 
and PIHP must have a system in place 
for enrollees that includes a grievance 
process, an appeal process, and access 
to the State’s fair hearing system. 

(b) Filing requirements—(1) Authority 
to file. (i) An enrollee may file a griev-
ance and an MCO or PIHP level appeal, 
and may request a State fair hearing. 

(ii) A provider, acting on behalf of 
the enrollee and with the enrollee’s 
written consent, may file an appeal. A 
provider may file a grievance or re-
quest a State fair hearing on behalf of 
an enrollee, if the State permits the 
provider to act as the enrollee’s au-
thorized representative in doing so. 

(2) Timing. The State specifies a rea-
sonable timeframe that may be no less 
than 20 days and not to exceed 90 days 
from the date on the MCO’s or PIHP’s 
notice of action. Within that time-
frame— 

(i) The enrollee or the provider may 
file an appeal; and 

(ii) In a State that does not require 
exhaustion of MCO and PIHP level ap-
peals, the enrollee may request a State 
fair hearing. 

(3) Procedures. (i) The enrollee may 
file a grievance either orally or in writ-
ing and, as determined by the State, ei-
ther with the State or with the MCO or 
the PIHP. 

(ii) The enrollee or the provider may 
file an appeal either orally or in writ-
ing, and unless he or she requests expe-
dited resolution, must follow an oral 
filing with a written, signed, appeal. 

§ 438.404 Notice of action. 

(a) Language and format requirements. 
The notice must be in writing and 
must meet the language and format re-
quirements of § 438.10(c) and (d) to en-
sure ease of understanding. 

(b) Content of notice. The notice must 
explain the following: 

(1) The action the MCO or PIHP or 
its contractor has taken or intends to 
take. 

(2) The reasons for the action. 
(3) The enrollee’s or the provider’s 

right to file an MCO or PIHP appeal. 
(4) If the State does not require the 

enrollee to exhaust the MCO or PIHP 
level appeal procedures, the enrollee’s 
right to request a State fair hearing. 

(5) The procedures for exercising the 
rights specified in this paragraph. 

(6) The circumstances under which 
expedited resolution is available and 
how to request it. 

(7) The enrollee’s right to have bene-
fits continue pending resolution of the 
appeal, how to request that benefits be 
continued, and the circumstances 
under which the enrollee may be re-
quired to pay the costs of these serv-
ices. 

(c) Timing of notice. The MCO or PIHP 
must mail the notice within the fol-
lowing timeframes: 

(1) For termination, suspension, or 
reduction of previously authorized 
Medicaid-covered services, within the 
timeframes specified in §§ 431.211, 
431.213, and 431.214 of this chapter. 

(2) For denial of payment, at the 
time of any action affecting the claim. 

(3) For standard service authoriza-
tion decisions that deny or limit serv-
ices, within the timeframe specified in 
§ 438.210(d)(1). 

(4) If the MCO or PIHP extends the 
timeframe in accordance with 
§ 438.210(d)(1), it must— 

(i) Give the enrollee written notice of 
the reason for the decision to extend 
the timeframe and inform the enrollee 
of the right to file a grievance if he or 
she disagrees with that decision; and 

(ii) Issue and carry out its determina-
tion as expeditiously as the enrollee’s 
health condition requires and no later 
than the date the extension expires. 

(5) For service authorization deci-
sions not reached within the time-
frames specified in § 438.210(d) (which 
constitutes a denial and is thus an ad-
verse action), on the date that the 
timeframes expire. 

(6) For expedited service authoriza-
tion decisions, within the timeframes 
specified in § 438.210(d). 
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