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compliance with its risk-based and 
minimum capital requirements in a 
reasonable period of time more than 
any action specifically authorized 
under paragraph (a) of this section. 

(c) Procedures. Before finalizing any 
action under this section, the Director 
shall provide a Bank written notice de-
scribing the proposed action or actions 
and an opportunity to submit informa-
tion that the Bank considers relevant 
to the Director’s decision to take such 
action in accordance with § 1229.12 of 
this subpart. 

§ 1229.10 Actions applicable to criti-
cally undercapitalized Banks. 

(a) Appointment of conservator or re-
ceiver. Notwithstanding any other pro-
vision of federal or state law, the Di-
rector may appoint the FHFA as con-
servator or receiver of any Bank at any 
time after the Director determines 
that the Bank is, or the Director other-
wise exercises authority to reclassify 
the Bank as, critically undercapital-
ized. 

(b) Periodic determination—(1) Deter-
mination. Not later than 30 calendar 
days after the Director first determines 
that a Bank is, or the Director other-
wise exercises authority to reclassify 
the Bank as, critically undercapital-
ized, and a least once during each suc-
ceeding 30-day calendar period, the Di-
rector make a determination in writing 
as to whether: 

(i) The assets of the Bank are, and 
during the preceding 60 calendar days 
have been, less than its obligations to 
its creditors and others, provided that 
the Director shall consider as an obli-
gation only that amount of out-
standing consolidated obligations for 
which the Bank is primary obligor or 
for which the Bank has been ordered to 
make payments of principal or interest 
on behalf of another Bank, or is actu-
ally making payments of principal or 
interest on behalf of another Bank; or 

(ii) The Bank is not, and during the 
previous 60 calendar days has not been 
paying its debts on a regular basis as 
such debts become due, provided that 
this provision does not apply to any 
unpaid debts that are the subject of a 
bona fide dispute. 

(2) Mandatory receivership. If the Di-
rector determines that the conditions 

described in either paragraph (b)(1)(i) 
or (b)(1)(ii) of this section applies to a 
Bank, the Director shall appoint the 
FHFA as receiver for the Bank. The ap-
pointment of the FHFA as receiver 
under this paragraph shall imme-
diately terminate any conservatorship 
established for the Bank. 

(3) Determination not required. A de-
termination under paragraph (b)(1) of 
this section shall not be required dur-
ing any period in which the FHFA 
serves as receiver for a Bank. 

(c) Judicial review. If the Director ap-
points the FHFA as conservator or re-
ceiver of a Bank under paragraph (a) or 
(b)(2) of this section, the Bank may 
within 30 days of such appointment 
bring an action in the United States 
district court for the judicial district 
in which the Bank was established pur-
suant to section 3 of the Bank Act (12 
U.S.C. 1423) or in the United States 
District Court for the District of Co-
lumbia, for an order requiring the 
FHFA to remove itself as conservator 
or receiver. 

(d) Other applicable actions. Until such 
time as FHFA is appointed as conser-
vator or receiver for a critically under-
capitalized Bank, a critically under-
capitalized Bank shall be subject to all 
mandatory restrictions or obligations 
applicable to a significantly under-
capitalized Bank under § 1229.8 of this 
subpart and will remain subject to any 
on-going restrictions or obligations 
that the Director imposed on the Bank 
under § 1229.7 or § 1229.9 of this subpart, 
or any restrictions or obligations that 
are applicable to the Bank under the 
terms of an approved capital restora-
tion plan. 

[74 FR 5604, Jan. 30, 2009, as amended at 74 
FR 38513, Aug. 4, 2009] 

§ 1229.11 Capital restoration plans. 
(a) Contents. Each capital restoration 

plan submitted by a Bank shall set 
forth a plan to restore its permanent 
and total capital to levels sufficient to 
fulfill its risk-based and minimum cap-
ital requirements within a reasonable 
period of time. Such plan must be fea-
sible given general market conditions 
and the conditions of the Bank and, at 
a minimum, shall: 

(1) Describe the actions the Bank will 
take, including any changes that the 
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