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senior lien upon the taxpayer’s prop-
erty under certain circumstances al-
though legal rights to enforce the hold-
er’s interest survive the levy proce-
dure. For example, the levy may be 
wrongful against such a person if the 
property is an obligation which is col-
lected pursuant to the levy rather than 
sold and nothing thereafter remains for 
the senior lienholder, or the property 
levied upon is of such a nature that 
when it is sold at a public sale the 
property subject to the senior lien is 
not available for the senior lienholder 
as a realistic source for the enforce-
ment of the holder’s interest. Some of 
the factors which should be taken into 
account in determining whether prop-
erty remains or will remain a realistic 
source from which the senior 
lienholder may realize collection are: 
The nature of the property, the number 
of purchasers, the value of each unit 
sold or to be sold, whether, as a direct 
result of the distraint sale, the costs of 
realizing collection from the security 
have or will be so substantially in-
creased as to render the security sub-
stantially valueless as a source of col-
lection, and whether the property sub-
ject to the distraint sale constitutes 
substantially all of the property avail-
able as security for the payment of the 
indebtedness to the senior lienholder. 

(2) Surplus proceeds. If the court de-
termines that the interest or lien of 
any party to an action under 26 U.S.C. 
7426 was transferred to the proceeds of 
a sale of the property, the court may 
grant a judgment in an amount equal 
to all or any part of the amount of the 
surplus proceeds of such sale. The term 
‘‘surplus proceeds’’ means property re-
maining after application of the provi-
sions of 26 U.S.C. 6342(a). 

(3) Substituted sale proceeds. If the 
court determines that a party has an 
interest in or lien on the amount held 
as a fund pursuant to an agreement de-
scribed in 26 U.S.C. 6325(b)(3), the court 
may grant a judgment in an amount 
equal to all or any part of the amount 
of such fund. 

(26 U.S.C. 7426) 

§ 70.208 Review of jeopardy assess-
ment or jeopardy levy procedures; 
information to taxpayer. 

Not later than 5 days after the day on 
which an assessment is made under 26 
U.S.C. 6862 or when a levy is made less 
than 30 days after the notice and de-
mand described in 26 U.S.C 6331(a), the 
officer who authorized the assessment 
or levy shall provide the taxpayer a 
written statement setting forth the in-
formation upon which that official re-
lies in authorizing such assessment or 
levy. 

(26 U.S.C. 7429(a)(1)) 

§ 70.209 Review of jeopardy assess-
ment or levy procedures; adminis-
trative review. 

(a) Request for administrative review. 
Any request for the review of a jeop-
ardy assessment or levy provided for by 
26 U.S.C. 7429(a)(2) shall be filed with 
the officer who authorized the assess-
ment or levy, within 30 days after the 
statement described in § 70.208 of this 
part is given to the taxpayer. However, 
if no statement is given within the 5- 
day period described in § 70.208, any re-
quest for review of the jeopardy assess-
ment shall be filed within 35 days after 
the date the assessment is made. Such 
request shall be in writing, shall state 
fully the reasons for the request, and 
shall be supported by such evidence as 
will enable the reviewing officer to 
make the redetermination described in 
26 U.S.C. 7429(a)(3). 

(b) Administrative review. In deter-
mining whether the assessment or levy 
is reasonable and the amount assessed 
appropriate, the reviewing officer shall 
take into account not only information 
available at the time the assessment is 
made but also information which 
subsequenbtly becomes available. 

(26 U.S.C. 7429(a)(2)) 

§ 70.210 Review of jeopardy assess-
ment or levy procedures; judicial 
action. 

(a) Time for bringing judicial action. An 
action for judicial review described in 
26 U.S.C. 7429(b) may be instituted by 
the taxpayer during the period begin-
ning on the earlier of: 
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