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appraisal establishes that there is no 
comparable commercial rate because of 
the absence of commercial parking fa-
cilities within a two-mile radius of the 
medical facility, then the rate estab-
lished shall be not less than the lowest 
rate charged for parking at the VA 
medical facility with the lowest estab-
lished parking fees. Rates established 
shall be reviewed biannually by the 
Secretary to reflect any increase or de-
crease in value as determined by ap-
praisal updating. 

(2) No parking fees shall be estab-
lished or collected for parking facili-
ties used by or for vehicles of the fol-
lowing: 

(i) Volunteer workers in connection 
with such workers performing services 
for the benefit of veterans receiving 
care at the medical facility; 

(ii) A veteran or an eligible person in 
connection with such veteran or eligi-
ble person receiving examination or 
treatment; 

(iii) An individual transporting a vet-
eran or eligible person seeking exam-
ination or treatment; and 

(iv) Federal Government employees 
using Government owned or leased or 
private vehicles for official business. 

(Authority: 38 U.S.C. 8109) 

[53 FR 25490, July 7, 1988] 

RELEASE OF INFORMATION FROM DE-
PARTMENT OF VETERANS AFFAIRS (VA) 
RECORDS RELATING TO DRUG ABUSE, 
ALCOHOLISM OR ALCOHOL ABUSE, IN-
FECTION WITH THE HUMAN IMMUNO-
DEFICIENCY VIRUS (HIV), OR SICKLE 
CELL ANEMIA 

NOTE: Sections 1.460 through 1.499 of this 
part concern the confidentiality of informa-
tion relating to drug abuse, alcoholism or al-
cohol abuse, infection with the human im-
munodeficiency virus, or sickle cell anemia 
in VA records and are applicable in combina-
tion with other regulations pertaining to the 
release of information from VA records. Sec-
tions 1.500 through 1.527, Title 38, Code of 
Federal Regulations, implement the provi-
sions of 38 U.S.C. §§ 5701 and 5702. Sections 
1.550 through 1.559 implement the provisions 
of 5 U.S.C. § 552 (The Freedom of Information 
Act). Sections 1.575 through 1.584 implement 
the provisions of 5 U.S.C. § 552a (The Privacy 
Act of 1974). 

The provisions of §§ 1.460 through 1.499 of 
this part pertain to any program or activity, 
including education, treatment, rehabilita-

tion or research, which relates to drug abuse, 
alcoholism or alcohol abuse, infection with 
the human immunodeficiency virus, or sick-
le cell anemia. The statutory authority for 
the drug abuse provisions and alcoholism or 
alcohol abuse provisions of §§ 1.460 through 
1.499 is Sec. 111 of Pub. L. 94–581, the Vet-
erans Omnibus Health Care Act of 1976 (38 
U.S.C. §§ 7331 through 7334), the authority for 
the human immunodeficiency virus provi-
sions is Sec. 121 of Pub. L. 100–322, the Vet-
erans’ Benefits and Services Act of 1988 (38 
U.S.C. § 7332); the authority for the sickle 
cell anemia provisions is Sec. 109 of Pub. L. 
93–82, the Veterans Health Care Expansion 
Act of 1973 (38 U.S.C. §§ 1751–1754). 

AUTHORITY: 38 U.S.C. 1751–1754 and 7331– 
7334. 

SOURCE: 60 FR 63929, Dec. 13, 1995, unless 
otherwise noted. 

§ 1.460 Definitions. 

For purposes of §§ 1.460 through 1.499 
of this part, the following definitions 
apply: 

Agreement. The term ‘‘agreement’’ 
means a document that a VA health 
care facility develops in collaboration 
with an Organ Procurement Organiza-
tion, eye bank or tissue bank with 
written, detailed responsibilities and 
obligations of the parties with regard 
to identifying potential donors and fa-
cilitating the donation process. 

Alcohol abuse. The term ‘‘alcohol 
abuse’’ means the use of an alcoholic 
beverage which impairs the physical, 
mental, emotional, or social well-being 
of the user. 

Contractor. The term ‘‘contractor’’ 
means a person who provides services 
to VA such as data processing, dosage 
preparation, laboratory analyses or 
medical or other professional services. 
Each contractor shall be required to 
enter into a written agreement sub-
jecting such contractor to the provi-
sions of §§ 1.460 through 1.499 of this 
part; 38 U.S.C. 5701 and 7332; and 5 
U.S.C. 552a and 38 CFR 1.576(g). 

Deceased. The term ‘‘deceased’’ 
means death established by either neu-
rological criteria (brain death) or 
cardiopulmonary criteria (cardiac 
death). Brain death is the irreversible 
cessation of all brain function. Cardiac 
death is the irreversible cessation of 
circulatory and respiratory function. 
In both cases, ‘‘irreversible’’ means 
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that function will not resume sponta-
neously and will not be restarted artifi-
cially. 

Diagnosis. The term ‘‘diagnosis’’ 
means any reference to an individual’s 
alcohol or drug abuse or to a condition 
which is identified as having been 
caused by that abuse or any reference 
to sickle cell anemia or infection with 
the human immunodeficiency virus 
which is made for the purpose of treat-
ment or referral for treatment. A diag-
nosis prepared for the purpose of treat-
ment or referral for treatment but 
which is not so used is covered by 
§§ 1.460 through 1.499 of this part. These 
regulations do not apply to a diagnosis 
of drug overdose or alcohol intoxica-
tion which clearly shows that the indi-
vidual involved is not an alcohol or 
drug abuser (e.g., involuntary ingestion 
of alcohol or drugs or reaction to a pre-
scribed dosage of one or more drugs). 

Disclose or disclosure. The term ‘‘dis-
close’’ or ‘‘disclosure’’ means a commu-
nication of patient identifying infor-
mation, the affirmative verification of 
another person’s communication of pa-
tient identifying information, or the 
communication of any information 
from the record of a patient who has 
been identified. 

Drug abuse. The term ‘‘drug abuse’’ 
means the use of a psychoactive sub-
stance for other than medicinal pur-
poses which impairs the physical, men-
tal, emotional, or social well-being of 
the user. 

Eye bank and tissue bank. The term 
‘‘eye bank and tissue bank’’ means an 
‘‘establishment’’ as defined in 21 CFR 
1271.3, pursuant to section 361 of the 
Public Health Service Act (42 U.S.C. 
264) that has a valid, current registra-
tion with the Federal Food and Drug 
Administration (FDA) as required 
under 21 CFR part 1271. 

Individual. The term ‘‘individual’’ 
means a veteran, as defined in 38 U.S.C. 
101(2), or a dependent of a veteran, as 
defined in 38 U.S.C. 101(3) and (4)(A). 

Infection with the human immuno-
deficiency virus (HIV). The term ‘‘infec-
tion with the human immunodeficiency 
virus (HIV)’’ means the presence of lab-
oratory evidence for human immuno-
deficiency virus infection. For the pur-
poses of §§ 1.460 through 1.499 of this 
part, the term includes the testing of 

an individual for the presence of the 
virus or antibodies to the virus and in-
formation related to such testing (in-
cluding tests with negative results). 

Informant. The term ‘‘informant’’ 
means an individual who is a patient or 
employee or who becomes a patient or 
employee at the request of a law en-
forcement agency or official and who 
at the request of a law enforcement 
agency or official observes one or more 
patients or employees for the purpose 
of reporting the information obtained 
to the law enforcement agency or offi-
cial. 

Near death. The term ‘‘near death’’ 
means that in the clinical judgment of 
the patient’s health care provider 
based on defined clinical triggers, the 
patient’s death is imminent. 

Organ Procurement Organization. The 
term ‘‘Organ Procurement Organiza-
tion’’ (OPO) means an organization 
that performs or coordinates the pro-
curement, preservation, and transpor-
tation of organs and maintains a sys-
tem of locating prospective recipients 
for available organs. 

Patient. The term ‘‘patient’’ means 
any individual or subject who has ap-
plied for or been given a diagnosis or 
treatment for drug abuse, alcoholism 
or alcohol abuse, infection with the 
human immunodeficiency virus, or 
sickle cell anemia and includes any in-
dividual who, after arrest on a criminal 
charge, is interviewed and/or tested in 
connection with drug abuse, alcoholism 
or alcohol abuse, infection with the 
human immunodeficiency virus, or 
sickle cell anemia in order to deter-
mine that individual’s eligibility to 
participate in a treatment or rehabili-
tation program. The term patient in-
cludes an individual who has been diag-
nosed or treated for alcoholism, drug 
abuse, HIV infection, or sickle cell ane-
mia for purposes of participation in a 
VA program or activity relating to 
those four conditions, including a pro-
gram or activity consisting of treat-
ment, rehabilitation, education, train-
ing, evaluation, or research. The term 
‘‘patient’’ for the purpose of infection 
with the human immunodeficiency 
virus or sickle cell anemia, includes 
one tested for the disease. 
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Patient identifying information. The 
term ‘‘patient identifying informa-
tion’’ means the name, address, social 
security number, fingerprints, photo-
graph, or similar information by which 
the identity of a patient can be deter-
mined with reasonable accuracy and 
speed either directly or by reference to 
other publicly available information. 
The term does not include a number as-
signed to a patient by a treatment pro-
gram, if that number does not consist 
of, or contain numbers (such as social 
security, or driver’s license number) 
which could be used to identify a pa-
tient with reasonable accuracy and 
speed from sources external to the 
treatment program. 

Person. The term ‘‘person’’ means an 
individual, partnership, corporation, 
Federal, State or local government 
agency, or any other legal entity. 

Procurement organization. The term 
‘‘procurement organization’’ means an 
organ procurement organization, eye 
bank, and/or tissue bank as defined in 
this section. 

Records. The term ‘‘records’’ means 
any information received, obtained or 
maintained, whether recorded or not, 
by an employee or contractor of VA, 
for the purpose of seeking or per-
forming VA program or activity func-
tions relating to drug abuse, alco-
holism, tests for or infection with the 
human immunodeficiency virus, or 
sickle cell anemia regarding an identi-
fiable patient. A program or activity 
function relating to drug abuse, alco-
holism, infection with the human im-
munodeficiency virus, or sickle cell 
anemia includes evaluation, treatment, 
education, training, rehabilitation, re-
search, or referral for one of these con-
ditions. Sections 1.460 through 1.499 of 
this part apply to a primary or other 
diagnosis, or other information which 
identifies, or could reasonably be ex-
pected to identify, a patient as having 
a drug or alcohol abuse condition, in-
fection with the human immuno-
deficiency virus, or sickle cell anemia 
(e.g., alcoholic psychosis, drug depend-
ence), but only if such diagnosis or in-
formation is received, obtained or 
maintained for the purpose of seeking 
or performing one of the above pro-
gram or activity functions. Sections 
1.460 through 1.499 of this part do not 

apply if such diagnosis or other infor-
mation is not received, obtained or 
maintained for the purpose of seeking 
or performing a function or activity re-
lating to drug abuse, alcoholism, infec-
tion with the human immunodeficiency 
virus, or sickle cell anemia for the pa-
tient in question. Whenever such diag-
nosis or other information, not origi-
nally received or obtained for the pur-
pose of obtaining or providing one of 
the above program or activity func-
tions, is subsequently used in connec-
tion with such program or activity 
functions, those original entries be-
come a ‘‘record’’ and §§ 1.460 through 
1.499 of this part thereafter apply to 
those entries. Segregability: these reg-
ulations do not apply to records or in-
formation contained therein, the dis-
closure of which (the circumstances 
surrounding the disclosure having been 
considered) could not reasonably be ex-
pected to disclose the fact that a pa-
tient has been connected with a VA 
program or activity function relating 
to drug abuse, alcoholism, infection 
with the human immunodeficiency 
virus, or sickle cell anemia. 

(1) The following are examples of in-
stances whereby records or information 
related to alcoholism or drug abuse are 
covered by the provisions of §§ 1.460 
through 1.499 of this part: 

(i) A patient with alcoholic delirium 
tremens is admitted for detoxification. 
The patient is offered treatment in a 
VA alcohol rehabilitation program 
which he declines. 

(ii) A patient who is diagnosed as a 
drug abuser applies for and is provided 
VA drug rehabilitation treatment. 

(iii) While undergoing treatment for 
an unrelated medical condition, a pa-
tient discusses with the physician his 
use and abuse of alcohol. The physician 
offers VA alcohol rehabilitation treat-
ment which is declined by the patient. 

(2) The following are examples of in-
stances whereby records or information 
related to alcoholism or drug abuse are 
not covered by the provisions of §§ 1.460 
through 1.499 of this part: 

(i) A patient with alcoholic delirium 
tremens is admitted for detoxification, 
treated and released with no coun-
seling or treatment for the underlying 
condition of alcoholism. 
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(ii) While undergoing treatment for 
an unrelated medical condition, a pa-
tient informs the physician of a history 
of drug abuse fifteen years earlier with 
no ingestion of drugs since. The history 
and diagnosis of drug abuse is docu-
mented in the hospital summary and 
no treatment is sought by the patient 
or offered or provided by VA during the 
current period of treatment. 

(iii) While undergoing treatment for 
injuries sustained in an accident, a pa-
tient’s medical record is documented 
to support the judgment of the physi-
cian to prescribe certain alternate 
medications in order to avoid possible 
drug interactions in view of the pa-
tient’s enrollment and treatment in a 
non-VA methadone maintenance pro-
gram. The patient states that contin-
ued treatment and follow-up will be ob-
tained from private physicians and VA 
treatment for the drug abuse is not 
sought by the patient nor provided or 
offered by the staff. 

(iv) A patient is admitted to the 
emergency room suffering from a pos-
sible drug overdose. The patient is 
treated and released; a history and di-
agnosis of drug abuse may be docu-
mented in the hospital summary. The 
patient is not offered treatment for the 
underlying conditions of drug abuse, 
nor is treatment sought by the patient 
for that condition. 

Third party payer. The term ‘‘third 
party payer’’ means a person who pays, 
or agrees to pay, for diagnosis or treat-
ment furnished to a patient on the 
basis of a contractual relationship with 
the patient or a member of his or her 
family or on the basis of the patient’s 
eligibility for Federal, State, or local 
governmental benefits. 

Treatment. The term ‘‘treatment’’ 
means the management and care of a 
patient for drug abuse, alcoholism or 
alcohol abuse, infection with the 
human immunodeficiency virus, or 
sickle cell anemia, or a condition 
which is identified as having been 
caused by one or more of these condi-
tions, in order to reduce or eliminate 
the adverse effects upon the patient. 
The term includes testing for the 
human immunodeficiency virus or 
sickle cell anemia. 

Undercover agent. The term ‘‘under-
cover agent’’ means an officer of any 

Federal, State, or local law enforce-
ment agency who becomes a patient or 
employee for the purpose of inves-
tigating a suspected violation of law or 
who pursues that purpose after becom-
ing a patient or becoming employed for 
other purposes. 

VHA health care facilty. The term 
‘‘VHA health care facility’’ means a 
VA medical center, VA emergency 
room, VA nursing home or other facil-
ity as defined in 38 U.S.C. 1701(3). 

(Authority: 38 U.S.C. 7334) 

[60 FR 63929, Dec. 13, 1995, as amended at 72 
FR 48241, Aug. 23, 2007; 73 FR 65260, Nov. 3, 
2008] 

§ 1.461 Applicability. 
(a) General—(1) Restrictions on disclo-

sure. The restrictions on disclosure in 
these regulations apply to any infor-
mation whether or not recorded, which: 

(i) Would identify a patient as an al-
cohol or drug abuser, an individual 
tested for or infected with the human 
immunodeficiency virus (HIV), here-
after referred to as HIV, or an indi-
vidual with sickle cell anemia, either 
directly, by reference to other publicly 
available information, or through 
verification of such an identification 
by another person; and 

(ii) Is provided or obtained for the 
purpose of treating alcohol or drug 
abuse, infection with the HIV, or sickle 
cell anemia, making a diagnosis for 
that treatment, or making a referral 
for that treatment as well as for edu-
cation, training, evaluation, rehabili-
tation and research program or activ-
ity purposes. 

(2) Restriction on use. The restriction 
on use of information to initiate or 
substantiate any criminal charges 
against a patient or to conduct any 
criminal investigation of a patient ap-
plies to any information, whether or 
not recorded, which is maintained for 
the purpose of treating drug abuse, al-
coholism or alcohol abuse, infection 
with the HIV, or sickle cell anemia, 
making a diagnosis for that treatment, 
or making a referral for that treatment 
as well as for education, training, eval-
uation, rehabilitation, and research 
program or activity purposes. 

(b) Period covered as affecting applica-
bility. The provisions of §§ 1.460 through 
1.499 of this part apply to records of 
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