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§ 35.44 Delivery to legal representa-
tive; to other claimants if value is 
$1,000 or less. 

The money and effects of the de-
ceased patient shall in all cases be de-
livered to the legal representative, if 
any, of his estate. If the value is $1,000 
or less, and the officer in charge has 
neither notice nor other knowledge of 
the appointment or qualification of a 
legal representative, nor reason to be-
lieve that a legal representative will be 
appointed or qualified, he shall deliver 
all the money and effects, as soon as 
practicable after the expiration of 10 
days from the sending of notices to one 
of the following in the indicated order 
of priority: 

(a) A person, if any, designated in 
writing by the patient to receive the 
same. 

(b) The patient’s surviving spouse. 
(c) The patient’s child or children in 

equal parts. 
(d) The patient’s parent or parents in 

equal parts. 
(e) Any other person who would be 

entitled to receive the money and ef-
fects under the law of the patient’s 
domicile: Provided, That delivery of 
such money and effects may be made 
immediately upon application by one 
of the persons specified above if the of-
ficer in charge has neither notice nor 
other knowledge that a person higher 
in the indicated order of priority ex-
ists. 

§ 35.45 Disposition of effects; excep-
tions. 

Irrespective of the provisions of this 
subpart, the officer in charge may (a) 
release from among the effects of the 
deceased patient so much of the pa-
tient’s clothing as may be necessary 
for use in preparation of his body for 
burial and (b) cause to be destroyed, or 
otherwise disposed of, such used toilet 
articles of the patient as appear to 
have no commercial or other value. 

§ 35.46 Conflicting claims. 
In any case in which conflicting 

claims are filed or the officer in charge 
considers it to be in the interest of per-
sons who may be ultimately entitled 
thereto, delivery may be withheld from 
all persons other than a duly qualified 
legal representative. 

§ 35.47 Disposition of Government 
checks. 

Notwithstanding any other provi-
sions of this subpart, immediately 
upon completion of the inventory, 
checks drawn on the Treasurer of the 
United States shall be sent by safe 
means to the department, agency, or 
establishment of the Government of 
the United States issuing such checks. 
The transmittal shall be accompanied 
by a statement of the reasons therefor 
and of all available information which 
may aid the issuing unit in the disposi-
tion of the check transmitted. Notice 
of the disposition of any checks, with 
identifying information, shall be given 
to the person or persons, if any, to 
which money and effects are delivered 
in accordance with § 35.44. 

§ 35.48 Deposit of unclaimed money; 
sale of unclaimed effects and de-
posit of proceeds. 

If, within 120 days after sending of 
notices no claim has been filed pursu-
ant to the provisions of § 35.43, the pa-
tient’s money, consisting of all types of 
United States currency and coin, shall 
be deposited in the Treasury to the 
credit of the trust-fund account enti-
tled ‘‘Money and Effects of Deceased 
Patients, Public Health Service.’’ If, 
within six months after the death of a 
patient, no claim has been filed pursu-
ant to the provisions of § 35.43, his ef-
fects (including foreign currency and 
coin but excluding Postal Savings Cer-
tificates and other evidences of indebt-
edness of the United States) shall be 
sold at public auction or by sealed bids 
to the highest bidder and the proceeds 
deposited to the credit of the trust- 
fund account entitled ‘‘Money and Ef-
fects of Deceased Patients, Public 
Health Service.’’ Postal Savings Cer-
tificates and other evidences of indebt-
edness of the United States shall be 
transmitted to the issuing department 
or agency with a statement of the oc-
casion therefor. 

§ 35.49 Sale of unclaimed effects; pro-
cedures. 

The following provisions shall govern 
the sale of effects: 

(a) Notice. Reasonable advance notice 
of proposed sales shall be posted at 
such prominent places in the station or 
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