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such office and on the persons con-
nected therewith. 

[48 FR 49210, Oct. 25, 1983] 

CLASSIFICATION REQUESTS 

§ 27.12 Classification request for each 
lot of cotton. 

For each lot or mark of cotton of 
which the applicant desires separate 
classification and certification, the ap-
plicant shall make a separate written 
request in a form prescribed or supplied 
by the Cotton Division for that pur-
pose. 

[48 FR 49210, Oct. 25, 1983] 

§ 27.13 Micronaire determination re-
quest incidental to classification re-
quest. 

The classification request may in-
clude a request for Micronaire deter-
mination. 

§ 27.14 Filing of classification and 
Micronaire determination requests. 

Requests for classification shall be 
filed with the Marketing Services Of-
fice serving the location at which the 
cotton is stored. Requests for classi-
fication shall be filed within 30 days 
after sampling and before classification 
of the samples. The applicant may file 
a request for a review of classification 
as part of the request for classification. 
The applicant may file a request for 
Micronaire determination as part of 
the request for classification or may 
file a request for such determination, 
in a form prescribed by the Cottom Di-
vision within 7 business days following 
the date of the first certification of the 
cotton involved, provided this service 
has not been previously performed on 
such cotton, and the request is made 
prior to delivery of the cotton on a 
basis grade contract. Requests for 
Micronaire determinations may also be 
filed as provided in §§ 27.62 and 27.63. 

[48 FR 49210, Oct. 25, 1983] 

§ 27.15 Withdrawal or rejection of clas-
sification or Micronaire determina-
tion requests. 

Any request for classification or for 
Micronaire determination may be 
withdrawn by the applicant at any 
time before the classification or 

Micronaire determination of the cotton 
covered thereby, subject to the pay-
ment of such fees, if any, as may be 
prescribed under §§ 27.80 to 27.92. Any 
request for classification or for 
Micronaire determination may be re-
jected for noncompliance with the act 
or this subpart. 

INSPECTION AND SAMPLES 

§ 27.16 Inspection; weighing; samples; 
supervision. 

The inspection, weighing, and sam-
pling of cotton for which classification 
is desired and the preparation and de-
livery of samples to the Marketing 
Services Office shall be (a) under the 
supervision of a supervisor of cotton 
inspection, or (b) by or under the direc-
tion of an exchange inspection agency 
and subject to the supervision of a su-
pervisor of cotton inspection. 

[48 FR 49210, Oct. 25, 1983] 

§ 27.18 Persons not to be employed for 
inspection or sampling. 

No person shall, after notice to the 
interested parties, be employed in any 
way in connection with any phase of 
the inspection and sampling of cotton 
or the preparation of the samples 
thereof, for the purposes of classifica-
tion under this subpart, who for good 
cause is disapproved by the Director. 

§ 27.20 Drawing and handling of sam-
ples of cotton; inspection of bales. 

One sample shall be drawn from the 
top side of each bale and one from the 
bottom side. Each such sample shall 
weigh not less than 5 ounces, the two 
samples from each bale to weigh to-
gether not less than 10 ounces. The 
bale shall be inspected and any condi-
tion not fully indicated by the samples 
shall be explained by the supervisor of 
cotton inspection or exchange inspec-
tion agency in a written memorandum, 
which shall acompany the samples to 
the Marketing Services Office. Samples 
shall not be dressed or trimmed and 
shall be carefully handled in such man-
ner as not to cause loss of leaf, sand, or 
other material, or otherwise change 
their representative character. Any 
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