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(c) Federal agencies acquiring prop-
erty, by foreclosure or otherwise, that 
contains BCAP contract acreage can-
not be a party to the contract by suc-
cession. However, through an adden-
dum to the contract, if the current op-
erator of the property is one of the con-
tract participants, the contract may 
remain in effect and, as permitted by 
CCC, such operator may continue to re-
ceive payments under such contract if 
CCC determines that such allowance is 
in the public interest and: 

(1) The property is maintained in ac-
cordance with the terms of the con-
tract; 

(2) Such operator continues to be the 
operator of the property; and 

(3) Ownership of the property re-
mains with such Federal agency. 
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§ 1455.1 Purpose and administration. 
(a) The purpose of this part is to 

specify requirements and definitions 
for the Voluntary Public Access and 
Habitat Incentive Program (VPA–HIP). 

(b) VPA–HIP provides, within funding 
limits, grants to State and tribal gov-
ernments to encourage owners and op-
erators of privately-held farm, ranch, 
and forest land to voluntarily make 
that land available for access by the 
public for wildlife-dependent recre-
ation, including hunting and fishing 
under programs administered by State 
and tribal governments. VPA–HIP is 
not an entitlement program and no 
grant will be made unless the applica-
tion is acceptable to the Commodity 
Credit Corporation (CCC). CCC may re-

ject a application for any reason 
deemed sufficient by CCC. 

(c) The regulations in this part are 
administered under the general super-
vision and direction of the Executive 
Vice President, CCC, or a designee, or 
the Deputy Administrator, Farm Pro-
grams (Deputy Administrator), Farm 
Service Agency (FSA). 

§ 1455.2 Definitions. 
(a) The definitions in part 718 of this 

chapter apply to this part and all docu-
ments issued in accordance with this 
part, except as otherwise provided in 
this section. 

(b) The following definitions apply to 
this part: 

Appropriate wildlife habitat means 
habitat that is suitable or proper, as 
determined by the applicable State or 
tribal government, to support fish and 
wildlife populations in the area. 

Farm land means the land that meets 
definition of ‘‘farmland’’ in § 718.2 of this 
title. 

Forest land means land at least 120 
feet wide and 1 acre in size with at 
least 10 percent cover (or equivalent 
stocking) by live trees of any size, in-
cluding land that formerly had such 
tree cover and that will be naturally or 
artificially regenerated. Forest land in-
cludes transition zones, such as areas 
between forest and nonforest lands 
that have at least 10 percent cover (or 
equivalent stocking) with live trees 
and forest areas adjacent to urban and 
built-up lands. Roadside, streamside, 
and shelterbelt strips of trees must 
have a crown width of at least 120 feet 
and continuous length of at least 363 
feet to qualify as forest land. Unim-
proved roads and trails, streams, and 
clearings in forest areas are classified 
as forest if they are less than 120 feet 
wide or an acre in size. Tree-covered 
areas in agricultural production set-
tings, such as fruit orchards, or tree- 
covered areas in urban settings, such 
as city parks, are not considered forest 
land. 

Privately-held land means farm, 
ranch, or forest land that is owned or 
operated by an individual or entity 
that is not an entity of any govern-
ment unit or Tribe. 

Ranch land means land that meets 
the definition of ‘‘farmland.’’ 
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