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Subpart D—Fees 
§ 1601.30 Fees to be charged—general. 

(a) Policy. Generally, the fees charged 
for requests for records pursuant to 5 
U.S.C. 552 shall cover the full allowable 
direct costs of searching for, reproduc-
ing, and reviewing records that are re-
sponsive to a request for information. 
Fees shall be assessed according to the 
schedule contained in paragraph (b) of 
this section and the category of re-
questers described in § 1601.31 for serv-
ices rendered by the CSB staff in re-
sponding to, and processing requests 
for, records under this part. Fees as-
sessed will be paid by check or money 
order payable to the United States 
Treasury. 

(b) Types of charges. The types of 
charges that may be assessed in con-
nection with the production of records 
in response to a FOIA request are as 
follows: 

(1) Searches. 
(i) Manual searches for records. For 

each quarter hour spent in searching 
for and/or reviewing a requested record, 
the fees will be: $4.00 for clerical per-
sonnel; $8.00 for professional personnel; 
and $11.00 for managerial personnel. 

(ii) Computer searches for records. Re-
questers will be charged at the actual 
direct costs of conducting a search 
using existing programming. These di-
rect costs will include the cost of oper-
ating the central processing unit for 
that portion of operating time that is 
directly attributable to searching for 
records and the operator/programmer 
salary, i.e., basic pay plus 16 percent, 
apportionable to the search. A charge 
shall also be made for any substantial 
amounts of special supplies or mate-
rials used to contain, present, or make 
available the output of computers, 
based upon the prevailing levels of 
costs to the CSB for the type and 
amount of such supplies or materials 
that are used. Nothing in this para-
graph shall be construed to entitle any 
person or entity, as of right, to any 
services in connection with computer-
ized records, other than services to 
which such person or entity may be en-
titled under the provisions of this sec-
tion or § 1601.32. The CSB will not alter 
or develop programming to conduct a 
search. 

(iii) Unproductive searches. The CSB 
will charge search fees even if no 
records are found which are responsive 
to the request or if the records found 
are exempt from disclosure. 

(2) Duplication. Records will be repro-
duced at a rate of $0.25 per page. For 
copies prepared by computer, such as 
tapes or printouts, the requester shall 
be charged the actual cost, including 
operator time, of production of the 
tape or printout. For other methods of 
reproduction, the actual direct costs of 
reproducing the record(s) shall be 
charged. 

(3) Review. Only commercial-use re-
questers may be charged for time spent 
reviewing records to determine wheth-
er they are exempt from mandatory 
disclosure. Charges may be assessed 
only for initial review, i.e., the review 
undertaken the first time the CSB ana-
lyzes the applicability of a specific ex-
emption to a particular record or por-
tion of a record. Records or portions of 
records withheld in full under an ex-
emption that is subsequently deter-
mined not to apply may be reviewed 
again to determine the applicability of 
other exemptions not previously con-
sidered. The costs for such a subse-
quent review are properly assessable. 

(4) Other services and materials. Where 
the CSB elects, as a matter of adminis-
trative discretion, to comply with a re-
quest for a special service or materials, 
such as certifying that records are true 
copies or sending records by special 
methods, the actual direct costs of pro-
viding the service or materials will be 
charged. 

§ 1601.31 Fees to be charged—cat-
egories of requesters. 

(a) Fees for various requester categories. 
Paragraphs (b) through (e) of this sec-
tion state, for each category of re-
quester, the types of fees generally 
charged by the CSB. However, for each 
of these categories, the fees may be 
limited, waived or reduced in accord-
ance with the provisions set forth in 
§ 1601.32(c). If the CSB has reasonable 
cause to doubt the purpose specified in 
the request for which a requester will 
use the records sought, or where the 
purpose is not clear from the request 
itself, the CSB will seek clarification 
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before assigning the request a specific 
category. 

(b) Commercial use requester. The CSB 
shall charge fees for records requested 
by persons or entities making a com-
mercial use request in an amount that 
equals the full direct costs for search-
ing for, reviewing for release, and re-
producing the records sought. Commer-
cial use requesters are not entitled to 2 
hours of free search time nor 100 free 
pages of reproduction of records. In ac-
cordance with § 1601.30, commercial use 
requesters may be charged the costs of 
searching for and reviewing records 
even if there is ultimately no disclo-
sure of records. 

(c) Educational and noncommercial sci-
entific institutions. The CSB shall 
charge fees for records requested by, or 
on behalf of, educational institutions 
and noncommercial scientific institu-
tions in an amount which equals the 
cost of reproducing the records respon-
sive to the request, excluding the cost 
of reproducing the first 100 pages. No 
search fee shall be charged with respect 
to requests by educational and non-
commercial scientific institutions. For 
a request to be included in this cat-
egory, requesters must show that the 
request being made is authorized by 
and under the auspices of a qualifying 
institution, and that the records are 
not sought for commercial use but are 
sought in furtherance of scholarly re-
search (if the request is from an edu-
cational institution) or scientific re-
search (if the request is from a non-
commercial scientific institution). 

(d) News media. The CSB shall charge 
fees for records requested by represent-
atives of the news media in an amount 
which equals the cost of reproducing 
the records responsive to the request, 
excluding the costs of reproducing the 
first 100 pages. No search fee shall be 
charged with respect to requests by 
representatives of the news media. For 
a request to be included in this cat-
egory, the requester must qualify as a 
representative of the news media and 
the request must not be made for a 
commercial use. A request for records 
supporting the news dissemination 
function of the requester shall not be 
considered to be a request that is for 
commercial use. 

(e) All other requesters. The CSB shall 
charge fees for records requested by 
persons or entities that are not classi-
fied in any of the categories listed in 
paragraphs (b), (c), or (d) of this section 
in an amount that equals the full rea-
sonable direct cost of searching for and 
reproducing records that are responsive 
to the request, excluding the first 2 
hours of search time and the cost of re-
producing the first 100 pages of records. 
In accordance with § 1601.30, requesters 
in this category may be charged the 
cost of searching for records even if 
there is ultimately no disclosure of 
records, excluding the first 2 hours of 
search time. 

(f) For purposes of the exceptions 
contained in this section on assessment 
of fees, the word pages refers to paper 
copies of 81⁄2 × 11 inches or 11 × 14 
inches. Thus, requesters are not enti-
tled to 100 microfiche or 100 computer 
disks, for example. A microfiche con-
taining the equivalent of 100 pages or a 
computer disk containing the equiva-
lent of 100 pages of computer printout 
meets the terms of the exception. 

(g) For purposes of paragraph (e) of 
this section, the term search time has as 
its basis, manual search. To apply this 
term to searches made by computer, 
the CSB will determine the hourly cost 
of operating the central processing 
unit and the operator’s hourly salary 
plus 16 percent. When the cost of the 
search (including the operator time 
and the cost of operating the computer 
to process a request) equals the equiva-
lent dollar amount of 2 hours of the 
salary plus 16 percent of the person 
performing the search, i.e., the oper-
ator, the CSB will begin assessing 
charges for the computer. 

§ 1601.32 Limitations on charging fees. 
(a) In general. Except for requesters 

seeking records for a commercial use 
as described in § 1601.31(b), the CSB will 
provide, without charge, the first 100 
pages of duplication and the first 2 
hours of search time, or their cost 
equivalent. 

(b) No fee charged. The CSB will not 
charge fees to any requester, including 
commercial use requesters, if the cost 
of collecting a fee would be equal to or 
greater than the fee itself. The ele-
ments to be considered in determining 
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