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and differentials otherwise due the em-
ployee. 

(d) The requirement for ‘‘correction 
of the personnel action’’ is met when 
an appropriate authority, consistent 
with law, Executive order, rule, regula-
tion, or mandatory personnel policy es-
tablished by an agency or through a 
collective bargaining agreement, after 
a review, corrects or directs the correc-
tion of an unjustified or unwarranted 
personnel action that resulted in the 
withdrawal, reduction, or denial of all 
or part of the pay, allowances, and dif-
ferentials otherwise due the employee. 

(e)(1) The pay, allowances, and dif-
ferentials paid as back pay under this 
subpart (including payments made 
under any grievance or arbitration de-
cision or any settlement agreement) 
may not exceed that authorized by any 
applicable law, rule, regulation, or col-
lective bargaining agreement, includ-
ing any applicable statute of limita-
tions. 

(2) An agency may not authorize pay, 
allowances, and differentials under this 
subpart in any case for a period begin-
ning more than 6 years before the date 
of the filing of a timely appeal, or, ab-
sent such filing, the date of the admin-
istrative determination that the em-
ployee is entitled to back pay, con-
sistent with 31 U.S.C. 3702(b). (See also 
§ 178.104 of this chapter.) 

(3) For back pay claims dealing with 
payments under the Fair Labor Stand-
ards Act of 1938, as amended (29 U.S.C. 
207, et seq.), an agency must apply the 
2-year statute of limitations (3 years 
for willful violations) in 29 U.S.C. 255a. 
(See also § 551.702 of this chapter.) 

[46 FR 58275, Dec. 1, 1981, as amended at 64 
FR 72458, Dec. 28, 1999] 

§ 550.805 Back pay computations. 
(a) When an appropriate authority 

corrects or directs the correction of an 
unjustified or unwarranted personnel 
action that resulted in the withdrawal, 
reduction, or denial of all or part of the 
pay, allowances, and differentials oth-
erwise due an employee— 

(1) The employee shall be deemed to 
have performed service for the agency 
during the period covered by the cor-
rective action; and 

(2) The agency shall compute for the 
period covered by the corrective action 

the pay, allowances, and differentials 
the employee would have received if 
the unjustified or unwarranted per-
sonnel action had not occurred. 

(b) No employee shall be granted 
more pay, allowances, and differentials 
under section 5596 of title 5, United 
States Code, and this subpart than he 
or she would have been entitled to re-
ceive if the unjustified or unwarranted 
personnel action had not occurred. 

(c) Except as provided in paragraph 
(d) of this section, in computing the 
amount of back pay under section 5596 
of title 5, United States Code, and this 
subpart, an agency may not include— 

(1) Any period during which an em-
ployee was not ready, willing, and able 
to perform his or her duties because of 
an incapacitating illness or injury; or 

(2) Any period during which an em-
ployee was unavailable for the per-
formance of his or her duties for rea-
sons other than those related to, or 
caused by, the unjustified or unwar-
ranted personnel action. 

(d) In computing the amount of back 
pay under section 5596 of title 5, United 
States Code, and this subpart, an agen-
cy shall grant, upon request of an em-
ployee, any sick or annual leave avail-
able to the employee for a period of in-
capacitation if the employee can estab-
lish that the period of incapacitation 
was the result of illness or injury. 

(e) In computing the net amount of 
back pay payable under section 5596 of 
title 5, United States Code, and this 
subpart, an agency must make the fol-
lowing offsets and deductions (in the 
order shown) from the gross back pay 
award: 

(1) Any outside earnings (gross earn-
ings less any associated business losses 
and ordinary and necessary business 
expenses) received by an employee for 
other employment (including a busi-
ness enterprise) undertaken to replace 
the employment from which the em-
ployee was separated by the unjustified 
or unwarranted personnel action dur-
ing the interim period covered by the 
corrective action. Do not count earn-
ings from additional or ‘‘moonlight’’ 
employment the employee may have 
engaged in while Federally employed 
(before separation) and while erro-
neously separated. 
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(2) Any erroneous payments received 
from the Government as a result of the 
unjustified or unwarranted personnel 
action, which, in the case of erroneous 
payments received from a Federal em-
ployee retirement system, must be re-
turned to the appropriate system. Such 
payments must be recovered from the 
back pay award in the following order: 

(i) Retirement annuity payments 
(i.e., gross annuity less deductions for 
life insurance and health benefits pre-
miums, if those premiums can be re-
covered by the affected retirement sys-
tem from the insurance carrier); 

(ii) Refunds of retirement contribu-
tions (i.e., gross refund before any de-
ductions); 

(iii) Severance pay (i.e., gross pay-
ments before any deductions); and 

(iv) A lump-sum payment for annual 
leave (i.e., gross payment before any 
deductions). 

(3) Authorized deductions of the type 
that would have been made from the 
employee’s pay (if paid when properly 
due) in accordance with the normal 
order of precedence for deductions from 
pay established by the agency, subject 
to any applicable law or regulation, in-
cluding, but not limited to, the fol-
lowing types of deductions, as applica-
ble: 

(i) Mandatory employee retirement 
contributions toward a defined benefit 
plan, such as the Civil Service Retire-
ment System or the defined benefit 
component of the Federal Employees 
Retirement System; 

(ii) Social Security taxes and Medi-
care taxes; 

(iii) Health benefits premiums, if cov-
erage continued during a period of er-
roneous retirement (with paid pre-
miums recoverable by the retirement 
system) or is retroactively reinstated 
at the employee’s election under 5 
U.S.C. 8908(a); 

(iv) Life insurance premiums if— 
(A) Coverage continued during a pe-

riod of erroneous retirement; 
(B) Coverage was stopped during an 

erroneous suspension or separation and 
the employee suffered death or acci-
dental dismemberment during that pe-
riod (consistent with 5 U.S.C. 8706(d)); 
or 

(C) Additional premiums are owed be-
cause of a retroactive increase in basic 
pay; and 

(v) Federal income tax withholdings. 

NOTE TO PARAGRAPH (e)(3): See appendix A 
to this subpart for additional information on 
computing certain deductions. 

(4) Administrative offsets under 31 
U.S.C. 3716 to recover any other out-
standing debt(s) owed to the Federal 
Government by the employee, as appro-
priate. 

(f) For the purpose of computing the 
amount of back pay under paragraph 
(e) of this section, interest shall be in-
cluded in the amount from which de-
ductions for erroneous payments are 
made, as required by § 550.805(e)(2) of 
this part. 

(g) An agency shall credit annual 
leave restored to an employee as a re-
sult of the correction of an unjustified 
or unwarranted personnel action in ex-
cess of the maximum leave accumula-
tion authorized by law to a separate 
leave account for use by the employee. 
The employee shall schedule and use 
annual leave in such a separate leave 
account as follows: 

(1) A full-time employee shall sched-
ule and use excess annual leave of 416 
hours or less by the end of the leave 
year in progress 2 years after the date 
on which the annual leave is credited 
to the separate account. The agency 
shall extend this period by 1 leave year 
for each additional 208 hours of excess 
annual leave or any portion thereof. 

(2) A part-time employee shall sched-
ule and use excess annual leave in an 
amount equal to or less than 20 percent 
of the employee’s scheduled tour of 
duty over a period of 52 calendar weeks 
by the end of the leave year in progress 
2 years after the date on which the an-
nual leave is credited to the separate 
account. The agency shall extend this 
period by 1 leave year for each addi-
tional number of hours of excess an-
nual leave, or any portion thereof, 
equal to 10 percent of the employee’s 
scheduled tour of duty over a period of 
52 calendar weeks. 

(h) Agencies must correct errors that 
affect an employee’s Thrift Savings 
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Plan account consistent with regula-
tions prescribed by the Federal Retire-
ment Thrift Investment Board. (See 
parts 1605 and 1606 of this title.) 

[46 FR 58275, Dec. 1, 1981, as amended at 53 
FR 18072, May 20, 1988, and 53 FR 45886, Nov. 
15, 1988; 59 FR 66634, Dec. 28, 1994; 64 FR 69178, 
Dec. 10, 1999] 

§ 550.806 Interest computations. 
(a)(1) Interest begins to accrue on the 

date or dates (usually one or more pay 
dates) on which the employee would 
have received the pay, allowances, and 
differentials if the unjustified or un-
warranted personnel action had not oc-
curred. 

(2) Interest accrual ends at a time se-
lected by the agency that is no more 
than 30 days before the date of the 
back pay interest payment. No interest 
is payable if a complete back pay pay-
ment is made within 30 days after any 
erroneous withdrawal, reduction, or de-
nial of a payment, and the interest ac-
crual ending date is set to coincide 
with the interest accrual starting date. 

(b) In computing the amount of inter-
est due under section 5596 of title 5, 
United States Code, the agency shall 
reduce the amount of pay, allowances, 
and differentials due for each date de-
scribed in paragraph (a) of this section 
by an amount determined as follows: 

(1) Divide the employee’s earnings 
from other employment during the pe-
riod covered by the corrective action, 
as described in § 550.805(e)(1) of this 
part, by the total amount of back pay 
prior to any deductions; 

(2) Multiply the ratio obtained in 
paragraph (b)(1) of this section by the 
amount of pay, allowances, and dif-
ferentials due for each date described 
in paragraph (a) of this section. 

(c) The agency shall compute interest 
on the amount of back pay computed 
under section 5596 of title 5, United 
States Code, and this subpart before 
making deductions for erroneous pay-
ments, as required by § 550.805(e)(2) of 
this part. 

(d) The rate or rates used to compute 
the interest payment shall be the an-
nual percentage rate or rates estab-
lished by the Secretary of the Treasury 
as the overpayment rate under section 
6621(a)(1) of title 26, United States Code 
(or its predecessor statute), for the pe-

riod or periods of time for which inter-
est is payable. 

(e) On each day for which interest ac-
crues, the agency shall compound in-
terest by dividing the applicable inter-
est rate (expressed as a decimal) by 365 
(366 in a leap year). 

(f) The agency shall compute the 
amount of interest due, and shall issue 
the interest payment within 30 days of 
the date on which accrual of interest 
ends. 

(g) To the extent administratively 
feasible, the agency shall issue pay-
ments of back pay and interest simul-
taneously. If all or part of the payment 
of back pay is issued on or before the 
date on which accrual of interest ends 
and the interest payment is issued 
after the payment of back pay is 
issued, the amount of the payment of 
back pay shall be subtracted from the 
accrued amount of back pay and inter-
est, effective with the date the pay-
ment of back pay was issued. Interest 
shall continue to accrue on the remain-
ing unpaid amount of back pay (if any) 
and interest until the date on which 
accrual of interest ends. 

[53 FR 18072, May 20, 1988, and 53 FR 45886, 
Nov. 15, 1988; 64 FR 69179, Dec. 10, 1999] 

§ 550.807 Payment of reasonable attor-
ney fees. 

(a) An employee or an employee’s 
personal representative may request 
payment of reasonable attorney fees 
related to an unjustified or unwar-
ranted personnel action that resulted 
in the withdrawal, reduction, or denial 
of all or part of the pay, allowances, 
and differentials otherwise due the em-
ployee. Such a request may be pre-
sented only to the appropriate author-
ity that corrected or directed the cor-
rection of the unjustified or unwar-
ranted personnel action. However, if 
the finding that provides the basis for 
a request for payment of reasonable at-
torney fees is made on appeal from a 
decision by an appropriate authority 
other than the employing agency, the 
employee or the employee’s personal 
representative shall present the re-
quest to the appropriate authority 
from which the appeal was taken. 

(b) The appropriate authority to 
which such a request is presented shall 
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