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the growers and a meeting of the han-
dlers. Such nominations, if made, shall 
be filed with the Secretary no later 
than the effective date of this part. In 
the event nominations for initial mem-
bers and alternate members of the 
committee are not filed pursuant to, 
and within the time specified in, this 
section, the Secretary may select such 
initial members and alternate mem-
bers without regard to nominations, 
but selections shall be on the basis of 
the representation provided in § 925.20. 

(b) Successor members. The Secretary 
shall cause to be held, not later than 
November 15, of each year, meetings of 
producers and handlers for the purpose 
of making nominations for members 
and alternate members of the com-
mittee. 

(c) Only producers, including duly au-
thorized officers or employees of pro-
ducers, who are present at such nomi-
nation meetings, may participate in 
the nomination and election of nomi-
nees for producer members and their 
alternates. Each producer entity shall 
be entitled to cast only one vote. If a 
person is both a producer and a handler 
of grapes, such person may participate 
in both producer and handler nomina-
tions. 

(d) Only handlers, including duly au-
thorized officers or employees of han-
dlers, who are present at such nomina-
tion meetings, may participate in the 
nomination and election of nominees 
for handler members and their alter-
nates. Each handler entity shall be en-
titled to cast only one vote. 

(e) One member and alternate mem-
ber shall be nominated by a vote of 
both producers and handlers and may 
be of either group. 

(f) The public member and alternate 
member shall be nominated by the 
committee. The committee shall pre-
scribe, with the approval of the Sec-
retary, procedures for the nomination 
of the public member and qualification 
requirements for such member. 

§ 925.23 Selection. 

The Secretary shall select members 
and alternate members of the com-
mittee from persons nominated pursu-
ant to § 925.22 or from other qualified 
persons. 

§ 925.24 Failure to nominate. 
If nominations are not made within 

the time and in the manner specified in 
§ 925.22 the Secretary may select the 
members and alternate members of the 
committee without regard to nomina-
tions on the basis of the representation 
provided for in § 925.20. 

§ 925.25 Acceptance. 
Any person selected by the Secretary 

as a member or as an alternate member 
of the committee shall qualify by filing 
a written acceptance with the Sec-
retary promptly after being notified of 
such selection. 

§ 925.26 Vacancies. 
To fill any vacancy occasioned by the 

failure of any person selected as a 
member or as an alternate member of 
the committee to qualify, or in the 
event of the death, removal, resigna-
tion, or disqualification of any member 
or alternate member of the committee, 
a successor for the unexpired term of 
such member or alternate member of 
the committee shall be nominated and 
selected in the manner specified in 
§§ 925.22 and 925.23. If the names of the 
nominees to fill any such vacancy are 
not made available to the Secretary 
within a reasonable time after such va-
cancy occurs, the Secretary may fill 
such vacancy without regard to nomi-
nations, which selection shall be made 
on the basis of the representation pro-
vided for in § 925.20. 

§ 925.27 Alternate members. 
An alternate member shall act in the 

place of the member during such mem-
ber’s absence or at such member’s re-
quest, and may be assigned other pro-
gram duties by the chairman or the 
committee. In the event of the death, 
removal, resignation, or disqualifica-
tion of a member the alternate shall 
act for the member until a successor 
for such member is selected and has 
qualified. In the event that both a 
member and that member’s alternate 
are unable to attend a committee 
meeting, the member or committee 
members present may designate any 
other alternate to serve in such mem-
ber’s place at the meeting if such ac-
tion is necessary to secure a quorum: 
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