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extension of time, we will pay all the 
past-due benefits to you. 

(ii) The representative must send you 
a copy of any request made to us for an 
extension of time. If the request is not 
filed within 20 days of the date of the 
notice, or by the last day of any exten-
sion we approved, we will pay to you 
all past-due benefits remaining after 
we reimburse the State for any interim 
assistance you received. We must ap-
prove any fee the representative 
charges after that time, but the collec-
tion of any approved fee is a matter be-
tween you and the representative. 

(d) Assessment when we pay a fee di-
rectly to a representative. (1) Whenever 
we pay a fee directly to a representa-
tive from past-due benefits, we impose 
an assessment on the representative. 

(2) The amount of the assessment is 
equal to the lesser of: 

(i) The product we obtain by multi-
plying the amount of the fee we are 
paying to the representative by the 
percentage rate the Commissioner of 
Social Security determines is nec-
essary to achieve full recovery of the 
costs of determining and paying fees 
directly to representatives, but not in 
excess of 6.3 percent; and 

(ii) The maximum assessment 
amount. The maximum assessment 
amount was initially set at $75, but by 
law is adjusted annually to reflect the 
increase in the cost of living. (See 
§§ 404.270 through 404.277 for an expla-
nation of how the cost-of-living adjust-
ment is computed.) If the adjusted 
amount is not a multiple of $1, we 
round down the amount to the next 
lower $1, but the amount will not be 
less than $75. We will announce any in-
crease in the maximum assessment 
amount, and explain how that increase 
was determined in the FEDERAL REG-
ISTER. 

(3) We collect the assessment by sub-
tracting it from the amount of the fee 
to be paid to the representative. The 
representative who is subject to an as-
sessment may not, directly or indi-
rectly, request or otherwise obtain re-
imbursement of the assessment from 
you. 

(e) Effective dates for extension of di-
rect payment of fee to attorneys. The pro-
visions of this subpart authorizing the 
direct payment of fees to attorneys and 

the withholding of title XVI benefits 
for that purpose, apply in claims for 
benefits with respect to which the 
agreement for representation is en-
tered into before March 1, 2010. 

[72 FR 16726, Apr. 5, 2007, as amended at 76 
FR 45195, July 28, 2011] 

§ 416.1535 [Reserved] 

§ 416.1540 Rules of conduct and stand-
ards of responsibility for represent-
atives. 

(a) Purpose and scope. (1) All attor-
neys or other persons acting on behalf 
of a party seeking a statutory right or 
benefit must, in their dealings with us, 
faithfully execute their duties as 
agents and fiduciaries of a party. A 
representative must provide competent 
assistance to the claimant and recog-
nize our authority to lawfully admin-
ister the process. The following provi-
sions set forth certain affirmative du-
ties and prohibited actions that will 
govern the relationship between the 
representative and us, including mat-
ters involving our administrative pro-
cedures and fee collections. 

(2) All representatives must be forth-
right in their dealings with us and with 
the claimant and must comport them-
selves with due regard for the non-
adversarial nature of the proceedings 
by complying with our rules and stand-
ards, which are intended to ensure or-
derly and fair presentation of evidence 
and argument. 

(b) Affirmative duties. A representa-
tive must, in conformity with the regu-
lations setting forth our existing du-
ties and responsibilities and those of 
claimants (see § 416.912 in disability and 
blindness claims): 

(1) Act with reasonable promptness 
to obtain the information and evidence 
that the claimant wants to submit in 
support of his or her claim, and for-
ward the same to us for consideration 
as soon as practicable. In disability and 
blindness claims, this includes the obli-
gations to assist the claimant in bring-
ing to our attention everything that 
shows that the claimant is disabled or 
blind, and to assist the claimant in fur-
nishing medical evidence that the 
claimant intends to personally provide 
and other evidence that we can use to 
reach conclusions about the claimant’s 
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