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program is inaccessible because exist-
ing facilities under GSA’s control are 
not accessible and usable by individ-
uals with handicaps, GSA shall be 
jointly responsible with the agency for 
resolving the complaint and shall par-
ticipate in making findings of fact and 
conclusions of law in prescribing and 
implementing appropriate remedies for 
each violation found. 

(b) GSA shall make reasonable ef-
forts to follow the time frames for 
complaint resolution that go into ef-
fect under the notifying occupant agen-
cy’s compliance procedures when it re-
ceives a complete complaint. 

(c) Receipt of a copy of the complete 
complaint by GSA shall constitute no-
tification to GSA for purposes of § 105– 
8.171(a). 
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§ 105–50.000 Scope of part. 

This part prescribes rules and proce-
dures governing the provision of spe-
cial or technical services to State and 
local units of government by GSA. This 
part also prescribes principles gov-
erning reimbursements for such serv-
ices. 

§ 105–50.001 Definitions. 

The following definitions are estab-
lished for terms used in this part. 

§ 105–50.001–1 State. 

State means any of the several States 
of the United States, the District of 
Columbia, Puerto Rico, any territory 
or possession of the United States, or 
any agency or instrumentality of a 
State, but does not include the govern-
ments of the political subdivisions of 
the State. 

§ 105–50.001–2 Political subdivision or 
local government. 

Political subdivision or local govern-
ment means a local unit of government, 
including specifically a county, mu-
nicipality, city, town, township, or a 
school or other special district created 
by or pursuant to State law. 
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