
74 

49 CFR Ch. X (10–1–13 Edition) § 1033.2 

transaction pursuant to which the car 
was furnished to the rail carrier mak-
ing the election as to that rail carrier 
and all users and subsequent owners if: 

(1) That rail carrier does not have 
legal title to the car and does not ob-
tain written consent or such election 
from the party holding legal title; 

(2) The transaction was entered into 
prior to January 1, 1991; and 

(3) The transaction does not provide 
that the compensation to be paid to 
the party furnishing the car is to be 
based in whole or in part directly on 
the car hire earnings of the car; pro-
vided, however, that if the rail carrier 
making the election subsequently ob-
tains legal title to the car, such elec-
tion shall then be irrevocable and bind-
ing as to the rail carrier and all users 
and subsequent owners. 

(C) The party holding legal title to 
the car may revoke an election subject 
to the provisions of paragraph 
(b)(3)(i)(B) of this section only: 

(1) At the time the transaction pur-
suant to which the car was furnished to 
the rail carrier making the election is 
first extended or renewed after Janu-
ary 1, 1991; or 

(2) If such transaction is not ex-
tended or renewed, at the time such 
transaction terminates. 
If such election is so revoked, a rail 
carrier may make a new election only 
with the written consent of the party 
holding legal title to the car, and such 
election shall be irrevocable and bind-
ing as to the rail carrier making the 
election and all users and subsequent 
owners. 

(ii) Nothing in paragraph (b)(3)(i) of 
this section shall be construed to limit 
the rights of parties to any transaction 
to provide for the consent of any party 
to an election made pursuant to para-
graph (b)(3)(i) of this section. 

(c) Market rate cars. (1) Market rate 
cars shall not be subject to prescribed 
rates or to the provisions of 49 CFR 
1039.14(c)(1) (i) and (ii) and (c)(4). 

(2) (i) The Board shall not prescribe 
car hire for market rate cars. 

(ii) The Code of Car Hire Rules ref-
erenced in the Association of American 
Railroads Car Service and Car Hire 
Agreement provides that owners and 
users party to that agreement shall re-
solve car hire disputes thereunder. The 

Board may review allegations of abuse 
of the car hire dispute resolution proc-
ess established under those rules. 

(iii) Car hire disputes involving an 
owner or user not a party to that 
agreement may be resolved by the 
Board. 

(d) Car hire agreements. Rail carriers 
are authorized to negotiate and enter 
into agreements governing car hire. 

(e) Effective date. This part shall take 
effect on January 1, 1994. 

[58 FR 60144, Nov. 15, 1993] 

§ 1033.2 Car service orders. 

Emergency and temporary service or-
ders are issued under this part but are 
not carried in the Code of Federal Reg-
ulations. 

[58 FR 60145, Nov. 15, 1993] 

PART 1034—ROUTING OF TRAFFIC 

AUTHORITY: 49 U.S.C. 721, 11123. 

§ 1034.1 Temporary authority. 

(a) Authority. Any railroad subject to 
regulation under 49 U.S.C. 10501 may 
reasonably divert or reroute traffic to 
other carriers, if it is unable due to cir-
cumstances beyond its control prompt-
ly to transport traffic over a portion of 
its lines. Traffic necessarily diverted 
under this authority shall be rerouted 
to preserve as much as possible the 
participation and revenues of other 
carriers provided in the original rout-
ing. This authority may be exercised 
for no more than 30 days following the 
day on which the rerouting begins. If a 
carrier needs more than 30 days before 
its disability or the disability of a re-
ceiving carrier is cured, it may auto-
matically extend its rerouting for addi-
tional 30-day periods. To extend the pe-
riod, it must submit a written or tele-
graphic notice to the Association of 
American Railroads and the Board’s 
Office of Compliance and Enforcement 
explaining why the rerouting is nec-
essary, when it began, when the dis-
ability occurred, why an extension is 
necessary, the specific lines disabled, 
the rerouting to be continued, which 
shippers are affected, and any other 
important facts. 
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