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title, appropriation and decree, appli-
cation and permit, public notice and 
appropriation and use). 

(ii) A copy of a contract with another 
company or municipality to supply 
water; or stock certificates in another 
company which represents the right to 
receive water. 

(4) Lease agreements. Where the right 
of use or control of real property not 
owned by the applicant is essential to 
the successful operation of the facility 
during the life of the loan, such right 
will be evidenced by written agree-
ments or contracts between the owner 
of the property and the applicant. 
Lease agreements shall not contain 
provisions for restricted use of the site 
of facility, forfeiture or summary can-
cellation clauses. Lease agreements 
shall provide for the right to transfer, 
encumber, assign and sub-lease without 
restriction. Lease agreements will or-
dinarily be written for a term at least 
equal to the term of the loan. Such 
lease contracts or agreements will be 
approved by the approval official with 
the advice and counsel of OGC, as nec-
essary. 

(h) Obtaining loan closing instructions. 
The information required by OGC will 
be transmitted to OGC with request for 
closing instructions. Upon receipt of 
closing instructions, the processing of-
fice will discuss with the applicant and 
its engineer, attorney, and other appro-
priate representatives, the require-
ments contained therein and any ac-
tions necessary to proceed with clos-
ing. State program officials have the 
option to work with OGC to obtain 
waivers for closing instructions in cer-
tain cases. Closing instructions are not 
required for grants. 

§ 1780.45 Loan and grant closing and 
delivery of funds. 

(a) Loan closing. Notes and bonds will 
be completed on the date of loan clos-
ing except for the entry of subsequent 
RUS multiple advances where applica-
ble. The amount of each note will be in 
multiples of not less than $100. The 
amount of each bond will ordinarily be 
in multiples of not less than $1,000. 

(1) Form RD 440–22, ‘‘Promissory 
Note (Association or Organization),’’ 
will ordinarily be used for loans to non-
public bodies. 

(2) RUS Bulletins 1780–27, ‘‘Loan Res-
olution (Public Bodies),’’ or 1780–28, 
‘‘Loan Resolution Security Agree-
ment,’’ will be adopted by public and 
other-than-public bodies. These resolu-
tions supplement other provisions in 
this part. 

(3) Subpart D of this part contains in-
structions for preparation of notes and 
bonds evidencing indebtedness of pub-
lic bodies. 

(b) Loan disbursement. (1) Multiple ad-
vances. Multiple advances will be used 
only for loans in excess of $100,000. Ad-
vances will be made only as needed to 
cover disbursements required by the 
borrower over a 30-day period. 

(i) Subpart D of this part contains in-
structions for making multiple ad-
vances to public bodies. 

(ii) Advances will be requested by the 
borrower in writing. The request 
should be in sufficient amounts to pay 
cost of construction, rights-of-way and 
land, legal, engineering, interest, and 
other expenses as needed. The borrower 
may use Form RD 440–11, ‘‘Estimate of 
Funds Needed for 30 Day Period Com-
mencing XXX,’’ to show the amount of 
funds needed during the 30-day period. 

(2) RUS loan funds obligated for a 
specific purpose, such as the paying of 
interest, but not needed at the time of 
loan closing will remain in the Finance 
Office until needed unless State stat-
utes require all funds to be delivered to 
the borrower at the time of closing. 
Loan funds may be advanced to prepay 
costs under § 1780.9 (e)(2)(iv). If all funds 
must be delivered to the borrower at 
the time of closing to comply with 
State statutes, funds not needed at 
loan closing will be handled as follows: 

(i) Deposited in an appropriate bor-
rower account, such as debt service or 
construction accounts; or 

(ii) Deposited in a joint bank account 
under paragraph (e)(3) of this section. 

(c) Grant closing. RUS Bulletin 1780–12 
‘‘Water or Waste System Grant Agree-
ment’’ of this part will be completed 
and executed in accordance with the 
requirements of grant approval. The 
grant will be considered closed when 
RUS Bulletin 1780–12 has been properly 
executed. Processing or approval offi-
cials are authorized to sign the grant 
agreement on behalf of RUS. For 
grants that supplement RUS loan 

VerDate Mar<15>2010 16:53 Feb 14, 2013 Jkt 229023 PO 00000 Frm 00322 Fmt 8010 Sfmt 8010 Q:\07\7V12.TXT ofr150 PsN: PC150



313 

Rural Utilities Service, USDA § 1780.45 

funds, the grant should be closed si-
multaneously with the closing of the 
loan. However, when grant funds will 
be disbursed before loan closing, as pro-
vided in paragraph (d)(1) of this sec-
tion, the grant will be closed not later 
than the delivery date of the first ad-
vance of grant funds. 

(d) Grant disbursements. RUS policy is 
not to disburse grant funds from the 
Treasury until they are actually need-
ed by the applicant. Applicant funds 
will be disbursed before the disbursal of 
any RUS grant funds. RUS loan funds 
will be disbursed before the disbursal of 
any RUS grant funds except when: 

(1) Interim financing of the total es-
timated amount of loan funds needed 
during construction is arranged; and 

(2) All interim funds have been dis-
bursed; and 

(3) RUS grant funds are needed before 
the RUS loan can be closed. 

(e) Use and accountability of funds. (1) 
Arrangements will be agreed upon for 
the prior concurrence by the Agency of 
the bills or vouchers upon which war-
rants will be drawn. Form RD 402–2, 
‘‘Statement of Deposits and With-
drawals,’’ or similar form will be used 
by the Agency to monitor funds. Peri-
odic reviews of these accounts shall be 
made by the Agency. 

(2) Pledge of collateral for grants to 
nonprofit organizations. Grant funds 
must be deposited in a bank with Fed-
eral Deposit Insurance Corporation 
(FDIC) insurance coverage. Also, if the 
balance in the account containing 
grant funds exceeds the FDIC insur-
ance coverage, the excess amount must 
be collaterally secured. The pledge of 
collateral for the excess will be in ac-
cordance with Treasury Circular 176. 

(3) Joint RUS/borrower bank account. 
RUS funds and any funds furnished by 
the borrower including contributions 
to purchase major items of equipment, 
machinery, and furnishings will be de-
posited in a joint RUS/borrower bank 
account if determined necessary by the 
approval official. When RUS has a 
Memorandum of Understanding with 
another agency that provides for the 
use of joint RUS/borrower accounts, or 
when RUS is the primary source of 
funds for a project and has determined 
that the use of a joint RUS/borrower 
bank account is necessary, project 

funds from other sources may also be 
deposited in the joint bank account. 
RUS shall not be accountable to the 
source of the other funds nor shall RUS 
undertake responsibility to administer 
the funding program of the other enti-
ty. Joint RUS/borrower bank accounts 
should not be used for funds advanced 
by an interim lender. When funds ex-
ceeds the FDIC insurance coverage, the 
excess must have a pledge of collateral 
in accordance with Treasury Circular 
176. 

(4) Payment for project costs. Project 
costs will be monitored by the RUS 
processing office. Invoices will be ap-
proved by the borrower and their engi-
neer, as appropriate, and submitted to 
the processing office for concurrence. 
The review and acceptance of project 
costs, including construction pay esti-
mates, by RUS does not attest to the 
correctness of the amounts, the quan-
tities shown or that the work has been 
performed under the terms of the 
agreements or contracts. 

(f) Use of remaining funds. Funds re-
maining after all costs incident to the 
basic project have been paid or pro-
vided for will not include applicant 
contributions. Funds remaining, may 
be considered in direct proportion to 
the amounts obtained from each 
source. Remaining funds will be han-
dled as follows: 

(1) Remaining funds may be used for 
eligible loan or grant purposes, pro-
vided the use will not result in major 
changes to the facility(s) and the pur-
pose of the loan and grant remains the 
same; 

(2) RUS loan funds that are not need-
ed will be applied as an extra payment 
on the RUS indebtedness unless other 
disposition is required by the bond or-
dinance, resolution, or State statute; 
and 

(3) Grant funds not expended under 
paragraph (f)(1) of this section will be 
canceled. Prior to the actual cancella-
tion, the borrower, its attorney and its 
engineer will be notified of RUS’s in-
tent to cancel the remaining funds. 
The applicant will be given appropriate 
appeal rights. 

(g) Post review of loan closing. In order 
to determine that the loan has been 
properly closed the loan docket will be 
reviewed by OGC. The State program 
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official has the option to consult with 
OGC to obtain waivers of this review. 

[62 FR 33478, June 19, 1997, as amended at 64 
FR 29946, June 4, 1999] 

§ 1780.46 [Reserved] 

§ 1780.47 Borrower accounting meth-
ods, management reporting and au-
dits. 

(a) Borrowers are required to provide 
RUS an annual audit or financial state-
ments. 

(b) Method of accounting and prepara-
tion of financial statements. Annual or-
ganization-wide financial statements 
must be prepared on the accrual basis 
of accounting, in accordance with gen-
erally accepted accounting principles 
(GAAP), unless State statutes or regu-
latory agencies provide otherwise, or 
an exception is granted by the Agency. 
An organization may maintain its ac-
counting records on a basis other than 
accrual accounting, and make the nec-
essary adjustments so that annual fi-
nancial statements are presented on 
the accrual basis. 

(c) Record retention. Each borrower 
shall retain all records, books, and sup-
porting material for 3 years after the 
issuance of the audit or management 
reports. Upon request, this material 
will be made available to RUS, Office 
of the Inspector General (OIG), United 
States Department of Agriculture 
(USDA), the Comptroller General, or to 
their assignees. 

(d) Audits. All audits are to be per-
formed in accordance with the latest 
revision of the generally accepted gov-
ernment auditing standards (GAGAS), 
developed by the Comptroller General 
of the United States. In addition, the 
audits are also to be performed in ac-
cordance with various Office of Man-
agement and Budget (OMB) Circulars. 
The type of audit each borrower is re-
quired to submit will be designated by 
RUS. Further guidance on preparing an 
acceptable audit can be obtained from 
RUS. It is not intended that audits re-
quired by this part be separate and 
apart from audits performed in accord-
ance with State and local laws. To the 
extent feasible, the audit work should 
be done in conjunction with those au-
dits. Audits shall be annual unless oth-
erwise prohibited and supplied to the 

processing office as soon as possible 
but in no event later than 150 days fol-
lowing the period covered by the audit. 
OMB Circulars are available in any 
USDA/RUS office. 

(e) Borrowers exempt from audits. All 
borrowers who are exempt from audits, 
will, within 60 days following the end 
of each fiscal year, furnish the RUS 
with annual financial statements, con-
sisting of a verification of the organi-
zation’s balance sheet and statement of 
income and expense by an appropriate 
official of the organization. Forms RD 
442–2, ‘‘Statement of Budget, Income 
and Equity,’’ and 442–3 may be used. 

(f) Management reports. These reports 
will furnish management with a means 
of evaluating prior decisions and serve 
as a basis for planning future oper-
ations and financial strategies. In 
those cases where revenues from mul-
tiple sources are pledged as security for 
an RUS loan, two reports will be re-
quired; one for the project being fi-
nanced by RUS and one combining the 
entire operation of the borrower. In 
those cases where RUS loans are se-
cured by general obligation bonds or 
assessments and the borrower com-
bines revenues from all sources, one 
management report combining all such 
revenues is acceptable. The following 
management data will be submitted by 
the borrower to the processing office. 
These reports at a minimum will in-
clude a balance sheet and income and 
expense statement. 

(1) Quarterly reports. A quarterly 
management report will be required for 
the first year for new borrowers and for 
all borrowers experiencing financial or 
management problems for one year 
from the date problems were noted. If 
the borrower’s account is current at 
the end of the year, the processing of-
fice may waive the required reports. 

(2) Annual management reports. Prior 
to the beginning of each fiscal year the 
following will be submitted to the 
processing office. (If Form RD 442–2 is 
used as the annual management report, 
enter data in column three only of 
Schedule 1, and complete all of Sched-
ule 2.) 

(i) Two copies of the management re-
ports and proposed ‘‘Annual Budget’’. 
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