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SBIR Technical Data is defined as all 
data generated during the performance 
of an SBIR award. 

SBIR Technical Data Rights are the 
rights a small business concern obtains 
in data generated during the perform-
ance of any SBIR award that an award-
ee delivers to the Government during 
or upon completion of a Federally- 
funded project, and to which the gov-
ernment receives a license. 

Small business concern (SBC) means a 
concern that, on the date of award for 
both Phase I and Phase II funding 
agreements: 

(1) Is organized for profit, with a 
place of business located in the United 
States, which operates primarily with-
in the United States, or which makes a 
significant contribution to the United 
States economy through the payment 
of taxes or use of American products, 
materials or labor; 

(2) Is in the legal form of an indi-
vidual proprietorship, partnership, lim-
ited liability company, corporation, 
joint venture, association, trust or co-
operative, except that where the form 
is a joint venture, there can be no more 
than 49 percent participation by for-
eign business entities in the joint ven-
ture; 

(3) Is at least 51 percent owned and 
controlled by one or more individuals 
who are citizens of, or permanent resi-
dent aliens in, the United States, ex-
cept in the case of a joint venture, 
where each entity in the venture must 
be 51 percent owned and controlled by 
one or more individuals who are citi-
zens of, or permanent resident aliens in 
the United States; and 

(4) Has, including its affiliates, not 
more than 500 employees. The term 
‘‘affiliates’’ is defined in greater detail 
in 13 CFR 121.103. The term ‘‘number of 
employees’’ is defined in 13 CFR 121.106. 

Socially and economically disadvan-
taged small business concern is defined in 
13 CFR part 124–8(A) Business Develop-
ment/Small Disadvantaged Business 
Status Determinations, § 124.103 (Who 
is socially disadvantaged?) and § 124.104 
(Who is economically disadvantaged?). 

United States means the 50 states, the 
territories and possessions of the Fed-
eral Government, the Commonwealth 
of Puerto Rico, the District of Colum-
bia, the Republic of the Marshall Is-

lands, the Federated States of Micro-
nesia, and the Republic of Palau. 

Women-owned small business concern 
means a small business concern that is 
at least 51 percent owned by one or 
more women, or in the case of any pub-
licly owned business, at least 51 per-
cent of the stock is owned by women, 
and women control the management 
and daily business operations. 

[72 FR 20703, Apr. 26, 2007, as amended at 76 
FR 4808, Jan. 27, 2011] 

§ 3403.3 Eligibility requirements. 
(a) Eligibility of organization. (1) To re-

ceive SBIR funds, each awardee of a 
SBIR Phase I or Phase II must qualify 
as a small business concern. 

(2) For Phase I, a minimum of two- 
thirds of the research or analytical ef-
fort, as measured by the budget, must 
be performed by the awardee. Occasion-
ally, deviations from this requirement 
may occur, and must be approved in 
writing by the ADO after consultation 
with the agency SBIR National Pro-
gram Leader. 

(3) For Phase II, a minimum of one- 
half of the research or analytical ef-
fort, as measured by the budget, must 
be performed by the awardee. Occasion-
ally, deviations from this requirement 
may occur, and must be approved in 
writing by the ADO after consultation 
with the agency SBIR National Pro-
gram Leader. 

(4) For both Phase I and Phase II, the 
primary employment of the principal 
investigator must be with the SBC at 
the time of award and during the con-
duct of the proposed project. Primary 
employment means that more than 
one-half of the principal investigator’s 
time is spent in the employ of the SBC. 
This precludes full-time employment 
with another organization. Occasion-
ally, deviations from this requirement 
may occur, and must be approved in 
writing by the ADO after consultation 
with the agency SBIR National Pro-
gram Leader. Further, an SBC may re-
place the principal investigator on an 
SBIR Phase I or Phase II award, sub-
ject to approval in writing by the ADO 
after consultation with the SBIR Na-
tional Program Leader. For purposes of 
the SBIR Program, personnel obtained 
through a Professional Employer Orga-
nization or other similar personnel 
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leasing company must be considered 
employees of the awardee. This is con-
sistent with SBA’s size regulations, 13 
CFR 121.106—Small Business Size Regu-
lations. 

(5) For both Phase I and Phase II, the 
R/R&D must be performed in the 
United States. However, based on a 
rare and unique circumstance, ADO ap-
proval may be granted to perform a 
particular portion of the research or 
research and development work outside 
of the United States, for example, if a 
supply of material or other item or 
project requirement is not available in 
the United States. The ADO, after con-
sultation with the agency SBIR Na-
tional Program Leader, must approve 
each such specific condition in writing. 

(b) [Reserved] 

Subpart B—Program Description 
§ 3403.4 Three-phase program. 

The Small Business Innovation Re-
search Grants Program is carried out 
in three separate phases described in 
this section. The first two phases are 
designed to assist USDA in meeting its 
research or research and development 
objectives and will be supported with 
SBIR Program funds. The purpose of 
the third phase is to pursue the com-
mercial applications or objectives of 
the research carried out in Phases I 
and II through the use of private or 
Federal non-SBIR funds. 

(a) Phase I. Phase I involves a solici-
tation of grant applications (herein-
after referred to as proposals) to con-
duct feasibility-related experimental 
research and development related to 
described agency requirements. These 
requirements, as defined by agency 
topics contained in the solicitation, 
may be general or narrow in scope, de-
pending on USDA needs. The object of 
this phase is to determine the sci-
entific and technical merit and feasi-
bility of the proposed effort and the 
quality of performance of the small 
business concern with a relatively 
small agency investment before consid-
eration of further Federal support in 
Phase II. 

(b) Phase II is the principal research 
or research and development effort in 
which the results from Phase I are ex-
panded upon and further pursued, nor-

mally for a period not to exceed 24 
months. Only SBIR awardees in Phase 
I are eligible to participate in Phase II. 
This includes those awardees identified 
via a ‘‘novated’’ or ‘‘successor in inter-
est’’ or similarly-revised funding agree-
ment, or those that have reorganized 
with the same key staff, regardless of 
whether they have been assigned a dif-
ferent tax identification number. For 
each Phase I project funded, the award-
ee may apply for a Phase II award only 
once. Phase I awardees who for valid 
reasons cannot apply for Phase II sup-
port in the next fiscal year funding 
cycle may normally apply for support 
no later than the second fiscal year 
funding cycle. 

(c) Phase III refers to work that de-
rives from, extends, or logically con-
cludes effort(s) performed under prior 
SBIR funding agreements, but is fund-
ed by sources other than the SBIR Pro-
gram. Phase III work is typically ori-
ented towards commercialization of 
SBIR research or technology. This por-
tion of a project is funded by a non- 
SBIR source through the use of a fol-
low-on funding commitment. A follow- 
on funding commitment is an agree-
ment between the small business con-
cern and a provider of the follow-on 
capital for a specified amount of funds 
to be made available to the small busi-
ness concern for future development of 
their effort upon achieving certain mu-
tually agreed upon technical objec-
tives. 

Subpart C—Preparation of 
Proposals 

§ 3403.5 Program solicitation. 
(a) Phase I. A program solicitation 

requesting Phase I proposals will be 
prepared each fiscal year in which 
funds are made available for this pur-
pose. This solicitation will contain in-
formation sufficient to enable eligible 
applicants to prepare grant proposals 
and will include descriptions of specific 
research topic areas which the Depart-
ment will support during the fiscal 
year involved. A notice of solicitation, 
and the entire contents of the program 
solicitation will be published, at a min-
imum, on the agency’s Web site. 

(b) Phase II. For each fiscal year in 
which funds are made available for this 
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