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Small Business Administration § 120.473 

§ 120.471 What are the minimum cap-
ital requirements for SBLCs? 

(a) Minimum capital requirements. 
Each SBLC must maintain, at a min-
imum, unencumbered paid-in capital 
and paid-in surplus of at least 
$1,000,000, or ten percent of the aggre-
gate of its share of all outstanding 
loans, whichever is more. 

(b) Composition of capital. For pur-
poses of complying with paragraph (a) 
of this section, capital consists only of 
one or more of the following: 

(1) Common stock; 
(2) Preferred stock that is noncumu-

lative as to dividends and does not 
have a maturity date; 

(3) Additional paid-in capital rep-
resenting amounts paid for stock in ex-
cess of the par value; 

(4) Retained earnings of the business; 
and/or 

(5) For limited liability companies 
and limited partnerships, capital con-
tributions must not be subject to re-
payment at any specific time, must not 
be subject to withdrawal and must 
have no cumulative priority return. 

(c) Voluntary capital reduction. With-
out prior written SBA approval, an 
SBLC must not voluntarily reduce its 
capital, or repurchase and hold more 
than 2 percent of any class or combina-
tion of classes of its stock. 

(d) Issuance of securities. Without 
prior written SBA approval, an SBLC 
must not issue any securities (includ-
ing stock options and debt securities) 
except stock dividends. 

[73 FR 75516, Dec. 11, 2008] 

§ 120.472 Higher individual minimum 
capital requirement. 

The Associate Administrator for Cap-
ital Access (AA/CA) may require, under 
§ 120.473(d), an SBLC to maintain a 
higher level of capital, if the AA/CA de-
termines, in his/her discretion, that the 
SBLC’s level of capital is potentially 
inadequate to protect the SBA from 
loss due to the financial failure of the 
SBLC. The factors to be considered in 
the determination will vary in each 
case and may include, for example: 

(a) Specific conditions or cir-
cumstances pertaining to the SBLC; 

(b) Exigency of those circumstances 
or potential problems; 

(c) Overall condition, management 
strength, and future prospects of the 
SBLC and, if applicable, its parent or 
affiliates; 

(d) The SBLC’s liquidity and existing 
capital level, and the performance of 
its SBA loan portfolio; 

(e) The management views of the 
SBLC’s directors and senior manage-
ment; and 

(f) Other risk-related factors, as de-
termined by SBA. 

[73 FR 75516, Dec. 11, 2008] 

§ 120.473 Procedures for determining 
individual minimum capital re-
quirement. 

(a) Notice. When SBA determines that 
an individual minimum capital re-
quirement above that set forth in this 
subpart or other legal authority is nec-
essary or appropriate for a particular 
SBLC, SBA will notify the SBLC in 
writing of the proposed individual min-
imum capital requirement, the date by 
which it should be reached and will 
provide an explanation of why the re-
quirement proposed is considered nec-
essary or appropriate. 

(b) SBLC response. The SBLC may re-
spond to the notice. The response 
should include any matters which the 
SBLC would have SBA consider in de-
ciding whether individual minimum 
capital requirements should be estab-
lished for the SBLC, what those capital 
requirements should be, and, if applica-
ble, when they should be achieved. The 
response must be in writing and deliv-
ered to the AA/CA within 30 days after 
the date on which the SBLC received 
the notice. SBA may shorten the time 
for response when, in the opinion of 
SBA, the condition of the SBLC so war-
rants, provided that the SBLC is in-
formed promptly of the new time pe-
riod, or the SBLC consents to the 
shortening of its response time. In its 
discretion, SBA may extend the time 
period for good cause. 

(c) Failure to respond. An SBLC that 
does not respond within 30 days or such 
other time period as may be specified 
by SBA will have waived any objec-
tions to the proposed minimum capital 
requirement and the deadline for its 
achievement. Failure to respond will 
also constitute consent to the indi-
vidual minimum capital requirement. 
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(d) Decision. After the close of the 
SBLC’s response period, the AA/CA will 
decide, based on a review of SBA rea-
sons for proposing the individual min-
imum capital requirement, the SBLC’s 
response, and other information con-
cerning the SBLC, whether the indi-
vidual minimum capital requirement 
should be established for the SBLC 
and, if so, the requirement and the date 
it will become effective. The SBLC will 
be notified of the decision in writing. 
The notice will include an explanation 
of the decision; except for a decision 
not to establish an individual min-
imum capital requirement for the 
SBLC. 

(e) Submission of plan. The decision 
may require the SBLC to develop and 
submit to SBA, within a time period 
specified, an acceptable plan to reach 
the individual minimum capital re-
quirement by the date required. 

(f) Change in circumstances. If, after 
SBA’s decision in paragraph (d) of this 
section, there is a change in the cir-
cumstances affecting the SBLC’s cap-
ital adequacy or its ability to reach the 
required individual minimum capital 
requirement by the specified date, ei-
ther the SBLC or the AA/CA may pro-
pose to the other a change in the indi-
vidual minimum capital requirement 
for the SBLC, the date when the indi-
vidual minimum must be achieved, 
and/or the SBLC’s plan (if applicable). 
The AA/CA may decline to consider 
proposals that are not based on a sig-
nificant change in circumstances or are 
repetitive or frivolous. Pending a deci-
sion by the AA/CA on reconsideration, 
SBA’s original decision and any plan 
required under that decision will con-
tinue in full force and effect. 

[73 FR 75516, Dec. 11, 2008] 

§ 120.474 Relation to other actions. 

In lieu of, or in addition to, the pro-
cedures in this subpart, the individual 
minimum capital requirement for an 
SBLC may be established or revised 
through a written agreement or cease 
and desist proceedings under subpart I 
of this part. 

[73 FR 75517, Dec. 11, 2008] 

§ 120.475 Change of ownership or con-
trol. 

(a) Any change of ownership or con-
trol without prior written approval of 
SBA is prohibited. An SBLC must re-
quest approval of any such change from 
the appropriate Office of Capital Ac-
cess official in accordance with Delega-
tions of Authority.Pending the ap-
proval, the SBLC may not register the 
proposed new owners on its transfer 
books nor permit them to participate 
in any manner in the conduct of the 
SBLC’s affairs. Change of ownership or 
control includes: 

(1) Any transfer of 10 percent or more 
of any class of the SBLC’s stock, and 
any agreement providing for such 
transfer; 

(2) Any transfer that could result in 
the beneficial ownership by any person 
or group of persons acting in concert of 
10 percent or more of any class of its 
stock, and any agreement providing for 
such transfer; 

(3) Any merger, consolidation, or re-
organization; or 

(4) Any other transaction or agree-
ment that transfers control of the 
SBLC. 

(b) If transfer of ownership or control 
is subject to the approval of any State 
or Federal chartering, licensing, or 
other regulatory authority, copies of 
any documents filed with such author-
ity must, at the same time, be trans-
mitted to the appropriate Office of 
Capital Access official in accordance 
with Delegations of Authority. 

[61 FR 3235, Jan. 31, 1996. Redesignated and 
amended at 73 FR 75516, Dec. 11, 2008] 

§ 120.476 Prohibited financing. 

An SBLC may not make a loan to a 
small business that has received fi-
nancing (or a commitment for financ-
ing) from an SBIC that is an Associate 
of the SBLC. 

[61 FR 3235, Jan. 31, 1996. Redesignated at 73 
FR 75516, Dec. 11, 2008] 

§ 120.490 Audits. 

Every SBLC is subject to periodic au-
dits by SBA’s Office of Inspector Gen-
eral, Auditing Division, and the cost of 
such audits will be assessed against the 
SBLC, except for the first audit. Fees 
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