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Office of Asst. Sec. for Housing, HUD § 3282.404 

Subpart I—Consumer Complaint 
Handling and Remedial Actions 

SOURCE: 78 FR 60200, Oct. 1, 2013, unless 
otherwise noted. 

§ 3282.401 Purpose and scope. 
(a) Purpose. The purpose of this sub-

part is to establish a system of protec-
tions provided by the Act with respect 
to imminent safety hazards and fail-
ures to conform to the construction 
and safety standards with a minimum 
of formality and delay, while pro-
tecting the rights of all parties. 

(b) Scope. This subpart sets out the 
procedures to be followed by manufac-
turers, retailers, and distributors, 
SAAs, primary inspection agencies, 
and the Secretary to assure that notifi-
cation and correction are provided with 
respect to manufactured homes when 
required under this subpart. Notifica-
tion and correction may be required 
with respect to manufactured homes 
that have been sold or otherwise re-
leased by the manufacturer to another 
party. 

§ 3282.402 General provisions. 
(a) Purchaser’s rights. Nothing in this 

subpart shall limit the rights of the 
purchaser under any contract or appli-
cable law. 

(b) Manufacturer’s liability limited. A 
manufacturer is not responsible for 
failures that occur in any manufac-
tured home or component as the result 
of normal wear and aging, consumer 
abuse, or neglect of maintenance. The 
life of a component warranty may be 
one of the indicators used to establish 
normal wear and aging. A failure of 
any component may not be attributed 
by the manufacturer to normal wear 
and aging under this subpart during 
the term of any applicable warranty 
provided by the original manufacturer 
of the affected component. 

§ 3282.403 Consumer complaint and in-
formation referral. 

(a) Retailer responsibilities. When a re-
tailer receives a consumer complaint 
or other information about a home in 
its possession, or that it has sold or 
leased, that likely indicates a non-
compliance, defect, serious defect, or 
imminent safety hazard, the retailer 

must forward the complaint or infor-
mation to the manufacturer of the 
manufactured home in question as 
early as possible, in accordance with 
§ 3282.256. 

(b) SAA and HUD responsibilities. (1) 
When an SAA or the Secretary receives 
a consumer complaint or other infor-
mation that likely indicates a non-
compliance, defect, serious defect, or 
imminent safety hazard in a manufac-
tured home, the SAA or HUD must: 

(i) Forward the complaint or infor-
mation to the manufacturer of the 
home in question as early as possible; 
and 

(ii) Send a copy of the complaint or 
other information to the SAA of the 
State where the manufactured home 
was manufactured or to the Secretary 
if there is no such SAA. 

(2) When it appears from the com-
plaint or other information that an im-
minent safety hazard or serious defect 
may be involved, the SAA of the State 
where the home was manufactured 
must also send a copy of the complaint 
or other information to the Secretary. 

(c) Manufacturer responsibilities. 
Whenever the manufacturer receives 
information from any source that the 
manufacturer believes in good faith re-
lates to a noncompliance, defect, seri-
ous defect, or imminent safety hazard 
in any of its manufactured homes, the 
manufacturer must, for each such oc-
currence, make the determinations re-
quired by § 3282.404. 

§ 3282.404 Manufacturers’ determina-
tions and related concurrences. 

(a) Initial determination. (1) Not later 
than 30 days after a manufacturer re-
ceives information that it believes in 
good faith may indicate a noncompli-
ance, defect, serious defect, or immi-
nent safety hazard, the manufacturer 
must make a specific initial deter-
mination that there is a noncompli-
ance, defect, serious defect, or immi-
nent safety hazard, or that the infor-
mation requires no further action 
under this subpart. If a manufacturer 
makes a final determination of non-
compliance for an individual home (see 
§ 3282.412(b)) and a class of homes is not 
involved, no further action is needed by 
the manufacturer other than to keep a 
record of its determination as required 
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