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pay, porosity, water saturations, pres-
sures, formation volume factor); 

(3) Appropriate well logs, including 
digital well log (i.e., gamma ray, resis-
tivity, neutron, density, sonic, caliper 
curves) curves in an acceptable digital 
format; 

(4) Sidewall core/whole core and pres-
sure-volume-temperature analysis; 

(5) Structure maps, with the existing 
and proposed penetration points and 
subsea depths for all wells penetrating 
the reservoirs, fluid contacts (or the 
lowest or highest known levels in the 
absence of actual contacts), reservoir 
boundaries, and the scale of the map; 

(6) Interpreted structural cross sec-
tions and corresponding interpreted 
seismic lines or block diagrams, as nec-
essary, that include all current 
wellbores and planned wellbores on the 
leases or units to be developed, the res-
ervoir boundaries, fluid contacts, depth 
scale, stratigraphic positions, and rel-
ative biostratigraphic ages; 

(7) Isopach maps of each reservoir 
showing the net feet of pay for each 
well within the reservoir identified at 
the penetration point, along with the 
well name, labeled contours, and scale; 

(8) Estimates of original oil and gas 
in-place and anticipated recoverable oil 
and gas reserves, all reservoir param-
eters, and risk factors and assump-
tions; 

(9) Plat map at the same scale as the 
structure maps with existing and pro-
posed well paths, as well as existing 
and proposed penetrations; 

(10) Wellbore schematics indicating 
proposed perforations; 

(11) Proposed wellbore utility chart 
showing all existing and proposed 
wells, with proposed completion inter-
vals indicated for each borehole; 

(12) Appropriate pressure data, speci-
fied by date, and whether estimated or 
measured; 

(13) Description of reservoir develop-
ment strategies; 

(14) Description of the enhanced re-
covery practices you will use or, if you 
do not plan to use such practices, an 
explanation of the methods you consid-
ered and reasons you do not intend to 
use them; 

(15) For each reservoir you do not in-
tend to develop: 

(i) A statement explaining the rea-
son(s) you will not develop the res-
ervoir, and 

(ii) Economic justification, including 
costs, recoverable reserve estimate, 
production profiles, and pricing as-
sumptions; and 

(16) Any other appropriate data you 
used in performing your reservoir eval-
uations and preparing your reservoir 
development strategies. 

§ 550.298 How long will BOEM take to 
evaluate and make a decision on 
the CID? 

(a) The Regional Supervisor will 
make a decision within 150 calendar 
days of receiving your CID. If BOEM 
does not act within 150 calendar days, 
your CID is considered approved. 

(b) BOEM may suspend the 150-cal-
endar-day evaluation period if there is 
missing, inconclusive, or inaccurate 
data, or when a well reaches total 
depth during the evaluation period. 
BOEM may also suspend the evaluation 
period when a well penetrating a hy-
drocarbon-bearing structure reaches 
total depth during the evaluation pe-
riod and the data from that well is 
needed for the CID. You will receive 
written notification from the Regional 
Supervisor describing the additional 
information that is needed, and the 
evaluation period will resume once 
BOEM receives the requested informa-
tion. 

(c) The Regional Supervisor will ap-
prove or deny your CID request based 
on your commitment to develop eco-
nomically producible reservoirs accord-
ing to sound conservation, engineering, 
and economic practices. 

§ 550.299 What operations require ap-
proval of the CID? 

You may not begin production before 
you receive BOEM approval of the CID. 

Subpart C—Pollution Prevention 
and Control 

§§ 550.300–550.301 [Reserved] 

§ 550.302 Definitions concerning air 
quality. 

For purposes of §§ 550.303 and 550.304 
of this part: 
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Air pollutant means any combination 
of agents for which the Environmental 
Protection Agency (EPA) has estab-
lished, pursuant to section 109 of the 
Clean Air Act, national primary or sec-
ondary ambient air quality standards. 

Attainment area means, for any air 
pollutant, an area which is shown by 
monitored data or which is calculated 
by air quality modeling (or other meth-
ods determined by the Administrator 
of EPA to be reliable) not to exceed 
any primary or secondary ambient air 
quality standards established by EPA. 

Best available control technology 
(BACT) means an emission limitation 
based on the maximum degree of reduc-
tion for each air pollutant subject to 
regulation, taking into account energy, 
environmental and economic impacts, 
and other costs. The BACT shall be 
verified on a case-by-case basis by the 
Regional Supervisor and may include 
reductions achieved through the appli-
cation of processes, systems, and tech-
niques for the control of each air pol-
lutant. 

Emission offsets mean emission reduc-
tions obtained from facilities, either 
onshore or offshore, other than the fa-
cility or facilities covered by the pro-
posed Exploration Plan or Develop-
ment and Production Plan. 

Existing facility is an OCS facility de-
scribed in an Exploration Plan or a De-
velopment and Production Plan sub-
mitted or approved prior to June 2, 
1980. 

Facility means any installation or de-
vice permanently or temporarily at-
tached to the seabed which is used for 
exploration, development, and produc-
tion activities for oil, gas, or sulphur 
and which emits or has the potential to 
emit any air pollutant from one or 
more sources. All equipment directly 
associated with the installation or de-
vice shall be considered part of a single 
facility if the equipment is dependent 
on, or affects the processes of, the in-
stallation or device. During produc-
tion, multiple installations or devices 
will be considered to be a single facil-
ity if the installations or devices are 
directly related to the production of 
oil, gas, or sulphur at a single site. Any 
vessel used to transfer production from 
an offshore facility shall be considered 

part of the facility while physically at-
tached to it. 

Nonattainment area means, for any air 
pollutant, an area which is shown by 
monitored data or which is calculated 
by air quality modeling (or other meth-
ods determined by the Administrator 
of EPA to be reliable) to exceed any 
primary or secondary ambient air qual-
ity standard established by EPA. 

Projected emissions mean emissions, 
either controlled or uncontrolled, from 
a source(s). 

Source means an emission point. Sev-
eral sources may be included within a 
single facility. 

Temporary facility means activities 
associated with the construction of 
platforms offshore or with facilities re-
lated to exploration for or development 
of offshore oil and gas resources which 
are conducted in one location for less 
than 3 years. 

Volatile organic compound (VOC) 
means any organic compound which is 
emitted to the atmosphere as a vapor. 
The unreactive compounds are exempt 
from the above definition. 

§ 550.303 Facilities described in a new 
or revised Exploration Plan or De-
velopment and Production Plan. 

(a) New plans. All Exploration Plans 
and Development and Production Plans 
shall include the information required 
to make the necessary findings under 
paragraphs (d) through (i) of this sec-
tion, and the lessee shall comply with 
the requirements of this section as nec-
essary. 

(b) Applicability of § 550.303 to existing 
facilities. (1) The Regional Supervisor 
may review any Exploration Plan or 
Development and Production Plan to 
determine whether any facility de-
scribed in the plan should be subject to 
review under this section and has the 
potential to significantly affect the air 
quality of an onshore area. To make 
these decisions, the Regional Super-
visor shall consider the distance of the 
facility from shore, the size of the fa-
cility, the number of sources planned 
for the facility and their operational 
status, and the air quality status of the 
onshore area. 

(2) For a facility identified by the Re-
gional Supervisor in paragraph (b)(1) of 
this section, the Regional Supervisor 
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