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Department of Veterans Affairs § 10.20 

§ 10.4 Loss, destruction, or mutilation 
of adjusted service certificate while 
in possession of Department of Vet-
erans Affairs. 

A new adjusted service certificate 
will be issued without bond in lieu of 
the certificate which has been lost or 
destroyed, or has been mutilated, de-
faced or damaged so as to impair its 
value, while in possession of the De-
partment of Veterans Affairs. 

§ 10.15 Designation of more than one 
beneficiary under an adjusted serv-
ice certificate. 

A veteran to whom an adjusted serv-
ice certificate has been issued pursuant 
to the provisions of section 501 of the 
World War Adjusted Compensation Act 
may name more than one beneficiary 
to receive the proceeds of his adjusted 
service certificate, and may from time 
to time with the approval of the Sec-
retary change such beneficiaries. The 
designated beneficiaries shall share 
equally unless otherwise specified by 
the veteran. Wherever the word bene-
ficiary appears in the law and Depart-
ment of Veterans Affairs regulations it 
shall be interpreted to include bene-
ficiaries. 

§ 10.16 Conditions requisite for change 
in designation of beneficiary. 

A change of beneficiary of an ad-
justed service certificate to be valid 
must be made: 

(a) By notice signed by the veteran or 
his duly authorized agent, and deliv-
ered or properly mailed to the Depart-
ment of Veterans Affairs during the 
lifetime of the veteran. Such change 
shall not take effect until approved by 
the Secretary and after such approval 
the change shall be deemed to have 
been made as of the date the veteran 
signed said written notice and change, 
whether the veteran be living at the 
time of said approval or not. 

(b) Or by last will and testament of 
the veteran, duly probated. Such 
change shall not be effective until re-
ceived by the Department of Veterans 
Affairs and approved by the Secretary 
and after such approval the change 
shall be deemed to have been made as 
of the date of death of the veteran: Pro-
vided, That a change of beneficiary 
signed subsequent to the date upon 

which the will was executed and deliv-
ered in accordance with paragraph (a) 
of this section shall if approved in ac-
cordance with regulations take prece-
dence over the designation by will. 
Provided, however, That any payment 
made to a beneficiary of record, before 
notice of change of beneficiary has 
been received in the Department of 
Veterans Affairs and approved by the 
Secretary, shall not be made again to 
the changed beneficiary. 

§ 10.17 Designation of beneficiary sub-
sequent to cancellation of previous 
designation. 

The designation of a beneficiary 
made subsequent to the cancellation of 
a previous designation of beneficiary, 
shall be considered as a change in bene-
ficiary, and shall be subject to the ap-
proval of the Secretary and subject to 
the conditions and requirements re-
specting change in beneficiary as out-
lined in § 10.16. 

§ 10.18 Approval of application for 
change of beneficiary heretofore 
made. 

Any application for a change of bene-
ficiary heretofore made may be ap-
proved if it meets the requirements set 
out in §§ 10.16 and 10.17. 

§ 10.20 ‘‘Demand for payment’’ certifi-
cation. 

Certification to the execution of de-
mand for payment forms appearing on 
the reverse side of adjusted service cer-
tificates issued pursuant to the World 
War Adjusted Compensation Act, as 
amended, is required in accordance 
with instructions printed on said 
forms. Such certification if made in 
the United States or possessions will be 
accepted if made by and bearing the of-
ficial seal of a United States post-
master, an executive officer of an in-
corporated bank or trust company, no-
tary public, or any person who is le-
gally authorized to administer oaths in 
a State, Territory, District of Colum-
bia or in a Federal judicial district of 
the United States. If the demand for 
payment be executed in a foreign coun-
try, the same shall be certified by an 
American consul, a recognized rep-
resentative of an American embassy or 
legation or by a person authorized to 
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