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§ 222.302 Procedure for obtaining per-
mits. 

(a) Applications must be submitted 
to the Assistant Administrator, by let-
ter containing all necessary informa-
tion, attachments, certification, and 
signature, as specified by the regula-
tions in parts 222, 223, and 224 of this 
chapter, or by the Act. In no case, 
other than for emergencies pursuant to 
§ 222.301(a)(2), will applications be ac-
cepted either orally or by telephone. 

(b) Applications must be received by 
the Assistant Administrator at least 90 
calendar days prior to the date on 
which the applicant desires to have the 
permit made effective, unless other-
wise specified in the regulations or 
guidelines pertaining to a particular 
permit. The National Marine Fisheries 
Service will attempt to process appli-
cations deemed sufficient in the short-
est possible time, but does not guar-
antee that the permit will be issued 90 
days after notice of receipt of the ap-
plication is published in the FEDERAL 
REGISTER. 

(c)(1) Upon receipt of an insuffi-
ciently or improperly executed applica-
tion, the applicant shall be notified of 
the deficiency in the application. If the 
applicant fails to supply the deficient 
information or otherwise fails to cor-
rect the deficiency within 60 days fol-
lowing the date of notification, the ap-
plication shall be considered aban-
doned. 

(2) The sufficiency of the application 
shall be determined by the Assistant 
Administrator in accordance with the 
requirements of this part. The Assist-
ant Administrator, however, may 
waive any requirement for information 
or require any elaboration or further 
information deemed necessary. 

§ 222.303 Issuance of permits. 
(a)(1) No permit may be issued prior 

to the receipt of a written application 
unless an emergency pursuant to 
§ 222.301(a)(2) exists, and a written vari-
ation from the requirements is re-
corded by the National Marine Fish-
eries Service. 

(2) No representation of an employee 
or agent of the United States shall be 
construed as a permit unless it meets 
the requirements of a permit defined in 
§ 222.102. 

(3) Each permit shall bear a serial 
number. Upon renewal, such a number 
may be reassigned to the permittee to 
whom issued so long as the permittee 
maintains continuity of renewal. 

(b) When an application for a permit 
received by the Assistant Adminis-
trator is deemed sufficient, the Assist-
ant Administrator shall, as soon as 
practicable, publish a notice in the 
FEDERAL REGISTER. Information re-
ceived by the Assistant Administrator 
as a part of the application shall be 
available to the public as a matter of 
public record at every stage of the pro-
ceeding. An interested party, within 30 
days after the date of publication of 
such notice, may submit to the Assist-
ant Administrator written data, views, 
or arguments with respect to the tak-
ing, importation, or to other action 
proposed in the application, and may 
request a hearing in connection with 
the action to be taken thereon. 

(c) If a request for a hearing is made 
within the 30-day period referred to in 
paragraph (b) of this section, or if the 
Assistant Administrator determines 
that a hearing would otherwise be ad-
visable, the Assistant Administrator 
may, within 60 days after the date of 
publication of the notice referred to in 
paragraph (b) of this section, afford to 
such requesting party or parties an op-
portunity for a hearing. Such hearing 
shall also be open to participation by 
any interested members of the public. 
Notice of the date, time, and place of 
such hearing shall be published in the 
FEDERAL REGISTER not less than 15 
days in advance of such hearing. Any 
interested person may appear at the 
hearing in person or through a rep-
resentative and may submit any rel-
evant material, data, views, comments, 
arguments, or exhibits. A summary 
record of the hearing shall be kept. 

(d) Except as provided in subpart D 
to 15 CFR part 904, as soon as prac-
ticable but not later than 30 days after 
the close of the hearing. If no hearing 
is held, as soon as practicable but not 
later than 30 days from the publication 
of the notice in the FEDERAL REGISTER, 
the Assistant Administrator shall issue 
or deny issuance of the permit. Notice 
of the decision of the Assistant Admin-
istrator shall be published in the FED-
ERAL REGISTER within 10 days after the 
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date of the issuance or denial and indi-
cate where copies of the permit, if 
issued, may be obtained. 

(e)(1) The Assistant Administrator 
shall issue the permit unless: 

(i) Denial of the permit has been 
made pursuant to subpart D to 15 CFR 
part 904; 

(ii) The applicant has failed to dis-
close material or information required, 
or has made false statements as to any 
material fact, in connection with the 
application; 

(iii) The applicant has failed to dem-
onstrate a valid justification for the 
permit or a showing of responsibility; 

(iv) The authorization requested po-
tentially threatens a fish or wildlife 
population; or 

(v) The Assistant Administrator finds 
through further inquiry or investiga-
tion, or otherwise, that the applicant is 
not qualified. 

(2) The applicant shall be notified in 
writing of the denial of any permit re-
quest, and the reasons thereof. If au-
thorized in the notice of denial, the ap-
plicant may submit further informa-
tion or reasons why the permit should 
not be denied. Such further informa-
tion shall not be considered a new ap-
plication. The final action by the As-
sistant Administrator shall be consid-
ered the final administrative decision 
of the Department of Commerce. 

(f) If a permit is issued under § 222.308, 
the Assistant Administrator shall pub-
lish notice thereof in the FEDERAL 
REGISTER, including the Assistant Ad-
ministrator’s finding that such per-
mit— 

(1) Was applied for in good faith; 
(2) Will not operate to the disadvan-

tage of such endangered species; and 
(3) Will be consistent with the pur-

poses and policy set forth in section 2 
of the Act. 

(g) The Assistant Administrator may 
waive the 30-day period in an emer-
gency situation where the health or 
life of an endangered animal is threat-
ened and no reasonable alternative is 
available to the applicant. Notice of 
any such waiver shall be published by 
the Assistant Administrator in the 
FEDERAL REGISTER within 10 days fol-
lowing the issuance of the permit. 

§ 222.304 Renewal of permits. 
When the permit is renewable and a 

permittee intends to continue the ac-
tivity described in the permit during 
any portion of the year ensuing its ex-
piration, the permittee shall, unless 
otherwise notified in writing by the As-
sistant Administrator, file a request 
for permit renewal, together with a 
certified statement, verifying that the 
information in the original application 
is still currently correct. If the infor-
mation is incorrect the permittee shall 
file a statement of all changes in the 
original application, accompanied by 
any required fee at least 30 days prior 
to the expiration of the permit. Any 
person holding a valid renewable per-
mit, who has complied with the fore-
going provision of this section, may 
continue such activities as were au-
thorized by the expired permit until 
the renewal application is acted upon. 

§ 222.305 Rights of succession and 
transfer of permits. 

(a)(1) Except as otherwise provided in 
this section, permits issued pursuant 
to parts 222, 223, and 224 of this chapter 
are not transferable or assignable. In 
the event that a permit authorizes cer-
tain business activities in connection 
with a business or commercial enter-
prise, which is then subject to any sub-
sequent lease, sale or transfer, the suc-
cessor to that enterprise must obtain a 
permit prior to continuing the per-
mitted activity, with the exceptions 
provided in paragraphs (a)(2) and (a)(3) 
of this section. 

(2) Certain persons, other than the 
permittee, are granted the right to 
carry on a permitted activity for the 
remainder of the term of a current per-
mit, provided that they furnish the 
permit to the issuing officer for en-
dorsement within 90 days from the date 
the successor begins to carry on the ac-
tivity. Such persons are the following: 

(i) The surviving spouse, child, execu-
tor, administrator, or other legal rep-
resentative of a deceased permittee, 
and 

(ii) The receiver or trustee in bank-
ruptcy or a court designated assignee 
for the benefit of creditors. 

(3) Incidental take permits issued 
under § 222.307, and enhancement per-
mits issued under § 222.308, as part of a 
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