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The IRB should be particularly cog-
nizant of the special problems of re-
search that involves a category of sub-
jects who are vulnerable to coercion or 
undue influence, such as children, pris-
oners, individuals with impaired deci-
sion-making capacity, or economically 
or educationally disadvantaged per-
sons. 

(4) Informed consent will be sought 
from each prospective subject or the 
subject’s legally authorized representa-
tive, in accordance with, and to the ex-
tent required by, § 46.116. 

(5) Informed consent will be appro-
priately documented or appropriately 
waived in accordance with § 46.117. 

(6) When appropriate, the research 
plan makes adequate provision for 
monitoring the data collected to en-
sure the safety of subjects. 

(7) When appropriate, there are ade-
quate provisions to protect the privacy 
of subjects and to maintain the con-
fidentiality of data. 

(i) The Secretary of HHS will, after 
consultation with the Office of Man-
agement and Budget’s privacy office 
and other Federal departments and 
agencies that have adopted this policy, 
issue guidance to assist IRBs in assess-
ing what provisions are adequate to 
protect the privacy of subjects and to 
maintain the confidentiality of data. 

(ii) [Reserved] 
(8) For purposes of conducting the 

limited IRB review required by 
§ 46.104(d)(7)), the IRB need not make 
the determinations at paragraphs (a)(1) 
through (7) of this section, and shall 
make the following determinations: 

(i) Broad consent for storage, mainte-
nance, and secondary research use of 
identifiable private information or 
identifiable biospecimens is obtained in 
accordance with the requirements of 
§ 46.116(a)(1)–(4), (a)(6), and (d); 

(ii) Broad consent is appropriately 
documented or waiver of documenta-
tion is appropriate, in accordance with 
§ 46.117; and 

(iii) If there is a change made for re-
search purposes in the way the identifi-
able private information or identifiable 
biospecimens are stored or maintained, 
there are adequate provisions to pro-
tect the privacy of subjects and to 
maintain the confidentiality of data. 

(b) When some or all of the subjects 
are likely to be vulnerable to coercion 
or undue influence, such as children, 
prisoners, individuals with impaired 
decision-making capacity, or economi-
cally or educationally disadvantaged 
persons, additional safeguards have 
been included in the study to protect 
the rights and welfare of these sub-
jects. 

§ 46.112 Review by institution. 

Research covered by this policy that 
has been approved by an IRB may be 
subject to further appropriate review 
and approval or disapproval by officials 
of the institution. However, those offi-
cials may not approve the research if it 
has not been approved by an IRB. 

§ 46.113 Suspension or termination of 
IRB approval of research. 

An IRB shall have authority to sus-
pend or terminate approval of research 
that is not being conducted in accord-
ance with the IRB’s requirements or 
that has been associated with unex-
pected serious harm to subjects. Any 
suspension or termination of approval 
shall include a statement of the rea-
sons for the IRB’s action and shall be 
reported promptly to the investigator, 
appropriate institutional officials, and 
the department or agency head. 

(Approved by the Office of Management and 
Budget under Control Number 0990–0260) 

§ 46.114 Cooperative research. 

(a) Cooperative research projects are 
those projects covered by this policy 
that involve more than one institution. 
In the conduct of cooperative research 
projects, each institution is responsible 
for safeguarding the rights and welfare 
of human subjects and for complying 
with this policy. 

(b)(1) Any institution located in the 
United States that is engaged in coop-
erative research must rely upon ap-
proval by a single IRB for that portion 
of the research that is conducted in the 
United States. The reviewing IRB will 
be identified by the Federal depart-
ment or agency supporting or con-
ducting the research or proposed by the 
lead institution subject to the accept-
ance of the Federal department or 
agency supporting the research. 
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