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§ 97.13 How does an insular area apply 
for a consolidated grant? 

(a) An insular area may apply for a 
consolidated grant in lieu of filing an 
individual application for any of the 
programs listed in § 97.12 for which the 
insular area is eligible. 

(b) The chief executive officer or his 
designee may submit a consolidated 
grant application at any time prior to 
expenditure of the funds proposed for 
consolidation. The application must 
specify the amount of funds proposed 
for consolidation, the titles of the pro-
grams that are the sources of funds 
that are to be consolidated and the ti-
tles of the programs under whose stat-
utory authority the funds are to be ex-
pended. 

(c) The application must contain the 
assurances, certifications, and other 
information required by the statutes 
and regulations applicable to those 
programs under which funds will be ex-
pended. If any of the requirements for 
these latter programs are substantially 
the same, they may be met by a single 
assurance, certification, or narrative, 
as appropriate. The application need 
not meet the application or other re-
quirements for programs which are 
sources of funds for the consolidated 
grant but under whose authority no 
funds will be expended. 

(d) If after receiving a consolidated 
grant, an insular area wishes to use 
funds for a purpose authorized by an el-
igible program that is not included in 
the consolidated grant, or by an eligi-
ble program that was included in the 
grant but was not intended as a pro-
gram under which funds would be ex-
pended, the insular area must submit 
an amended application indicating the 
proposed change and containing the as-
surances, certifications and other in-
formation applicable to that program. 

§ 97.14 How will grant awards be 
made? 

The Secretary, or his designee, will 
award a consolidated grant to each in-
sular area that applies for a consoli-
dated grant and meets the require-
ments of this part and of the statutes 
and regulations applicable to the pro-
grams under whose authority the con-
solidated grant funds will be expended. 
As long as the amount requested does 

not exceed the amount for which the 
insular area is eligible under the pro-
grams that are being consolidated, the 
amount of the award will equal the 
amount requested in the application. 

§ 97.15 For what purposes can grant 
funds be used? 

Funds awarded under a consolidated 
grant must be used for purposes au-
thorized by the statutes and regula-
tions of the programs included in the 
consolidated grant. In its application 
for a consolidated grant the insular 
area is to indicate the amount of funds 
that will be allocated to the eligible 
programs. 

§ 97.16 What fiscal, matching and ad-
ministrative requirements apply to 
grantees? 

(a) An insular area receiving a con-
solidated grant must comply with the 
statutes and regulations applicable to 
the programs under which the funds 
are to be used, except as otherwise pro-
vided in this part. 

(b) In regard to programs included in 
a consolidated grant, an insular area 
need not comply with any of the statu-
tory or regulatory provisions requiring 
recipients to match federal funds with 
their own or other funds. 

(c) A single report may be submitted 
in lieu of any individual reports that 
may be required under the programs 
included in a consolidated grant. 
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