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UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT

EASTERN DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA

DARRIL HEDRICK, DALE 2:76-cv-00162-GEB-EFB
ROBINSON, KATHY LINDSEY,
MARTIN C. CANADA, DARRY ORDER GRANTING MOTION FOR AN
TYRONE PARKER, individually EXTENSION OF TIME AND GRANTING
and on behalf of all others IN PART MOTION FOR ATTORNEY’S
similarly situated, FEES

Plaintiffs,

V.

JAMES GRANT, as Sheriff of
Yuba County; Lieutenant FRED
J. ASBY, as Yuba County
Jailer; and JAMES PHARRIS,
ROY LANDERMAN, DOUG WALTZ,
HAROLD J. “SAM” SPERBECK,
JAMES MARTIN, as members of
the YUBA COUNTY BOARD OF
SUPERVISORS,

Defendants.
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U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION
GPO

Plaintiffs filed an untimely motion for attorney’s fees
under 42 U.S.C. § 1988 for the services their counsel and
certified law students rendered defending against Defendants’

motion to terminate a consent decree governing conditions at the

Yuba County Jail (“the Jail”). Plaintiffs also move under Federal
Rule of Civil Procedure (“Rule”) 6(b) for an extension of time to
file the motion when it was filed. Defendants oppose each
motion.
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I. MOTION FOR AN EXTENSION OF TIME

Plaintiffs filed their attorney’s fees motion after the
deadline for such motions prescribed in Local Rule 293(a). This
rule states in pertinent part: “Motions for awards of attorneys’
fees . . . shall be filed not later than twenty-eight (28) days
after entry of final Jjudgment.” Defendants’ motion to terminate
the consent decree was denied in an order filed April 2, 2014.
Plaintiffs filed their attorney’s fees motion at 12:03 a.m., on
May 1, 2014, which is twenty-nine days after denial of
Defendants’ motion. Since Plaintiffs’ attorney’s fees motion was
filed approximately three minutes late, it was untimely.

Plaintiffs argue the “excusable neglect” standard in
Rule 6(b) authorizes them to be granted the extension of time
they seek and that they have satisfied this standard. Rule 6 (b)
states, in pertinent part: “When an act may or must be done

within a specified time, the court may, for good cause, extend

the time . . . on motion made after the time has expired if the
party failed to act because o0f excusable neglect.” Fed. R. Civ.
P. 6(b). Y“To determine whether a party’s failure to meet a

deadline constitutes ‘excusable neglect,’ courts must apply a
four-factor equitable test, examining: (1) the danger of
prejudice to the opposing party; (2) the length of the delay and
its potential impact on the proceedings; (3) the reason for the
delay; and (4) whether the movant acted in good faith.” Ahanchian

v. Xenon Pictures, Inc., 624 F.3d 1253, 1261 (9th Cir. 2010)

(citing Pioneer Inv. Servs. Co. v. Brunswick Assocs. Ltd., 507

U.s. 380, 395 (1993)).

Plaintiffs argue “there is no danger of prejudice to
2
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Defendants” since Plaintiffs’ counsel emailed Defendants’
counsel the attorney’s fees motion prior to the filing deadline.
(Pls.’ Mot. for Extension of Time, 3:1, ECF No. 141.)
Specifically, Plaintiffs’ counsel declares: “After attempting and
failing to file the documents, [on April 30, 2014,] at 11:48 p.m.
I sent . . . five pdf files (motion and 4 attachments) in an
email message to . . . counsel for Defendants.” (Decl. of Carter
White 1in Support of Pls.’ Mot. For Extension of Time (“White
Decl.”) 9 3, ECF No. 141-1.) Plaintiffs have shown that it is
unlikely that their tardiness prejudiced Defendants.

Plaintiffs further argue that the factor concerning the
extent of their tardiness, and its potential impact on the
judicial proceedings, also weighs in favor of finding excusable
neglect. The only proceeding scheduled was the hearing that
Plaintiffs’ scheduled in their attorney’s fees motion that
noticed the motion for hearing on a law and motion hearing date
provided by the courtroom deputy’s voice mail message, in which
she lists available law and motion hearing dates. The
circumstances involved with the late filing do not indicate that
Plaintiffs’ tardiness had a negative 1impact on the Jjudicial

proceeding. See Ahanchian, 624 F.3d at 1262 (finding excusable

neglect where, inter alia, Plaintiff’s counsel’s three-day delay
in filing a summary judgment opposition “would not have adversely
affected either the summary judgment hearing date, which was ten
days away, or the trial, which was two and a half months away.”)
Plaintiffs’ counsel also avers their reason for the
tardiness is that their counsel first “attempted to

electronically file the Plaintiffs’ motion for attorneys’ fees”
3
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“at approximately 11:30 p.m.” - one half hour before the filing
deadline - and thereafter experienced computer problems which
delayed filing until 12:03 a.m. (White Decl. 9 3.) “Although we
are sympathetic with the circumstances of [Plaintiffs’ counsel’s
computer] problems[,] . . . 1t seems to us that the problem was
really that [Plaintiffs’ counsel] waited until the last minute to
get [their] materials together. [Plaintiffs, counsel] apparently
neglected the old proverb that ‘sooner begun, sooner done.’ When
parties wait until the last minute to comply with a deadline,

7

they are playing with fire.” Spears v. City of Indianapolis, 74

F.3d 153, 157 (7th Cir. 1996). Therefore, this factor does not
weigh in favor of finding excusable neglect.

Plaintiffs also argue their counsel acted in good faith
in connection with the tardiness. Plaintiffs emailed the
attorney’s fees motion to Defendants’ counsel prior to the filing
deadline, and filed their motion for an extension of time one
day after they filed their attorney’s fees motion. Plaintiffs
have shown that their counsel acted in good faith concerning the
late-filed attorney’s fees motion.

Plaintiffs have shown that three of the four factors
weigh significantly in favor of granting their motion for an
extension of time. Therefore, Plaintiffs’ Rule 6(b) motion 1is

granted. See Bateman v. U.S. Postal Serv., 231 F.3d 1220, 1225

(9th Cir. 2000) (finding excusable neglect despite Plaintiff’s
counsel’s “weak Jjustification” for delay, since Y“there was no
evidence that [Plaintiff’s counsel] acted with anything less than
good faith,” and the delay caused only a "“minimal” amount of

prejudice to Defendant and a “minimal” impact on Judicial
4
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proceedings.)
II. ATTORNEY’'S FEES MOTION

Plaintiffs seek an award of attorney’s fees under 42
U.S.C. § 1988 for all services rendered on their behalf defending
against Defendants’ motion to terminate the consent decree.
Defendants request that the ruling on the motion be deferred
until after the Ninth Circuit has decided Defendants’ appeal of
the denial of their motion to terminate the consent decree.

“The district court[s] retain[] the power to award
attorneys’ fees after the notice of appeal from the decision on

the merits hals] been filed.” Masalosalo by Masalosalo V.

Stonewall Ins. Co., 718 F.2d 955, 957 (9th Cir. 1983).

Recognition of th[e] authority [to determine
fees while an appeal 1is pending] best serves
the policy against piecemeal appeals]|, ] ..
prevent [s] hasty consideration of
postjudgment fee motions e [and]
prevent[s] postponement of fee consideration
until after the circuit court mandate, when
the relevant circumstances will no longer be
fresh in the mind of the district judge.

Id. (citations omitted) (citing Terket v. Lund, 623 F.2d 29, 34

(7th Cir. 1980)). “[Tlhe policy against piecemeal appeals” and
deciding attorney’s fees issues when “they are fresh in the mind
of the district judge” favor denying Defendants’ deferred ruling
request. Id.
a. Legal Standard
§ 1988 provides 1in pertinent part: In any action or

proceeding to enforce a provision of sections . . . 1983
the court, in its discretion, may allow the prevailing party

a reasonable attorney’s fee as part of the costs, . . . .7 42

U.S.C. § 1988 (b).
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“To determine the amount of a reasonable fee under §
1988, district courts typically proceed in two steps. First,
courts generally ‘apply ... the lodestar method to determine what

”

constitutes a reasonable attorney’s fee.’ Gonzalez wv. City of

Maywood, 729 F.3d 1196, 1202 (9th Cir. 2013) (gquoting Costa v.

Comm'r of Soc. Sec. Admin., 690 F.3d 1132, 1135 (9th Cir. 2012)).

“Under the lodestar method, the district court ‘multiplies the
number of hours the prevailing party reasonably expended on the
litigation by a reasonable hourly rate.’” Id. “Second, ‘[t]he

district court may then adjust [the lodestar] upward or downward

44

based on,” the following factors:

(1) the time and labor required, (2) the
novelty and difficulty of the questions
involved, (3) the skill requisite to perform
the legal service properly, (4) the
preclusion of other employment by the
attorney due to acceptance of the case, (5)
the customary fee, (6) whether the fee 1is
fixed or contingent, (7) time limitations
imposed by the client or the circumstances,
(8) the amount involved and the results
obtained, (9) the experience, reputation, and
ability of the attorneys, (10) the
“undesirability” of the case, (11) the nature
and length of the professional relationship
with the client, and (12) awards in similar
cases.

Id. (alteration in original) (quoting Moreno v. City of

Sacramento, 534 F.3d 1106, 1111 (9th Cir. 2008), and id. at 1209,

n. 11. (quoting Morales v. City of San Rafael, 96 F.3d 359, 363,

n. 8 (9th Cir. 1996)).
b. Discussion
i. Whether Plaintiffs Are Prevailing Parties for the
Purposes of § 1988

Plaintiffs argue they are prevailing parties under §
6




10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

277

28

Case 2:76-cv-00162-EFB Document 149 Filed 09/08/14 Page 7 of 85

1988 since from September 2013 to April 2014 their counsel and
certified law students defended against Defendants’ motion to
terminate the consent decree. Defendants counter that Plaintiffs
are not prevailing parties since the denial of Defendants’ motion
“changed nothing about the 1legal relationship between
Plaintiffls] . . . and . . . Defendant[s].” (Def.’s Opp’'n to
Pl.’s Mot. for Attorney’s Fees (“Defs.’ Opp’'n”) 3: 24-25, ECF No.
143.)

Attorney’s fees are recoverable for T“postjudgment
enforcement” of a consent decree, which “includes defending

7

against efforts to terminate a consent decree.” Graves v. Arpaio,

633 F. Supp. 2d 834, 844 (D. Ariz. 2009) aff'd, 623 F.3d 1043

(9th Cir. 2010) (citing Cody v. Hillard, 304 F.3d 767, 777 (8th

Cir. 2002)); cf. Prison Legal News v. Schwarzenegger, 608 F.3d

446, 451 (9th Cir. 2010) (citing Keith wv. Volpe, 833 F.2d 850,

855-57 (9th Cir. 1987)) (“[A] party . . . may recover attorneys’
fees under § 1988 for monitoring compliance with [a consent]

decree, even when such monitoring does not result 1n any

judicially sanctioned relief.”); Webb v. Ada Cnty., 285 F.3d 829,
835 (9th Cir. 2002) (holding “attorney’s fees incurred for
postjudgment enforcement of [a] district court’s . . . consent
decree were compensable under the [Prison Litigation Reform

Act],” which 1limits the fees awardable to prisoners under §
1988.).

Since Plaintiffs have defended against Defendants’
motion to terminate the consent decree, Plaintiffs are prevailing

parties entitled to an attorney’s fees award.
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ii. Whether the Prison Litigation Reform Act Limits
the Amount of Attorney’s Fees Plaintiffs Recover
Plaintiffs argue they are entitled to the full amount
of fees they seek and that what they request is not limited by
the fee restriction 1in the Prison Litigation Reform Act’s
("PLRA”) 1in 42 U.S.C. § 1997e(d) (1).

The PLRA prescribes, in pertinent part:

In any action brought by a prisoner who 1is
confined to any Jjail . . 4, in which
attorney’s fees are authorized under section
1988 . . . , such fees shall not be awarded,
except to the extent that--

(A) the fee was directly and reasonably
incurred in proving an actual violation of
the plaintiff’s rights protected by a statute
pursuant to which a fee may be awarded under
section 1988 . . . ; and

(B) (i) the amount of the fee is
proportionately related to the court ordered
relief for the violation; or

(i1) the fee was directly and reasonably
incurred in enforcing the relief ordered for
the violation.

42 U.S.C. §§ 1997e(d) (1) (A) - (B) (emphasis added) .
Under the PLRA, “a plaintiff 1is entitled to fees
incurred in enforcing a Jjudgment entered upon proof that the

plaintiff’s constitutional rights had been violated.” Webb v. Ada

Cnty., 285 F.3d 829, 834 (9th Cir. 2002). However, “the court
must assure that the case is not being milked by a [plaintiff]
after the [judgment] has been obtained, for fees that are
unreasonable 1in amount, for work not reasonably performed to
enforce the relief, or for work not directly related to enforcing

the relief.” Balla v. Idaho, 677 F.3d 910, 919 (9th Cir. 2012).
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Plaintiffs argue their fee request should be awarded
since the consent decree they defended was entered upon a finding
of constitutional violations at the Jail, and therefore is
consistent with the PLRA’s requirement that fees for defending a
consent decree must concern a consent decree that was entered
upon proof of a constitutional violation.

Concerning constitutional violations, the consent
decree states: “On November 12, 1976 the Court . . . filed its

Findings of Facts, Conclusions of Law, and Order granting

”

[Plaintiffs’] motions for partial summary Jjudgment(,]” concerning
W [alccess to [llegal [m]aterials,” and ™ female
participation in the . . . Jail trusty program.” (Consent

Decree, 2:13-16, 2:3-5 ECF No. 120-1.) This Order was “subsumed”
into the consent decree, upon the Court’s final approval of the
consent decree on May 2, 1979. (Id. at 3:10-15.)' Therefore,
Plaintiffs have shown they are entitled to attorney’s fees for
legal services rendered defending the portions of the consent
decree concerning access to legal materials and female
participation in the Jail trusty program (hereafter, “the
2

relevant portions of the decree”).

However, the other portions of the consent decree

! The referenced Order is not in the Court’s filing system since it has

been archived, and the nature thereof has not been disputed.

2 Plaintiffs also argue that “in issuing a preliminary injunction [in
1976] . . . the Court found that conditions of confinement at the Jail
violated the Constitution,” and therefore “fees may be awarded in proportion
to the relief granted.” (Pls.’ Mot. for Attorney’s Fees (“Pls.’ Mot.”), 5:19-
21, ECF No. 139.) However, the Ninth Circuit has found that prisoners are not
entitled to attorney’s fees under the PLRA where prisoners obtain “temporary
relief . . . in the form of a preliminary injunction [that] [does] not
affirmatively establish that the [municipality] actually violated [the
prisoners’] protected rights.” Kimbrough v. California, 609 F.3d 1027, 1032
(9th Cir. 2010).
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prescribe relief not related to the claims on which the partial
summary Jjudgment was granted. Further, the parties “waiveled] a
hearing and findings of fact and conclusions of law on all issues
raised by the Complaint that are disposed of [in the consent
decree].” (Consent Decree 2:30-32.) Therefore, Plaintiffs have
not shown they are entitled to attorney’s fees for defending
those portions of the consent decree that do not concern
accessing legal materials or female participation in the Jail’s
trusty program.

The Court’s decisions concerning whether law student
billings are compensable under the PLRA are in Appendix 1, which
is attached to this order, and are also below; Appendix 1
contains a «copy of the law students’ time sheets.’ Since
Plaintiffs have not explained precisely which billing entries
concern the relevant portions of the consent decree, certain
entries are reduced based on whether Plaintiffs’ proposed

findings of fact and conclusions of law (“proposed findings”),

3 Both Plaintiffs and Defendants attached an annotated version of these

time sheets to their respective opening and opposition briefs. Plaintiffs’
counsel crossed out certain entries not claimed to be compensable and listed
at the bottom of each page the total number of hours claimed to be compensable
on that page. Defendants’ counsel circled entries in pen which Defendants
argue are “based on clerical tasks, unnecessary research, and unnecessary
billings not reasonably related to this litigation.” (Defs.’ Opp’n 7:5-6.).
Since the annotated time sheets attached to Defendants’ opposition brief
exclude certain pages of time sheets attached to Plaintiffs’ opening brief,
the Court created Appendix 1 by inserting the referenced excluded pages into
the time sheets attached to Defendants’ opposition brief.

The Court has used computer software to insert red markings to show
whether certain time sheet entries are compensable. Those entries inside a red
rectangular box are compensable. Where tasks are block-billed and only a
certain percentage of the block-billed tasks are compensable, an explanation
of which hours were deducted is inside a red rectangular box with an arrow
pointing to the relevant entry. The total number compensable hours within each
box is rounded to the nearest hundredth. When an entry is not compensable, an
explanation of why the entry is not compensable is inside a red rectangular
box with an arrow pointing to the entry. Finally, at the bottom of each page
the total number of hours awarded on that page is inside a red box.

10
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filed on March, 19, 2014, or the declarations of detainees which
Plaintiffs filed on March 31, 2014, indicate that the entry
concerns a relevant portion of the consent decree. (ECF Nos. 129,
133-1, 133-2). These decisions were made to “assure that”
Plaintiffs are not compensated for “fees that are unreasonable in
amount, for work not reasonably performed to enforce the relief,
or for work not directly related to enforcing the relief.” Balla,
677 F.3d at 919.

For example, since declarations of Erik-James
Pendergraph, Neil Ernest Carranza, Tiara Tyson, Shannon Silva,
Peter Azevedo, Patrick Perry, Jon Bechtel, and Jennelle Cropsey
do not contain any statement concerning access to legal material
or the Jail’s trusty program, Plaintiffs have not shown that they
are entitled to attorney’s fees for the hours billed concerning
these detainees. Further, each billing entry concerning detainee
Theron Holston is reduced by approximately 67% since only one of
three declarations submitted by Mr. Holston concerns the relevant
portions of the consent decree. Similarly, each entry concerning
detainee George Pasion 1is reduced by 75% since only one of four
declarations submitted by Mr. ©Pasion concern the relevant
portions of the consent decree. Moreover, entries concerning
visits to the jail for unspecified purposes, Plaintiffs’ requests
for production of documents concerning unspecified subjects, and
entries related to preparation of Plaintiffs’ proposed findings
were reduced by 87.5%, since only one of eight sections in the
proposed findings concerns a relevant portion of the consent
decree; specifically, the access to legal materials section.

Additionally, entries which record services rendered concerning
11




10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

277

28

Case 2:76-cv-00162-EFB Document 149 Filed 09/08/14 Page 12 of 85

individuals who are not mentioned in the proposed findings or who
did not produce a declaration that Plaintiffs filed on the case
docket are not considered compensable under the PLRA since
Plaintiffs have not shown these services concern relevant
portions of the consent decree.

Where Plaintiffs’ counsel Dblock-billed tasks Dboth
related to and unrelated to the relevant portions of the consent
decree, the hours claimed in the entry were reduced based on the
description of the billed tasks to “‘fairly balance’ those hours

that were actually billed in block format.” Welch v. Metro. Life

Ins. Co., 480 F.3d 942, 948 (9th Cir. 2007) (quoting Sorenson V.

Mink, 239 F.3d 1140, 1146 (9th Cir. 2001)).

For example, December 15, 2013 entry number 57179
bills .2 hours and reads: “Read letter from Patrick Perry re
willing to meet; review declarations returned to CRC from Passion
and Holston.” Since the entry contains two sub-entries separated
by the semi-colon, the entry indicates that approximately one
half of the time was spent reading a letter and one half of the
time was spent reviewing declarations. Plaintiffs have not shown
that the time spent reading the Perry letter is compensable since
Perry’s declaration does not address the relevant portions of the
consent decree. To reflect this, the billing entry is reduced by
half (.1 hours). The remaining .1 hours is further reduced to
reflect that Plaintiffs have not shown that more than
approximately 33% of the entry concerning Holston and 25% of the
entry concerning Pasion relate to relevant portions of the
consent decree. After these reductions are made, the fee award is

.03 hours since it was rounded to the nearest hundredth.
12
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Similarly, for any block-billed trips to the 3Jjail,
Plaintiffs are credited with 2.5 hours of travel time. The travel
time estimate 1is based on the average of two separately billed
car trips to the jail, billed on February 11, 2014 (Entry No.
57746) and February 18, 2014 (Entry No. 57841). Further, where
two students entered separate billing entries for a jail wvisit on
the same day, the two students’ hours are credited as having
worked on the same tasks, unless an entry indicates otherwise.

In addition to the fees sought for law student
services, Plaintiffs seek 46 hours of fees for their counsel’s
services. Their counsel declares that these hours comprise eight
jail wvisits during which he accompanied law students; 1.5 hours
revising Plaintiffs’ Opposition to Defendants’ Motion to
Terminate; 3 hours revising Plaintiffs’ Joint Statement and
Proposed Findings of Fact; and 1.5 hours revising Plaintiffs’
request for an order to seal. Plaintiffs have not submitted time
sheets of their counsel’s hours; however, review of the student
time sheets and the documents Plaintiffs’ counsel revised
indicates that only a portion of these hours are compensable
under the PLRA. Specifically, the time sheets reveal that only
6.3 hours of fees should be awarded for Plaintiffs’ counsel’s
jail wvisits. Further, since only one eighth of the proposed
findings concerns relevant portions of the consent decree, this
document reveals that only .375 hours should be awarded for the
time Plaintiffs’ counsel spent revising it. Moreover, Plaintiffs
have not shown that attorney’s fees should be awarded for any
time spent revising the request for an order to seal, since

Plaintiffs’ request concerns medical records that have not been
13
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shown to have a relationship to the relevant portions of the
consent decree.

The 1.5 hours Plaintiffs’ counsel spent revising the
opposition to Defendants’ motion to terminate are compensable,
since the opposition brief evinces that these fees were
reasonably incurred enforcing the relief ordered in the relevant
portions of the consent decree.

iii. Whether Law Students Worked Reasonable Hours

Defending Relevant Portions of The Consent Decree

The parties dispute whether law students worked an
unreasonable number of hours. Specifically, the parties dispute
whether certain law student time sheet entries are redundant,

AN

concern clerical tasks, concern unnecessary research, or are “not
reasonably related to this 1litigation.” (Defs.’” Mot. 7:6-7.)
These disputes are only decided for those entries that concern
relevant portions of the consent decree.

Under the loadstar method, “a ‘reasonable’ number of
hours equals ‘[t]he number of hours . . . [which] could
reasonably have been billed to a private client.’” Gonzalez, 729
F.3d at 1202 (alteration in original) (quoting Moreno, 534 F.3d
at 1111). “The fee applicant bears the burden of documenting the

appropriate hours expended in the 1litigation and must submit

evidence in support of those hours worked.” Gates v. Deukmejian,

987 F.2d 1392, 1397 (9th Cir. 1992) (citing Hensley v. Eckerhart,

461 U.S. 424, 437 (1983)). If the fee applicant submits wvague
records, the district court may “simply reduce[] the fee [award]

to a reasonable amount.” Fischer v. SJB-P.D. Inc., 214 F.3d 1115,

1121 (9th Cir. 2000); see Neil v. Comm'r of Soc. Sec., 495 F.
14
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App'x 845, 847 (9th Cir. 2012) (stating, “the district court
acted within its discretion in reducing Neil’s fee award by .3
hours to account for an . . . entry that was wvague and
inadequately explained.”) Furthermore, where a fee applicant
chooses to “block bill some of its time rather than itemize each

4

task individually,” the court may “impose a reduction,” as long
as it ‘explain how[s] or why . . . the reduction . . . fairly
balance([s]’ those hours that were actually billed in Dblock
format.” Welch, 480 F.3d at 948 (quoting Sorenson, 239 F.3d at

1146) . Moreover, a plaintiff may not receive attorney’s fees for

clerical tasks. See Nadarajah v. Holder, 569 F.3d 906, 921 (9th

Cir. 2009) (“When clerical tasks are billed at hourly rates, the
court should reduce the hours requested to account for the

billing errors.”); Yates v. Vishal Corp., 11-CVv-00643-JCS, 2014

WL 572528, at * 6 (N.D. Cal. Feb. 4, 2014) (refusing to award
attorney’s fees for “purely clerical,” tasks “such as posting
letters for mail, photocopying, three-hole punching, internal
filing, calendaring, and preparing the summons and complaint for
filing.”)

FEach of the law students’ time sheet entries has been
reviewed. Certain time sheet entries concern clerical tasks or
are vague. Fees are not awarded for services recorded in these

entries. See Nadarajah, 569 F.3d at 921 (reducing fees to account

for the billing of clerical work); Fischer v. SJB-P.D. Inc., 214

F.3d at 1121 (stating fee award may be reduced where entries are
vague); Neil, 495 F. App'x at 847 (affirming reduction in fee
award for vague entry). Specific deductions to the law student

hours are presented in Appendix 1.
15
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iv. Hourly Rate For Plaintiffs’ Counsel and Law
Students

Plaintiffs seek an award of attorney’s fees based on a
rate of $211.15 per hour for Plaintiffs’ counsel’s services,
which Plaintiffs argue is the maximum hourly rate the PLRA
authorizes. (Pls.’ Mot. for Attorney’s Fees (“Pls.’ Mot.”), 10:
2-4, ECF No. 139.)

Concerning this, the PLRA prescribes, 1in pertinent

part:

In any action brought by a prisoner who 1is

confined to any Jjail, . . . in which
attorney’s fees are authorized wunder [42
U.S.C. §] 1988 . . . [n]o award of attorney’s
fees . . . shall be based on an hourly rate

greater than 150 percent[(the “multiplier”)]
of the hourly rate established under section
3006A of Title 18 [(the Criminal Justice Act
["CJA"]) ] for payment of court-appointed
counsel [ (the “baseline rate”)].

42 U.S3.C. S§§ 1997e(d) (1), (3). The Ninth Circuit has stated the

A\Y

baseline PLRA hourly rate is the amount authorized by the

Judicial Conference.” Webb v. Ada Cnty., 285 F.3d 829, 839 (9th

Cir. 2002); accord Perez v. Cate, 632 F.3d 553, 555-56 (9th Cir.

2011) (setting the maximum hourly rate under the PLRA at Y150
percent of $113” since the “Judicial Conference [had] increased
the maximum hourly rate for court-appointed counsel to $113.7)
The rates authorized by the Judicial Conference are published in
the Guide to Judiciary Policy. See 7 Guide to Judiciary Policy §
230.16 available at
http://www.uscourts.gov/FederalCourts/AppointmentOfCounsel/CJAGui

delinesForms/vol7PartA/vol7PartAChapter2.aspx#230 16; Gilman v.
16
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Brown, CIV. S-05-830 LKK/CK, 2014 WL 3735401, at *1 (E.D. Cal.

July 28, 2014) (quoting 7 Guide to Judiciary Policy § 230.16 for
the rates established by the Judicial Conference.) Since the
Judicial Conference has changed the established hourly rate over
the past several years, the baseline rate of compensation under

the PLRA depends on when the services were performed. See Gilman,

2014 WL 3735401, at *1 (“[T]lhe baseline rate . . . depends on the
year the services were performed . . . .”)

The Judicial Conference established a rate of $110 per
hour for services performed from September 1, 2013 to February
28, 2014, and a rate of $126 per hour for services performed from
March 1, 2014 to the present. The first entry in the time sheets
submitted by Plaintiffs 1s dated September 3, 2013, and
Plaintiffs seek fees for their counsel’s services through the
filing of their attorney’s fees reply brief on May 23, 2014.°
Therefore, Plaintiffs have shown they are entitled to a baseline
rate of $110 per hour for their counsel’s services prior to March
1, 2014, and $126 per hour for their «counsel’s subsequent

services.’

4 Plaintiffs do not submit time sheets concerning their counsel’s work.

The time sheets submitted by Plaintiffs only record law student hours.
However, Plaintiffs seek compensation for their counsel’s service when he
accompanied law students on visits to the jail and revised certain court-filed
documents. Therefore, the dates on which Plaintiffs’ counsel performed these
tasks is determined by using the student time sheets and the case docket.

s Plaintiffs argue that a rate of $141 should serve as the baseline rate
since the Honorable Julia S. Gibbons, Chair of the Committee on the Budget of
the Judicial Conference of the United States, testified before a Congressional
subcommittee that: “[The Judicial Conference] request[s] [Congress] . . . to
increase the . . . [CJA] rate to the statutorily authorized rate of $141 per
hour, effective January 1, 2011.” Statement of Honorable Julia S. Gibbons,
Chair Committee on the Budget of the Judicial Conference of the United States
before the Subcommittee on Financial Services and General Government of the
Committee on Appropriations of the United States House of Representatives,
March 18, 2010, at 13, available at
http://www.uscourts.gov/News/Viewer.aspx?doc=/uscourts/News/2010/docs/Judge Gi
bbons Judicial Conference.pdf. “However, [P]laintiffs do not explain how

17
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Plaintiffs further argue that the maximum  PLRA
multiplier (150%) should be applied to their counsel’s baseline
hourly rates, since similarly experienced attorneys in the
Eastern District of California have received between $350 and
$450 per hour under § 1988. Defendants counter, arguing in a
conclusory manner that it would be inequitable to award the
maximum multiplier for Plaintiffs’ counsel’s services.

Under the loadstar method, the reasonable hourly rate
is “calculated according to the prevailing market rates in the
relevant legal community, and the general rule is that the rates
of attorneys practicing in the forum district, here the Eastern

District of California . . . are used.” Gates, 987 F.2d at 1405

(citation omitted). “Within this geographic community, the
district court should ‘tak[e] into consideration the experience,

44

skill, and reputation of the attorney Gonzalez, 729 F.3d

at 1205 (first alteration in original) (quoting Dang v. Cross,

422 F.3d 800, 813 (9th Cir. 2005)).

“‘Y[Tlhe burden 1is on the fee applicant to produce
satisfactory evidence . . . that the requested rates are in line
with those prevailing in the community for similar services by
lawyers of reasonably comparable skill, experience and

44

reputation.’” Camacho v. Bridgeport Fin., Inc., 523 F.3d 973, 980

(9th Cir. 2008) (guoting Blum v. Stenson, 465 U.S. 886, 895 n. 11

(1984)). “Affidavits of the plaintiffs’ attorney and other

attorneys regarding prevailing fees in the community, and rate

Congressional testimony, even from Judge Gibbons, could override the official,
published determination of the Judicial Conference itself[,]” set forth in the
Guide to Judiciary Policy. Gilman, 2014 WL 3735401, at *3. Therefore,
Plaintiffs have not shown that they are entitled to a PLRA baseline rate of
$141.

18
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determinations in other cases . . . are satisfactory evidence of

the prevailing market rate.” United Steelworkers of Am. v. Phelps

Dodge Corp., 896 F.2d 403, 407 (9th Cir. 1990); see also Ingram

v. Oroudjian, 647 F.3d 925, 928 (9th Cir. 2011) (indicating a

district court may “rely on its own familiarity with the legal
market” 1in determining a reasonable hourly rate); Moreno, 534
F.3d at 1115 (“District Jjudges can . . . consider the fees
awarded by other judges in the same locality in similar cases.”).

Plaintiffs argue the maximum PLRA multiplier of 150%
should be applied to the baseline hourly rates for their
counsel’s services. This would entitle Plaintiffs to a $165
hourly rate for Plaintiffs’ counsel’s services prior to March 1,
2014, and an $189  hourly rate for Plaintiffs’ —counsel’s
subsequent services. Plaintiffs argue these hourly rates are
reasonable, since in a civil rights case captioned Hunter v.

Cnty. of Sacramento, a case that was not governed by the PLRA,

the Court concluded a $350 hourly rate was reasonable for an
attorney with experience comparable to Plaintiffs’ counsel’s
experience. 2:06-CV-00457-GEB, 2013 WL 5597134, at *8 (E.D. Cal.
Oct. 11, 2013). Defendants counter with the conclusory argument
that it would be inequitable to award Plaintiffs the maximum PLRA
multiplier; however, this argument fails to rebut Plaintiffs’
reasonable hourly rate evidence. Plaintiffs have shown that it is
reasonable to apply the maximum PLRA multiplier for their
counsel’s services.

Plaintiffs further argue they are entitled to the
maximum PLRA hourly rate for hours billed by the law students.

Plaintiffs submit a declaration from Andrew Bluth, an attorney at
19
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Pillsbury Winthrop Shaw Pittman LLP (“Pillsbury”) 1in support of
this argument. Bluth avers that law students at his firm bill
$315 per hour. Defendants counter that Plaintiffs have not shown
what Bluth avers 1is relevant to the determination of the law
student fees 1in this action, since Bluth does not describe the
nature of the services the law students rendered for Pillsbury
and how those services compare to the services rendered by the
law students 1in this action. Defendants further argue that law
students at Pillsbury bill a higher hourly rate than law students
have received wunder § 1988 1in recent cases 1in the Eastern
District of California.

Bluth’s averments lack an explanation of the complexity
of the matters on which law students worked at Pillsbury and
therefore do not demonstrate that the hourly rates billed by law
students at the Pillsbury firm are for services comparable to the
services at issue. Further, recent decisions 1in the FEastern
District of California have awarded § 1988 fees for services
rendered by law clerks, including those who graduated from law

school, at hourly rates between $100 and $125. See Miller v.

Schmitz, 1:12-CVv-00137-LJO, 2014 WL 642729, at *4 (E.D. Cal. Feb.
18, 2014) (setting hourly rate for law clerk who graduated from

law school at $100 per hour); Hall v. City of Fairfield, 2:10-CV-

0508 DAD, 2014 wL 1286001, at *8 (E.D. Cal. Mar. 31, 2014) (same
at $125 per hour).

In light of the Dbaseline PLRA rates applicable to
Plaintiffs’ counsel and the lack of evidence 1in the record
concerning the experience and expertise of the law students,

Plaintiffs have not shown that the law students’ hourly rate
20
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should be approximately the same as their counsel’s PLRA baseline
rates of $110 per hour for services performed from September 1,
2013 to February 28, 2014, and $126 per hour for services

performed from March 1, 2014 to the present. See Camacho, 523

F.3d at 980 (“"‘[Tlhe burden is on the fee applicant to produce
satisfactory evidence . . . that the requested rates are in line

with those prevailing in the community . . . .”); cf. Borunda v.

Richmond, 885 F.2d 1384, 1392 (9th Cir. 1988) (“We have

denied section 1988 fees on appeal . . . because counsel failed
to adequately brief the issues he presented, thereby requiring
the court to engage in independent research.”) Nor does any cited
case from the relevant community contain information justifying
what the law students’ rate should be in this case. However, it
is presumed that a lower hourly rate should apply to the law

students’ to account for their lack of expertise. See Barjon v.

Dalton, 132 F.3d 496, 503 (9th Cir. 1997) (“presume[ing]” that an
attorney reduced the value of a request for “law clerk costs” “to
account for her law clerk’s lack of experience and expertise.”)
Therefore, the reasonable hourly rate for the law students is one
half of the PLRA baseline rates applicable to this action: $55
per hour for services performed from September 1, 2013 to
February 28, 2014, and $63 per hour for services performed from
March 1, 2014 to the present.

V. Whether Adjustment to the Loadstar is Warranted

Defendants argue that the loadstar figure should be

AN}

adjusted downward, contending [P]laintiff achieved only limited
success” 1in opposing Defendants’ motion to terminate. (Defs.’

Opp’'n, 4:20-22 (quoting Hunter v. Cnty. of Sacramento, C2:06-CV-
21
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00457-GEB, 2013 WL 5597134, at *7 (E.D. Cal. Oct. 11, 2013).)
Specifically, Defendants contend Plaintiffs attempted to expand
the scope of the consent decree and “were successful in none of
their efforts” to do so. (Defs.’” Opp’n 4:4-5.) However, PLRA
limits the fees recoverable by Plaintiffs to those that are
“proportionately related to the court ordered relief for [a
proven civil rights] wviolation[] or . . . directly and reasonably
incurred 1in enforcing the relief ordered for wviolation.” §§
1997e(d) (1) (B) (i)-(ii) . Defendants do not address this statutory
restriction on fees in this ©portion of their opposition.
Therefore, Defendants’ argument is unpersuasive.

vi. Whether Travel Expenses Should be Reimbursed

Plaintiffs also seek reimbursement for their counsel
and law students’ travel expenses. Defendants do not oppose this
portion of the motion.

Section 1988 “allows for recovery of reasonable out-of-
pocket expenses,” including travel costs, so long as they were

“reasonably expended.” Woods wv. Carey, 722 F.3d 1177, 1180 (9th

Cir. 2013). However, Plaintiffs have not addressed whether the
PLRA’s fee limitation, prescribed in §§ 1997e(d) (1) (A)-(B),
restricts the travel expenses they may recover. See §§
1997e(d) (1) (B) (1) -(1i) (stating “fee[s] [must be] proportionately
related to the court ordered relief for [a proven civil rights]
violation; or . . . directly and reasonably incurred in enforcing
the relief ordered for violation.”). Therefore, Plaintiffs have
not shown they should be reimbursed for travel expenses not shown
to concern the aforementioned pertinent portions of the consent

decree.
22
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Plaintiffs seek the following reimbursements for travel

expenses:

Date Destination Mileage Rate Amount Notes

09/20/13 Marysville 98 56.5 55.37

09/26/13 Sacramento 33 56.5 18.64 Hearing on motion to terminate
consent decree

10/21/13 Marysville 98 56.5 55.37

10/22/13 San Bruno 164 56.5 92.66 National Archives to research
Hedrick court case file

11/12/13 Sacramento 37 56.5 20.90 Meeting at Mexican Consulate

11/25/13 Marysville 98 56.5 55.37

12/06/13 Marysville 98 56.5 55.37

01/17/14 Marysville 98 56.0 54.88

01/31/14 Lower Lake 208 56.0 116.48 Konocti Conservation Camp, to
meet with inmate Perry

02/11/14 Marysville 98 56.0 54.88

02/14/14 Marysville 98 56.0 54.88 Students picked up documents
in response to RFP

02/18/14 Marysville 98 56.0 54.88

02/25/14 Marysville 98 56.0 54.88

Total 744.56

Plaintiffs have not shown that the October 21, 2013
visit to Marysville should be reimbursed, since Plaintiffs do not
seek attorney’s fees for services performed during this visit and
Plaintiffs’ counsel declares that during the wvisit counsel and
law students attempted to “obtain . . . files . . . from
[Plaintiffs’] previous counsel,” a service for which Plaintiffs’
counsel “would not bill a paying client.” (Decl. of Carter White
in Support of Pls.’ Mot. { 12, ECF No. 139-2.) Plaintiffs have
failed to explain whether the meeting at the Mexican Consulate
concerns the relevant portions of the consent decree. Further,
Plaintiffs have not shown that the meeting with inmate Perry

concerns the relevant portions of the consent decree since the

23
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filed Perry declarations do not concern access to legal materials
or female participation in the Jail’s trusty program. (Decl. of
Patrick Perry, ECF 133-1.) Moreover, review of the law student
billing records indicates that Plaintiffs have not shown that the
visits to the Jail on December 6, 2013, January 17, 2014,
February 11, 2014, February 18, 2014, and February 25, 2014,
concerned relevant portions of the consent decree. Therefore,
Plaintiffs have not shown these travel expenses are compensable.

vii. Whether Plaintiffs Are Awarded Fees for Time

Expended on The Fee Motion

Plaintiffs also seek fees for the hours their counsel
expended composing the opening and reply Dbriefs for the
attorney’s fees motion. However, Plaintiffs have not submitted
any evidence concerning the number of hours their counsel
expended on these tasks. Therefore, this portion of the motion is
denied. See Gates, 987 F.2d at 1397 (“The fee applicant
must submit evidence in support of those hours worked.”).

viii. Whether Plaintiffs Are Awarded Interest on

Their Fee Award

Plaintiffs seek an award of interest on their fee
award, arguing interest should begin accruing the date on which
the fee award order issues. Defendants do not oppose this portion
of the motion. Since a party may recover interest on a § 1988 fee

award, this portion of the motion 1is granted. See Spain v.

Mountanos, ©90 F.2d 742, 748 (9th Cir. 1982) (holding that
interest may be awarded on § 1988 attorney’s fees); Jones V.

Cnty. of Sacramento, CIV S-09-1025 DAD, 2011 WL 3584332, at *19

(E.D. Cal. Aug. 12, 2011) (holding that “interest will begin
24
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accruing on plaintiff’s award of fees on the date of this order
-7)
ix. Total Attorney’s Fees Award
For the stated reasons, Plaintiffs’ motion for
attorney’s fees is granted in part. The total attorney’s fees

award 1s: $7,826.60. The award is calculated as follows:

Total
9/3/2013 - 2/28/2014 3/1/2013 -
5/23/2014

Hours Rate Hours Rate
Plaintiffs’ 7.8 5165 .375 5189 $1357.88
Counsel
Law Students 108.34 $55 3.7 563 $6,191.80
Travel Expenses $276.92
Total $7,826.60

Dated: September 5, 2014

7 g L
p C -
Lt € y-, 2/
GARIAND E. BUFRELL, JE.
Senior United States District Judge

25
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APPENDIX 1
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412512014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic
4:19 PM Slip Listing
Slip D User Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Paosting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description Reference Variance :
55441 TIME Berne, Cody 0.20 211.50 42.30
913/2013 /312013 Review 0.00 u
Hedrick 0.00
Review second half of consent decree 0.00
55442 TIME Berne, Cody 0.15 211.50 31.73
9/3/2013 G/3/2013 Draft 0.00
Hedrick 000 [nOtshownto
Write note about potential issues and  <€— goo—jconcern relevant

areas needing additional sesearch,

e T

portions of decree

I e

55443 TIME Berne, Cody 0.35 211.50 74.03
8/3/2013 6/3/2013 Review 0.00 u
Hedrick 0.00
Review materials on Yuba County jail 0.00
\ website including sheriff's message
\\ and sheriif's response;
\ 55444 TIME Berne, Cody 0.55 211.50 116.33
‘\ 9/4/2013 9/4/2013  Review 0.00 u
Hedrick .00
Review PLRA document from Boston 0.00
and write notes
55445 TIME _~~ Berne, Cody—"" 1.00 211.50" 21150
9/4/2013 > 8/4/2013 Meejiﬁg/ 0.00 .~ ~ Y P
v _Megdrick 000"
Meet withh White and Suliman and..~” ~0.00
disedss Hedrick assignment «
55446 TIME Berne, Cody 0.10 211.50 21156
81412013 9/412013 Conf 0.00 u
Hedrick 0.00
Discuss Hedrick assignimeant with 0.00
Suliman re initial assignment on motion
in opposition
55447 TIME Berne, Cody—" 0.70 211.50 _.148.05
9/5/2013 ~7 9/512013  Review™ 0.00 e
N  Hedrick 0.00 .~
Log on laclinic computers; work ,_witﬁ 0.00"
Taylof to access files on G: drive: copy
Hédrick files from G: drive < _ S
PRditshladial ol
55448 TIME Berne, Cody 1.50 211.50 317.25
8/5/2013 9/5/2013 Review 0.00 U
{edrick 0.00
\ Review notes from 09/04 meeting with 0.00
White and Suliman; research Rule 60
\ motion; research PLRA in Boston

\ document; research 18 USC 3626 re

2.7

i 1

Aot T



472512014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic
4:19 PM Slip Listing Page 4
Slip 1D User Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time  Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description Reference Variance
definitions; research ICE materials on
Internet for information on Yuba County
jail; print Agyeman and Andrews cases
55448 . TIME il Berne, Cody _.* 0.05 211.50 _.~—""10.58 _ /,f il
9/5/2013 G203 Conf 0.00 .- AL s
ol Hedrick 0.00 " i
Talk with White're phone call with ~ 0100
Vacek 3bo{ﬁ hearing on 08/23
55450 TIME o~ Beme, Cody.~" 0.10 50 245" T A [
/512013 915/2013 Conf 0.00 .~ U e
| // | ,!ﬂ«efﬁ 0416 a
Discuss tasks fér oppositionto 7 0.00
terminate nfotion memo with Suliman
55451 TIME Berne, Cody 0.20 211.50 42.30
9/5/2013 8/5/2013 Review 0.00 u
Hagrick 0.00
Review Agyeman and Andrews cases 0.00
re analysis of detainee as prisoner
\under PLRA ' /
e
55452 TIME Berne, Cody (.30 211.50 63.45
© o 9/6/2013 8/6/2013 Revise 0.00 ]
Fepdrick 0.00
Edit draft of Suliman’s section of motion -0.00
o tarminate response e
Y 55453 TIME Berme, Cody 0.35 211.50 74,03
9/6/2013 $/6/2013 Research 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00
Use Yuba jail website to research who 0.00
is an immigrant detainee
55454 TIME Berne, Cody 0.40 211.50 84.60
8/6/2013 9/6/2013 Conf 8.00 u
Hedrick 0.00
Email with White re number of 0.00
immigrant detainees at the jail and
ways to calculate the number; six {
emails related to this issue [
55455 TIME Berne, Cody 1.45 211.50 306.68
9/6/2013 Qi612013 Research 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00
Researchfread Agyeman and Andrews 0.00

cases re application of PLRA to
| non-prisoners; shephardize cases

=

2.7
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42512014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic
419 PM Page 5
Shp 1D User Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time  RateInfo
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description Reference Variance _
55458 TIME Bemne, Cody 0.45 211.50 95.18
91612013 91672013 Review 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00
Locate and review Yuba GJ reporis 0.00
about jail
55457 TE Berne, Cody 4.60 211.60 972.90
$i6/2013 81612013 Draft 0.00 u
Hedrick 0.00
Hegin to draft memo in opposition ts | e 0.60 e

Vacek's motion to terminate; finish first \

draft of section re ICE detainees are

___not prisoners

55458 TIME

§16/2013 §16/2013

Finish reading Agyeman opinion and
dissent; write notes about both cases

55459 TIME

9/612013 §/6/2613

Finish reading Andrews opinion and
dissent and write notes about case

55460 TIME

91712013 9f7i2013

Berne, Cody

Edit my section of the memo to reflect
more info learned about 9th Cir
approgceh to PLRA and non prisoners

55461 TIME

O/712013 8/7/2013

Cite check memo, review
Martinez-Mendoz v. Holder re civil
violation for iilegal afiens to be in US

554862 TIME

Q772043 Qf7i2013

Research for California Code of
Regulations not giving more
protections than consent decree

Raview 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00
0.00
Berne, Cody 0.60 211.50 12680
Review G.00 U /
Hedrick 0.00
0.00
Berne, Cody 0.40 211.50 84.80
Revise 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00
0.00 z
Berne, Cody 0.55 211.50 116.33 (
Review 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00
0.00
Berne, Cody 0.25 211.50 52.88
Research 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00
0.00

7.55 q Sg
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Page

41252014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic
419 PM -Slip Listing
Slip 1D User Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time  Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description Refarence Variance
5 = T Berng, Cody 1.45 211.50 306.68
9f712013 Q712013 Revise 0.00 U
i Hedrick 0.00
L Revise memo {o reflect research above 0.00
me——w&———————*" Berne, Cody CTTEn 211.50 190.35
9/7i2G613 QFIZ03 Review (.00 U
Hedrick 0.00
Review past GJ reports for analysis of 0.00
compliance w/ consent decree, reports
from 13, "12.. 11, 10: begin drafiing
section of memo to reflect this
55485 TIME Berne, Cody 1.50 211.50 37.25
/712013 9/712013 Review 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00
Review CCRs for local detention faciity 0.00

info, identify inconsistencies between

the consent decree and GJ reports;

begin to draft section of memo covering

not shown to concern
relevant portions of

this
55466 TIME Berne, Co 211.50 52.88
9712013 Q72013 i u
0.00
Procf and edit these new memo 0.00
sections
55487 TIME 0.35 211.50 74.03
972013 /742013 0.00 U
0.00
Cite check and edit these memo 0.00
sections a second time
e —
E5Ae8 T TINE Berne, Cody 0.30 211.50 63.45
Gi712013 Qi742013 Review 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00
Review ABA 2003 report on the jail andl 0.00
newspaper article about the consent
L decree suit sent by Suliman
55469 TIME Berne, Cody 0.70 211.50 148.05
9i812013 9/8/2013 Review 0.00 U
Hedrick .00
Proof and revise entire memo thus far 0.00
55470 TIME Berne, Cody 0.50 211.50 105.75
9/8/2013 8/8/2013 Review 0.00 8]
. Hedrick 0.00
3.35

e
\f\

8

i;h
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442512014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic
4:19 PM Slip Listing Page
Slip ID User Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est Time  Bill Statue
Descrintion Reference ~Variance not shown to
Review DHS inspection report of jail 000 concern relevant
] . .
from April 112 < portions of decree
55471 TIME T Berne, Cody 1.30 211.50 274.95
9/8/2013 /8/2013 Regearch 0.00 U
) Hedrick 0.00
Research ICE detention facility 0.00
standards: comparg ICE standards w/ not shown to
the consent decree; attempt to <
\ determine whet 1CE classification concern relevant
; siatus applies to the jail portions of decree
{55472 TIME Berne, Cody 0.25 211.50 52.88
' 982013 G/8/2013 Review 0.00 U
\ Heodrick 0.00
Review edits to my memo draft sent by 0.00
Suliman; email w/ Suliman about ICE
research and next steps for memo N\’_____’_j
55473 TIME " Berne, Cody 0.650 211.50 126.90
9/8/2013 8/8/2013 Review 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00 '
Review Title 24 of CCR for building _ 0.00 not shown to
code provisions that may apply to the concern relevant
jail portions of decree
55474 TIME Berne, Cody 0.75 211,50 158.83
9/8/2013 0/8/2013 Revise 0.00 u
Hedrick 0.00
Final edits and revisions/proofread of 0.00
memo, email memo to White and
(\-HSUIiman
58533 TIME Suliman, M. 1.25 211.50 264.38
9/5/2013 6152013 Review 0.00 u
- Hedrick 0.00
\ Read Yuba City's motion to terminate, Q.00 i
CRLA motion to withdraw, researched ‘
PLRA law and read Boston's treaty in
preparafion o draft motion . -
558534 TIME Suliman. M. 545 211.60 1089.23
/512013 9/5/2013 Research 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00
| Research and Draft Motion Reply | 0.00
55535 TIME Suliman, M. 1.50 211.50 317.25
| 9/8/2013 G/812013 | Revise 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00
8.9

A

7
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412512014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic
419 PM Siip Listing Page 8
Slip ID User Units Rate  Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
FPosting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description Reference Variance
Edit partner motion, edit my portion of 0.00
the motion, sent maotion in {o CW
55536 TIME Suliman, Ms 0.40 21450 84.60~ 5
9/9/2013 "7 0912013 Review™ 0. gg,/'“"’ U ,«.f"”ﬁ rf//(j ne.
AEdrick 700
Read ﬁ/aL otion reply submitted by ~0.00
-ﬁ.__\_____\_h’\’_ﬁm '/,———//_-\\
55564 TIME £ Berne, Cody 0.40 211.50 84.6C . -
9/10/2013 8/10/2013  Conf 0.00 U '
Hedrick 0.00
Email White re opposition motion; 0.00
review Vacek motion; research Rule
230¢c
N g _—.—‘-\—-
35665 TIME Berne, Cody .15 211.50 3173
9/10/2013 9/10/2013  Research 0.00 U
Hegdrick 0.00
Research opposition arguments o our 0.60
motion
55566 TIME Berne, Cody 0.65 211.50 137.48
911072013 9/17/2013  Research 0.00 ¥
Hedrick 0.00
Research R 60b5; review Rufo v 0.00

Inmates of Suffolk County re amending
consent decree

55587 TIME Berne, Cody 0.40 A 84.60
8/10/2013 9/10/2013 Review 0.00 U
: Hedrick G.00
Review article Kaleidoscopic Consent 0.00

Decrees re PLRA and crt power to
modify/fterminate consent decree —
1ate consent decree

55568 TIME Berne, Cody 0.70 211.50 148.05
911012013 910/2018  Research 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00
Google and westlaw searches of 0.00

immigrant detainees, PLRA and
consent decree, and research
consequences of consent decree
termination

.

55569 TIME Berne, Cody 0.10 211.50_.— 21.15 _
91072013 """ 911012013 Review” 000 U e oring
MD; 0.00,." g f
Reweuyc( sent decree re counmia” in 00
Moproring: o
2.3 N 72

Joe )
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412512014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic
4:19 PM Slip Listing Page 9
Slip 1D User Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time  Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est Time  Bill Status
Description Reference Mariance _ s - e
55570 TIME Berne, Cody_—~~  0.10 214:50 2415 Carlr > Ner
9/10/2013 /‘JJ{}:ZCHS Conf .~ 0. OO‘”,,/” U - R i<
Hedrck 0.00 {ond
Emait Mitch re/sr/:end@ for tomorrow's.~” 0 00
mcatmg /m!” A Winite
it b A i
55571 TIME -~ Berne, Cogky/ 025 21150 52,88 g -
911112013 .~ g 9/11/2013  Meeti 0.00~" U o i s
H fick 19‘0'6 {44 -
?ﬁee’z_ﬁvf}kfl\%;mh before meeting re 000,
oppostion mofion » . ' i Ve
56572 TIME Berne, Gody 100 _7(150 21450 .
9i11/2013 o~ 9/11/2013  Meefing 0.00- G : LA
P .~ Hedrick L~ 0.00
ieeting with White re case status < 0.00
et Pl
55573 TIME - Berne, (;,oei‘f 0.25 ,}.’ﬁ .50 52 88 ff'z. _f TrA
9/12/2013 /,w”” 971212013 Reyieﬁ! 0.00,.~" U e
,,,,,, - Hedrick 5}6{}
Review email from White re Hed;ick “0.00
critiquds to memo; compare dréfts with IR e
final —
55674 TIME Berne, Cody 1.20 211.50 253.80
9M2/2013 8/12/2013 Research 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00
Research decree and PLRA in .00
westlaw; read Rights of Prisoners Ch
17 by Mushlin; read Benajmin v Fraser,
Carty v. Farrelly, and briefly review
ather case search resulis
55575 TIME o Berne, Cody 0.05 211.50 10.58
9/12/2013 9/12/2013 Research 0.00 u
Hedrick 0.00
\ Research cites to headnote 6 in 0.00
| Vazquez v Carver re immigranis as
| prisoners under PLRA
55576 TIME Berne, Cody 1.40 211.50 286.10
$/12/2013 9/12/2013  Revise 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00
Keycite headnote 6 above, review 0.00
Ciark v California, Hallett v Morgan,
Miller v French
558577 TIVE Berne, Cody 2.15 211.50 454,73 !
\ 9/13/2013 9/13/2013 Research 0.00 U
i Hedrick 0.00
“\ PACER search re other cases involving 0.00
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Department, Yuba County Sheriff
Department, Yuba Coutny Jail [sp
intended]; search google re suits
against Yuba jail; complete PACER

research chart J

412512014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic
4:19 PM Slip Listing Page 10
SliplD . User Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time  Rate Info
Posting Status Client st Time  Bill Status
Description Reference Variance
County and constitutional violations,
made it thru Yuba County Jail hyperlink
when Yuba searched in PACER
business name field; create chart
recerding results of case analysis //
55578 - TIME Berne, Cody 2 21140 52.88
9/13/2013 9/13/2013  Research : ‘
\ 0.00
1 PACER thru second Yuba County, Jail S 0.00 . e
{ link
i 55579 TIME Berne, Cody 0,20 291.50 63.45
\ 9/13/2013 9/13/2013  Research 00 U
\ Hedric 0.20 \
1 PACER thru Yuba County Sheriff link. 7.00
l Yuba County Sheriff Department,
\ 55580 TIME Berne, Gy 075 211.50 158.63
; 9/13/2013 6/13/2013  Resemth 4.00 U
Hedtick 0.00
PACER thru more Yuba County Sherify 0.00
Office, Yuba County Sheriff Steve !
Durfor
55581 TIME Perne, Cody 0.45 211.50 95.18
Gi14/2013 G/14/2013 / Research 0.00 U
Hedrick (.00
{ PACER thru Yuba County Sheriff's. 0.00
’ Department
l 55582 TIME Bepie, Cody 1.20 211.50 253.80
971412013 9/14/2013  Résearch 0.00 U
{ Fledrick 0.00
PACER thru Yuba County Sheriff's 0.00
( Office, Yuba County Sheriffs
!
|

55583 TIME /,/ Berne, _ebay 030 21150 8345 F
9/14/2013 911412013 C?jjf 0.00~ U v ,-/T o
P _Medrick 00 (A
Email ??Wre Yuba PACER rese/grcﬁ < 0.00 !
above, sént chart, saved docs from
F’A on thumb drive to beCopied to

G drive
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412512014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic
419 PM Slip Listing Page 11
Slip 1D User Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time  Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description . Reference Variance . _
55618 THMIE . Suliman, M),/”V 0.40 211, 84.60 )
9/12/2013 /1212013 Review 000 U g AIAC
Hedrlek 0,00 :
Reviewed mofioh edits and final motion 6.00
submitted#6 court
55619 TIME Suliman; M. 2.00 2141.50 423.00
9/15/2013 91512013 Research 0.00 u
Heddck 0.00
Researched cgnstitutipnal violations in 0.00 b
Yuba County Jaii using PACER system '
55620 TIME " fliman, M 100 " 211.50 5 1{;;0 /
vas P ,/'8(" iman, M. 00 21150 211 S g
91612013 L 8162003  Review 060 U .~
—"‘ ## Hedrick 0,00 e
i 0.00 i

P .
Reviewged baﬂne;:g/geaﬁ;ﬁ regarding
constit(itional violatiohs in Yuba County

unt”

al
55647 TIME Berne, Cody 0.20 211.50 42.30
9/18/2013 9/18/2013 Review 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00
Review emails from White, Mitch re 0.00
| rescheduled Hedrick meeting and
iasues in Hedrick, reply w/ availability
and additional questions
/ 55648 TIME Berne, Cody 0.15 211.50 3173
i 9/18/2013 9/18i2013  Conf 0.00 U
/ Fgdrick 0.00
| Email White PACER search resufts and 0.00
brief message re helpful cases located
via PACER
M ———
55649 TIME Berne, Cody 0.10 211.50 21.15
9/18/2013 8/18/2013  Conf 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00 -
Emails w/ White re contacting parties 3.80 IClencal |
involved in litigation against Yuba
55650 TIME .~ Berne.-Gody 0.10 271,50 2146 ; ‘ /
911812013 " 9/18/2013 __.eonf 0, v ® N s
i ol " Hedrick ~6.00 ' Latplns
Email“taylor re requesting feri letter 0.00
{6f inmate contacts
55651 TIME _Berne, Cody 0.25 __.-211.50 288 X
9/18/2013 9/18/2043" Research Joe0” u_ " I 44
LT Hedrick //“” 0.00 = ‘
Use CDCR inmate-o€ator to find Perry. PP 0.00
2.35
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4{25/2014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic
418 PM Slip Listing Page 12
Siip 1D User Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time  RateInfo
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description Reference Variance
create task list to organize next steps in
Hedrick
56652 TIME Berne, Cody 70,80 /2;1450" 16920
9/19/2013 le{ZQ'&"f Research .~ 000 7 U 7 / G| el
P Hedrick.~" 0.00- b
Copy Hedrick PACE,-fdc}wniaads and - 400
chart to G: drive réview files in other
Yuba County-Cases folder on G: drive
55653 TIME - Befne, Col 4. p 0,25 214750 52,88 )
9119/2013 91912073  Review 000 " U !, ;
P Hedgick™ 0.00 CAE, 1£67)
Review ED Cal R 181<tSegin and " 0700
cancel email to Taylor about
certification; discuss certified law
student stdtus w/ White e —————
— éoc ki e
55654 TIME Berne, Cody 0.05 211.50 10.58
8/18/2013 9/19/2013  Review 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00
Review Hedrick docs in memos and ¢.00
notes folder
55655 ‘Berne, Cody A~ 0,25 21160 527 C )QJ,-*H‘
8/19/20 9/19/2013 eview 0.00 /,/“ U P ; e
Heds 0.00.~ ' o Aepeed]
Review Hedrick docs from 1’565« copy 0:00 <2
0 thumbdrive, read pg28-29 of consent
cle-“ree review ietters*fotder in G: drive
55656 TIME Berne, Cody 0.65 211.50 137.48
9/19/2013 8/19/2013  Review 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00
Review example declarations posted o 0.00
Smartsite, research Rule 50, R27a4
55657 TINE Berne:Cody 0.10.— 211.50_—~" 21.15 {ff £
9/19/2013 9/19/2013 _eonf 0700 v N
e """ Hedrick 000
I;méil from White re discovery”™ 7 0.00
“guestions we should pufsue
55658 TIME Berne, Cody 0.50 211.50 105.75
81972013 8/19/2013  Meeting 0:00 U
Hedrick 0.00
Meet w/ White re Hedrick hearing next (.00
week
1.2
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4/25/2014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic
4:18 PM Slip Listing Page 13
Slip 1D User Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time  Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description Reference Variance o
55659 TIME .. Beme, Cody .~ 0.60 24150 126:90
9/19/2013 9/19/2043" Prep Cr;e// 0.00 " U s e 1e0A
<4 Hedri 0.00° Lo
Print files, chart, motion A7 use at jail " 0,00
meeting tomorrow; check Immigratjen 7
Clinic letters a rﬁét people Eii'
Yuba Jail; ypdate to do hst/ﬁfﬁeak
briefly wf ﬂch about jail iNterviews
tomorrow -
i 55660 TIME ' Berne, Cody 0.60 941.50 126.96
| Q202013 8/20/2013 Review 0.00 u
Hedrick 0.00
\ Review my section of response motion 0.00
\ review Agyeman v. INS J
TE662 TIME Berme. Cody 030 BB TT
912172013 972172013 Conf 0.00 U
Hedrick ¢.00
Email w/ White re 8th Amend issues in 0.00 not shown to
Perry claim vt OTIEVaTTCE Procettre i concern relevant
jait manual portions of decree
55663 TIME -~ JBeme, Cody 0.4Q 21150~ 84.60 )
812172013 f,,./ 9f2“1!g,04f3’/ Draft " 0.00 _W,,,.»'"”" u //’” _,-f-*( SLs,
e s Hedrick 000" )
Creale discovery wish list,email to “70.00
White and Mitch
55664 TIME Berne, Cody 0.60 211.50 126.890
912112013 912172013 Draft Q.60 U |not shown to
Hedrick 0.00
Braft msmio e st ik i concern relevant
___Corona-Chavezatjait ___  —o ] portions of decree
85665 TIME Berne, Cody 1.30 211.50 274.95 \
612112013 9/21/2013  Review 0.00 U ?
Hedrick 0.00
Re-read Vacek motion; re read and 0.00
ouiline my section of response; review {
Andrews and Agyeman cases, [
( 556606 TIME Berme, Cody (.55 211.50 116.33 1\
9/21/2013 912172013 Review 0.00 U
Hledrick 0.00
I Review ICE detention standerds re 0.060
library access, materials; finish
argument outline and review argument
L outline \‘J
2.45 4 2.7
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42512014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic
419 PM Slip Listing Page 14
Slip ID User Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Pasting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description 5 Reference L~~Xanance e .
55732 TIME e Suliman, M.~ 0.50 211.50 10575 {0
971912013 " 9119/2013  Meeting” 000" U .~ ok
i _Hedrick 100 CO¥ T
Weekly Meefing with CW " 0.00
55734 TIME Suliman, M. 0.90 211.50 160.35
9872013 9/19/2013 Review 0.00 U
tedrick 0.00
Reading case files & leiters for 0.00
.| potential inmates to interview at Yuba e
Jail '
8/20/2013 8/20/2013  Meeting 0.00 Oth 'f" d visi Lo 6
Hedrick 0.00 ther unspecified visit aCtIVItIES( -
Yuba County Jail Visit | < 0.0012.5 = 3.5 hrs)
Eggan — % Cody~ " 12.5% of unspecified jail visit
h 2me, L ' —
gf24)r2013 Jﬂ/""ﬂ ----- 9!24”,2013 EQM'M O-OQ Compensable (35 X 125 - 4375)
.~ Hedrick _e00|Total compensable = 2.5 + .4375 =
CWMC email, email 'Mit(:l}R—!’%Sk " 0.00(2.094
Jigt for Hedrick meeting tomefrow o
SR R
{’/-55821 TIME Berne, Cody 0.65 211.50 137.48
912412013 9124/2013 Meeting 0.00 U
\ Hedrick 0.00
Practice oral argument for motion sel 0.00
\ for Thursday
\ssBer—TWIE Berne, Cody _—— 020 21150~ 4230  ,
o/242013 7 9/24/2013.~Research. 000 —" U _ XYL
i s He /d;_";g‘k’ /Q.g@ﬁl
Research Judge Burrel},‘ba‘(ifground o “0.00
apdrepLialion using,goagle ___|# of entries = 2 (reread mot.; review
"~ 55823 TIVE Berne, Cody 0.70[Statute and privileges)
91252013 /2512013 Review 0.00|[Reread mot. = compensable (.7
Hedrick 0.00 X .5 = 35)
Reread Vacek motion to terminate; o.0of . .
reread our response motion; review 28 | R(_ev_lew statute and recreation
USC 1915 and recreation privileges privileges not shown compensable.
55 Tz’{»;;/” Berne, Cody m §.
9/26/2013 - 9/25/2013.~ Prepare _~"0.00 U s d e i)
P " Hedrick " 000 Ct A
Copyfiles to G: drive; photgcopy e 000 7
;pc{nsent decree; begin-6 outline
“argument for hearing
4.84
Q 1 S

o)
(7 *

o
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4/25/2014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic
4:19 PM Slip Listing
Slip ID User Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description Reference \ariance i
55825 TIME Berne, Co }3«96
9/25/2013 ;

CRLA extra-€opies folder; speak w/
White gbout potential issues at hearing
to
55826 TIME ‘Berne, Cody 1.00
9/25/2013 9/25/2013 Meeting 0.00
Hedrick 0.00
Meet w/ White and Mitch re Hedrick 0.00
hearing tomorrow
55827 TIME Berne, Co 0.05
9/25/2013 Con 0.00
Hedrick 0.0
0.00
erne, Cody 0.25
Prepare
Hedri
55829 TIME Berne, Cody 0.10
9/25/2013 9/25/2013  Conf 0.00
Hedrick 0.00
Emails from White, Mitch re hearing 0.00
tomorrow
55830 TIME Berne, Cody 0.95
9/25/2013 9/25/2013  Prepare 0.00
Hedrick 0.00
Prepare for argument; review jail 0.00
handbook
55831 TIME Berne, Cody 1.65
9/26/2013 9/26/2013  Travel 0.00
Hedrick 0.00
Commute to court; morning preparation 0.00
for the hearing; meet w/ White and
Mitch before the hearing
55832 TIME Berne, Cody 1.50
9/26/2013 9/26/2013 Hearing 0.00
Hedrick 0.00
Hearing on motion before Judge Burrell 0.00

211.50

211.50

Page 15

¢ RLA

.“.

= =il 2 X¢.

211.50
U

211.50
U

211.50
u

211.50
U

21.15

200.93

348.98

317.25

11.50 ; .
/g;g»g/z U/M &(6’/'5@"/\
0.00

5.2

b b
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412572014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic
419 PM Slip Listing Page 16
Slip 1D User Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time  Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est Time  Bill Status
Description Reference Variance
and discussion afterward w/ White and
iteh
55833 TIME  Bee; Cody A0 21150 84807 £V [,
9/26/2013 et 9i26/2013 .~ Travel 7000 7Y e
e " Hedrick " 0.00.~"
Walk jeCar and commutepgrﬁé from 0.00
heafing ‘
55834, TIME Berne, Cody 3R 211.50 [not shown to
9262013 9/26/2013  Conf 0.060

concern relevant
Hedrick

Email w/ White and Mitc 0.00 portions of decree
visits w/ inmates
55835 _HWE -~ Berne, Cody” 0.45 _211.50 9548 .
912712043 92712013 Review o.gy/ TR LKC,
o~ I ~Hedrick A0 3
Ré/ad Lin memo rgatfomeyr‘ciiéntf.\ﬁgi/ts 7 0.00
¢and read brief filed in Nevada County
Superior crt re‘this issue e : ————
55836 TIME Berne, Cody 1.10 211.50 23285
j 9/27i12013 9/27/2013 Review 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.Q0
l Review Hedrick pleadings docket 0.00
numbers 57, 58, 77: compare 57
/ consent decree to 109 and 110
consent decree; update RFP/ANT
e
55809  EXP CRC _— 1 _sr2 a0 £ XD
912012043 912012043 $Mileage i - 7
s ’/’/' ~AHedrick
Mﬁeage to ccnduct/c)ien’f research af
Yuba County Jail.”
55803 TIME Suliman, M. 4.00 211.50 8486.00
9232013 92312013 Research 0.00 U
( : Fedrick 0.00
Develop outline of Oral Argument, 0.00
re-read all motions submitted, research
l J. Burrell background, case disposition,
| study the case in preparation for oral
\ argument
75804 TIME Suliman, M, 1.70 211.50 359.55
G/24i2013 912412013  Prepare 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00
Anticipate questions that could be 0.00

asked by the Judge, anticipate /

—  —68 6)(_\
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412512014 King Hall Civit Rights Clinic _
2:19 PM Slip Listing Page 17
Stip ID User Units Rate Siip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time  Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description Reference ___Variance
responsesfargument by opposing
counsel
I
m Sufiman, M. 3.00 211.50
§/25/2013 §/25/2013  Prepare 8.00 U
Hedrck 0.00
Study Oral Argument material (consent 0.00
decree, outline), Rehearse Oral
Argument
55908 TIME Suliman, i, 4.00 211.50 846.00 =
9/26/2013 0/26/2013  Hearing 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00
Oral Argument in Federal Court 0.00

(include preparation the morning of and
full time spent in cowrt)

56946 IME P Berne, Cody 010 _.2%1.50 2457 i, Ll
/3012613 973012013 Gg/rgﬁ 0.00." u G L
£ " Médrick G0 '
:_/ég}a%is from Mitchand White re  »" 0.00
Hubbard release petition
R
55g47 - TIME Berne, Cody 3.25 211.50 B887.38
f/ 10/1/2013 10/1/2013  Research 0.00 U
| Hedrick 0:00
{ Research for cases and claims about 0.00

constitutional violations at jails; review
Padron v. ICE; review WA Post article
called Careless Detention re ICE
detainees; review Bell v, Wolfish;
search for DOJ investigations of jails

55948 - TIME _~Berne, Cody 405 21450 .« 10.58" ,
10/1/201 10/1/2073  Conf 7000 g P LGS
; Hedrick .~ 0.00 " S ,
%maii Mitch about task-ist for Hedric o _M,Qc'ﬁﬁ’ LN
~meeting :
e B ——- A
55949 TIME " Berne; Cody 020 _~2T1.50 82307 f ¢,
101172018 " 10/1/2013_~Revise 00" T FL1SC
Nl " Hedrick - 0.00
Update list of ideas for RFP-&nd INT 0.00
55950 TIME Berne, Cody 0.40 211.50 84.60
10/1/2013 10/1/2013  Research 0.00 U
Hledrick 0.00
Research secondary sources re 0.00

conditions of confinement for pretrial
and ICE detainees

T s eI e [0,k

L5 1
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4/2512014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic
419 PM Slip Listing Page 18
Slip 1D User Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est Time  Bill Status
Description Reference Variance i
55951 TIME .~ _.~ Berne, Cody 0.10 24750 2TAB
10/1/2013 -7 10112073 Copf” 000 " U 7 e,
_ / e /,.H’édr-;ck 0,00 ! T o
Email Mitch Bell case arid fink to WA ~0.00
Post-<eries .
55952 TIME~" Besfie, Cody 0.05 211,50 1058 [ o 1¢ &
100172013~ 101172013~ Conf Fe 000 U - A\ Gl
) e He.dV 0 E%// P
Emagiignd prnt task list and RFPANT ' Qa0 0 -
updates ' ' ' I SR e s i {
T e
f’_ 55853 TiME Berne, Cody Q.80 211.50 168.20
il 10/172013 10/1/2013 zevieu\:: ggg u
tedric! :
; Review Ashby deposition in Hedrick file 5-66 not shown to
to pg 45 <— concern relevant
: N portions of decree
55954 TIME Berne, Cody 2.25 211.50 475.85
10/1/2013 16/1/2013  Conf 0.00 u
Hedrick 0.00
Discuss wi White class membership, 0.00
contact clerk's office at ED to locate
files; review Dkt 57 to 77 for info about
class membership, and any
modifications to consent decree; draft
email to Vacek re stipuiation io dkt 57
as original copy of consent decree;
speak wi Taylor re calendaring and file
locations
55955 TIME~" Berner Cody .05 211.50 " 10.58"" y A
10212013, 10/2/12013.—Conf e 0.00 el - Ao A
el " Hedrick_." 0.00 " )
Email Taylor Hedrick Eg;h&ﬁuiing dates g 0.60
55956 TIME _~—  Beme, Cody " 1.00 211,50~ 21180~ otk §C
10/2/2013 401212013 Meeting‘_,,«-f/ 0.00 U e &
/,//" Hedrick 0.0Q/”/ ff:,ﬁg'm}\ il
Weekly Hedriek meeting w/ White and 0.00
MS oL
55957 TIME Berne, Cody
107212013 10/2/2013  Conf
Hadrick
Discuss work distribution w/ Mitch after
meeting T
85958 TIME Berne, Cody
10/3/2013 10/3i2013  Conf 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00

2.3
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412512014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic
4:19 PM Slip Listing Page 19
Slip 1D User Units Rate Slip Value

Dates and Time Activity DONB Time Rate Info

Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status

Description Reference Variance

Phone call from Becky at clerk's office 0.00

re obtaining records; email White re chlerical |
this issue, and search National <
Archives for Hedrick records SRR e

55959 TIME Berne, Cody .15 211.50
107372013 10/3/2013 Conf 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00
Second call from clerl’s office, call < R

ubtaining files

‘\ National Archives and feft message re

55960 . TIME e Berne, Cody 0.05 21180 _"1C :
10,*3;'2013 101372013 Copf” 0.00~ A : 7
A _Aedrick 00
{:n‘-afis from Whité re Hubbard statug ~" 0,00
and Burrell sfinute order
55961 TIME . Berne, Cody .~ 0.60 214-50 126907 A
10/4/2013 167412013 Review -~ 000 o~ U, 4 kLA

M( Hedsi 0.00"
Review email fro ite re RFP, INT, 7 000

and tasks for thf§ week: download dpc’é
re RFP ape Mantoan sample RFP?
reseapeh re lawyer obligation tefgwe

fi ie/ﬁ new lawyer; review ethics
oplmons re this issue sent by While

55067 TIME -~ Berne, Cody - 310 - 211,507 65565 o A
10/42013 " 10/4/2013 _Résearch 000 U o CAKC. B
- Hedrick~" 0.00," L

2 e

Researcli Newbelg Cla.:(ctmns e B0
CERA duty to give us the-file; rese:;?/
“CalJur and Westlaw- rore gegz?J or
same issue; begif to write of nd

algumepro{t of CI_JR'A giving us
all files,.email draft to- s

Ty |
55963 TIME Berne, Cody - 055 211, 50" 116.33 L ({1’ i ,‘-"-7_-
10/4/2013 10/4/20437 Drait s 0.00 U '
e Hedrick .~ 0.00, A
Finalize draft; rasearc@,fef more /,/‘ ,OrO'U
current'case law in sdpport of e

argument; rewe\n?ﬁutter Guide for ,*”
attorney oi;,hg"ﬁnans upon termination of

represerntation
e ; o iz A
55964 TIME il Berne, Cody L4 211.50 _~256.10 ( fﬁ t rl
10/412013 fm’ 4/2013  Conf _~0.00 u_~~ '
Medrick 7 0.00 o
Email from MS J,fa'(fl RA produciion e 0.00 ™

-~
- .

A=
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412512014 King Hali Civil Rights Clinic
4:18 PM Slip Listing Page 20
Slip 1D User Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNBTime  Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description Reference Variance
and RFP; edit RFP and email reply to
MS; review rules cited in RFP;
research Yuba Sheriff's Annual Reports
for other RFP ideas; review FRCP 34,
review Rutter Guide re FRCP 34
55965 TIME Berne, Cody,~ 0.60 ,241’"’ 0 126.90~ { o /
10/512013” 10/5/20 Rewexg/ 0.00 " g LA Cy L%
- Hegiritk Q.00
-read and ¢lie. check 9ref";}rder fix ~0.00 )
problems wi CRC ll"mw..«c amail
order to White
559686 TIME Berne, Cody 0.55 211.50 116.33
10/5/2013 10/5/2013  Draft 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00 not shown to

Write letter to Perry asking to meet"aw concern relevant
discuss his past complaint against portions of decree

Yuba Jail; emailed to Cappy for edits

56020 TIME Suliman, M. 3.20 211.50 876.80
10/3/2013 10/3/2013  Research 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00
Researched RFPs and reviewed 0.00
;J;ffﬁ;;gtoi?fts of RFPs in preparation 12.5% shown compensable
Total Compensable =5.55 |
56021 TIME Suliman, M, X .125 = .69
10/4/2013 10/4/2013 Draft B
0.00
Wrote the Draft of the RFP 0.00
!
56022 TIME Suliman, M. 0.75 211.50 158.63 (
10/6/2013 10/68/2013 Revise 0.00 12.5% shown Compensab|e
el 099 |Total Compensable = .75
Edited the RFP and prepared it for final /ETUD'_ P :
submission x.125 =.09
T
56040 TIME Berne, Cody 0.35 211,50 74.03 {
10/7/2013 10/7/2013  Review 0.00 12.5% shown compensable
Hedrick 0.00 )
Review RFP from Mitch a second time M— Total Compensable = .35
reply to Mitch's email re REP x.125=.04
56041 TIME Berne, Cody 0.05 211.50 10.58 f
10/8/2013 10/8/2013 Conf 0.00 not shown to concern
Hedrick 0.00 | t fi fd
Email from White re letier to Perry <— oo |felevant portions or decree
! B |
L'_“"‘—'x-__._h‘_“____ e i {:'
4.02 N L
juwfj
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4/25/2014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic
4:19 PM Slip Listing Page 21
Slip ID User Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description e Reference _— Variance _—
56042 TIME Berne, .50 10.58
10/9/2013 10/9/2013  Co U [ ASe
edrick .
0.00 co N[ .
Berne, 13748 \
/2013 Rewi /3?( (,[e/zu/f

edrick

not shown to
concern relevant
portions of decree

56044 TIME
10/9/2013

11.50 18 LaSl

56046 TIME
10/10/2013

yesterddy; revise letter to CR

56047 TIME
10/10/2013

56048 TIME Berne, Cody 0.55 12.5% shown compensable
10/14/2013 10/14/2013 Conf 0.00 Total Compensable = .55
Hedrick 00 —
Email from MS re updated Hedrick 0oo [X.125=.07
RFP; review updated RFP

56049 TIME
10/12/2013

211.50 253.80 '
y’/ 185G,

Review
smartsjté for background
to thgse steps in Hedrick’case

.07 ]bg
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|
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submission

10/11/2013  Revise 0.00 Jcompensable
Hedrick 0.00 [ ol C ble=2.5
RFP edits and revised for final 0.0 |lolal Compensable = 2.
A x.125=.31

412512014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic

4:19 PM Slip Listing

Slip 1D User Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est Time  Bill Status
Description Reference Variance

56157 TIME Suliman, M. 2.50 [12.5% shown
10/11/2013

HME— Berne, Cody

10/14/2013

Read Walls deposition to pa f_ 149
read Rule 30, research Judgs

10/14/2013 Review 3‘0'0 relevant portions of decree
| 0.00 _ _

2.45 |not shown to concern

.....

T

56163 Berne, Cody
10716/2013 /,mf’ 52013 Conf "
Hegdrick
Efail from White r& CRLA reply letter —
56164 TIME Berne, Cody
10/15/2013 7 10/15/2013 Coni—"
y ik drick
Emails fromfitch and White re C

responsg and task i:si for t?‘ns

fst: draft rephy

fter to CRLA and epfail to Mitch and
ite
55165 TIME Berne, Cody
10/16/2013 / 101812013 Béwew
" Hedrick

Finish re i'rfllg/ Walls deposatwp “email

to White're trip to CRLA office; speak

w/ Tavlor re about flest gar; speak w/
& about responsefo CRLA;

/esearch background of Vicki Cody and
11

ene Jacobs at CRLA; print directions

i 0.05

0.00
0, ﬁ{’!/’ﬂ

~0.00

175 24150 37043

0.00." U o
)er.@%/ vl

~0.00

1.45
0.00 n
0.0

00

21450 30668
U i

o CRLA office

e

56168
10/16/2013

ThiE Berne, Cody
10/16/2013 Review
Hedrick
Review Pellett deposition; research
consent decree for whether CRLA's

address must be provided to prisoners

‘\hﬁ M

10162013~ 10/16/2013 Meeting
o ,ivi&dr;(:k

Page 22

o BLA

SO

not shown to concern
relevant portions of decree

- 0.60 414’"’50 ,,,,, LQ -3 ¥
U/‘,,,,_-..V .......
‘ o

31




RIS SPEER B

10/17/2013 7 10/17/2013 _Research
7 _"Hedrick "
Locate PD¥S office and CRLA-tffice on =

my mags i

4/25/2014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic
4:19 PM Slip Listing Page
Slip 1D User Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time  Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description o _ Reference Variance
Weekly Hedrick meeting w/ White and 0.00
Mitch ,,/Jﬂk i -
56168 TIME B Berne, Cody.—"" 0.05 214607 10,587 P f’
10/16/2013 ~710/16/2013 Conf . 000 .~ U AN
- W art .
o Hedfick 0.00 f’
Discuss work division w/ Mitch 000
56169 TIME " Berne, Cody 0.10_—211.50 2115 ;
1052013 " 10/16/2013 Conf” . e CRLA
; " Hedrick 7 000 /,'M’"
Mulii p!@eﬁzaifs from White j@eﬁiﬁ 7 0.00-
letter” contacts for ACLU~
66170 TiIME~" Berne,-€ody 0.10 211.50 245 oy A
104167201 10/16/2013_.Conf 09,0»/“”’” u (»" Q‘”'K]
’ L~ Hedrick 000 ‘
Emm: Taylor re car for drive’fo T no00
{——CRLA. email White-re-visitto- CRIEA clerical |
58171 TIME Berne, Cody 211.50 84.680
10/17/2013 1011712013 Conf 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00
( Emails to National Archives; attempt to 0.00
locate alternative email address for
Archives after address given bounced
g iy e
56172 TIME Berne, Cody 0.20 |# of entries = 2 (check
10/17i2013 10/17/2013 Review 0.00 email (clerical); review
Hedrick 0.00 f H - K
Check clinic email, and review notes nOteSf rom Henric
from Hedrick meeting: research meeting (not shown to
contacts for Yuba Public Defender; concern relevant portlons
ieave phone message to have Yuha
PD call me of decree))
56173 TIME Berne, Cody 0.0~ 21180 21457 P,
1011772013 7 1011772013 Conf- .00 L O KL
- _~"Hedrick 0.00 - )
Email White pe’ft'inging copfifea’é’f 0.00
prisone; fiers to CRLAeffice
56174 TIME Berne, Cody 005~ 21180~ 1058 C ]8(.,

,.w"'/ 0.00 /w"/" ¥ e

0.00”

.00

23
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412512014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic
419 PM Slip Listing Page
Slip 1D User _ Units Rale Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNBTime  Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description Reference Variance
56175 *  TIME Berne, Cody 0.35 211.50 74.03
HOHFH2OTS B 72618 Coni 0.00 u
Hedrick 0.00
Speak wi Brian Davis, Yuba County 0.00
PD, by phone about jail
56176 TIME Berne, Cody 0.50 211.50 105.75
1011772013 10/M17/2013 Prepare 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00 -
Copy letters from CRLA, organize < 600 I ) |
letters by year; email from Taylerre D S
fleet car for tomorrow e e
il I
rwd TIME Berne, Cody 0.75 211.50
10M17/2013 10/17/2013 Draft 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00
K. Write memo to file re conversation with 0.00
Brian Davis; print memo and email to
White and Mitch \H
56178 *©  TIME Berne, Cody 0.40 211.50 84 .60 \
10/17/2013 10/17/2013 Conf 0.00 U k
Hedrick 0.00
Speak with Melanie Louie at Natl 0.00
Archives about visit next Tuesday, i
emailed White and Mitch about  <&— @
possible visit to Archives
—_—
56179  AIME Berne, Cody .~  1.10 /;w 50 232785
10181203 el 81201 38 vieW 0.00 - s e
edricls 0,007 P L RGCA
view emails fro ?(g\lhlte re CRLA .00
etter; read White's letter; emails frum ,/
White re vi to Archives afid CRLA;
review apd reply to Louie's email about
Archives visit; emaib Taylor re reserving
fleet car for Tuesday visit to Archives
56180 TIME -~ _Berne, Cady,, 076 21150 15863
1019/2013 7 10/18/2043” Trave! 0.00,~ U s D
: ,/ s Hedrick /;wo A CRLA
Travel to.efinic from horr}e't”/zck up " K
docket’sheet from Wﬂ/e before
travelmg to CREA on Monday
56261 TIME _Siliman . 0.50 _~"211.50 //"“”’.‘1053,?/5’/ & l? LA
10/15/2013 /,/ 10:151,-04"5 Revigw 008" T N G
_Hedrick _0.00 P
Review Il;?erfmm CRLA r&t{estm 7 0.00
clinic & nfidentiality request
1.10 5 (;}

24
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4/25/2014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic
419 PM Slip Listing Page 26
Slip 1D User Units Rale Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DN8 Time  Rate Info
Posting Siatus Client Est. Time  Sill Status
Description Reference Variance -
56262 _FTME - Suliman,AiT 0.50 L2150 0675 P ,f\‘J‘ 1 A-
1o/ 152613 /1(5,151201 3 /}ie%éw 000" U, NG
Hedrick 60 e
/’Rewew letter sybitted to CRL,&\/ <7 0.00
submitting Hédrick files
66263 TIME Suliman, M. 0.60 211.50 126.80
1001612013 10/16/2013 Draft 0.00 U
frledrick 0.00
Drafted and subimiiiad email to ACLU 0.00

reguesting assistance for Yiiba County
Jail Discovery

T

56264 TIME Suliman, M. ,,,M"‘-(}.'t-}!i 2 1;§,{)»"” 95.48" ) / g
mnmo /3/ 10/17/2013—Réview 000 U i P Boaly Gl
/// Hedr:ck/ 0.00" /
Rﬂéﬁ Cody s summary of gdistussion 060
“With Yuba County PD ="
56265 T!ME/“ _Sufiman, M b 0.50 M.(,M»ﬁo 10575’ 2 /} i ﬂ =
10;5’8:201(§/ 1041 8_12913 Review..~" 0.00.~ U e A=
i Ifledﬁ 0100 i e shac,
Read and reviewed Prpﬁf\mi{e s leiter ! =< 0.00
résponse submitted€o-CRLA————— BT
56266 °  TIME Suliman, M. 0.40 211.50 sqm
1041872013 107182013 Conf 0.00 U
Hedrick .00
\ Several emails to Cody/Prof White 0.00
| coordinating visit to Marysville and San
L@Wﬁ
)63,6?*“" L~ TIVE . Suliman, M. . 010 211,50~ 21.15 - Or A
zmma };2172013 Conf " 000 U - - CALS
Hegmck’ 0.00~ %
i Can to Cody whliefﬁe waa at CRLA for” ~0,00
status update” 's
56268 . TIME Sulimian, M.~ 0.40 214450 8460 . ..
10/212013 1012112043 Review 0.00 " 4 _ L &
W - P Hedn;k 0.00 I
" Read and reviewed Cody's-sGmmary of »* "0.00
visit to GRLA ‘
56269 TIME -~ Suliman, M. _"0.05 21150 1058 2
10/21/2013 _ABI2172013  Conf ,,M” 0.00 u_~ grf"ff-:--;;«f-’
e Hedrick .~ 0.00 B
Email Cody to {gr!fher coordinate visit to P 0.00 '

San Bruno/Nafional Archives

Sy
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4/25/2014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic
4:19 PM Slip Listing Page 26
Slip ID User Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description Reference Variance
56270

211.50 473
/“/) CRUA

Hedrick

garding confidenti
and clinic visit today

Berne, Cody
10/21/2013 Conf
Hedric

56320 TIME
10/21/2013

Check emdils and letter from CRLA re
access CRLA files &
56321 TIME Berne, Cody
10/21/2013

CRLA
, /ﬁs

56322 TIME
10/21/2013 0/21/2013 Conf

Emails to Mitet'and White re CRL/
visit, and visit to Archives

56323 TIME Berne, Cody BAS 211.50 1364.18
10/22/2013 10/22/2013 Drive 0.00 U 6}( C
Hedrick 0.00 :
~Save-Dkt-print-outfrom-Whiteto 0.00

drive to San Bruno and National
Archives; locate missing papers in
Archive files; return to Davis, return
fleet car, walk back to campus
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4/25/2014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic
4:19 PM Slip Listing Page 27
Slip ID User Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description Reference Variance
56324 T3 Berne, Cody

VA

10/22/201 10/22/201

# of entries: 2 (check items have
been copied (.45hrs); draft letter
56325 TIME Berne, Cody 0.90 |(.45hrs)).
10/23/2013 [ °,,10/23/2013 Draft Entry 1: Check items have been
o 0.00 [copies = Clerical
" |Entry 2: Draft letter = Compensable

Check that items retrieved from CRLA
have been copied to H: drive; write

draft of form letter to Yuba inmates Total compensable = .45 hrs.
requesting information about jail
conditions
211.50 .50 CASE
(o {

/a»zfa' C'/KL_A—

56328 TIME

rne, Cody 0.15 : /’u)a‘ .
10/24/2013 Review 0.00 U . C ﬁ A
Hedi 00
Revi 0.00
fo om

White and M
56329 TIME 50 .
10/24/2013 /mr (_,121,/'\‘

files
56330 TIME Berne, Cody 0.20 211.50 42.30
10/25/2013 10/25/2013 Review 0.00 U
edrick 0.00
Review and reply to Mitch's letter to all 0.00

Yuba jail inmates requesting
information about jail conditions

.65
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4/25/2014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic
419 PM Slip Listing Page
Slip ID User Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description Reference Variance
56412 TIME Suliman, M. 0.45 211.50 95.18
10/23/2013 10/23/2013 Review 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00
Reviewed all files from Archive visit 0.00

10/24/20

56413 TIME
4/2013

0.00

56416 TIME Suliman, M. 0.30 211.50 63.45
10/24/2013 10/24/2013 Draft 0.00 u
Hedrick 0.00
Drafted email to ACLU for discovery 0.00
purposes and reviewed previous ACLU
emails
56417 TIME Suliman, M. 0.80 211.50 169.20
10/25/2013 10/25/2013 Revise 0.00 U
edrick 0.00
Edited Cody's original letter to inmates, 0.00

converted it to a flyer for distribution to
inmates for discovery purposes

56448
10/29/201

0.00

additional legal support

1.55 \'55

385 /2118 ?aé CPLA
00

i'lr &

28

Suliman, M. 0 55 11.50
raft "l K CA
ck 0 00

bfi.

3115 1.50 % CELA’
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412512014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic
419 PM Slip Listing Page 29
Slip 1D User Units Rate Slip Vaiue
Dates ahd Time Activity DNB Time  Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description Reference Variance
56449 TIME.~ _Beme, Cody " 1.40 214:50 232765 ,
1072012013, g 10/29/2043 Review .~ 000 7 U il A1 A
Hedrigk” 0.087 «_-_«:Ik
%ad and edit draft order to Qo
rovjee fles
56450 TIVE Berne, Cody 0.15 |notshown to concern
1072872013 10/29/2013  Draft _ relevant portions of decree
t 0.00
Create and email task list 1o White Bnd 0.00
Suliman; raview emais from Yhite and
Suliman re CRLA files and draft order
5t FHAE —————=_ Berne, Cody—" 0.05 ;um : w058~ CRL A
103012013 /wm’&zms Review” 0.00 u :
O'ﬁ/ Ht‘-!drzck 0,90 ok
ReView emails frori White re CRLA ~” “0.00
Aetter ¥ o
...... e & a4
56452 b,«ﬂm& e, Cody 1.00 ;m/ 0 241750 A= )
10!3 2013 10/30/2013- eetmg 0.00 U _ £
30 - Hednﬁ/ O)Dg” < Lo,
We ki /H/ drick meeting w!)ﬁeﬂ{lte and .~ 0.00
Suli
56453 T Berne, Cody 807 211,507 21,48 A2 A
10@6;2013/ ol 10/30/2013 Review 7 e00 U CKLA
7 ~Hedrick 7 0.00
R%ma:!s from White and Jacobs // Q. 06/
re CRLA providing jail ieiteg;wa’ﬁd
CRLA funding concerns: reply to White
email
56454 TIME~ Beme, Cody.~— 1.20 241750 253,80”" ¢ L.
1013012013~ 1013012073 Review” 0.00 " U &
Vi Hedrick 000 ¢
Read K/ 98, CRLA res;aﬁnse to /’0 Q0

of Legal Servite Corporatiop-funding
rules to présent to CRLA draft email re
research and send to White and
Suliman

motjeh'to terminatgconsent decreg:;
%g to find ¢ arn. ternate :ia}yétai:on

56455
10/31/2013

TIME Berne, Cody
10/31/2013 Revise
Hedric
Edit White's draft of letter to Yuba jail
inmates: reply to Taylor email re jail
lelters

not shown to concern relevant
portions of decree

0.00 U
0.00
0.00
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472512014 King Half Civil Rights Clinic
4:19 PM Slip Listing Page 30
Slip 1D User Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time  Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Descripfion Refersnce ———Varance
56456 TIME Berne, Cody .85 not shown to concern
1013112013 10/31/2013 222(’:2?!]&6 0.00 relevant portions of decree
Summarize lefters received from CRLA 0.00
in a chart and email to White and l
Suliman; attempt to locate letter writers _

Linjaii or CDCR \J
56457 7 TIME -~ Beme, Cody~~ 0.20 ~—211.50 A2 2 LA
: 1‘?}1’{2013 ,}‘T;’HZ{}’IS Reﬂeﬁ: <000 u /,,m‘” L,/ ;

5 o _Aedrick 000
'Read latest lettey fﬁam Jacobs arg” 7 000
CRLA providing materials e
,,,,,,,,,, e AR
564;:8 ....... TIME il Berne, Cody 0.80_.—211.60 _.~169.20
415013 1141/2013 paﬁf //l} S
" Hedrick .~ 0.00 ped

7 Discuss Jacobsﬂ'ietter wi White; scuss

_Perry reply Igsue wi Wmte

000 -

R ———

56459 TIME Berne, Cody 3.40 211.50 719.10

117172013 117172013 Ef%ﬁ_ck # of entries = 2 (create roster (1.7 hrs); make

7 earl .- .

Create roster of all people at jail as of mailing label and prepare intro letter (1.7hrs).

11/01/13; make mailing labels and X Create roster = clerical

prepare 80 introduction letters to Make mailing label = clerical

HBRCHE SSiadedceic Prepare intro letters = compensable (1.7 x .5
56460 TIME Berne, Cody|=.85)

11/2/2013 111372013 Draft Total Compensable =1.7x.5=.85

Hedrick

Redraft reply letter to Perry and email
to White and Suliman

e
P

0.00

56500 " TIME e Suliman, M- 71.94" e A A
10/26/2013 1012912013 Reyiew _Inot shown to A
o Aedrick > il <{concern relevant
/Rewew draft of order to Judge Burrell 000 .
LAENAE i -——____|portions of decree
56501 TIME Suliman, M. .15 211.50 31.73
10/30/2013 10/30/2013 Review 0.00 U
\ . Hedrick 0.00
Reviewed Docket 98 statutes. Cody's < 0.00 Ivague |
research W
56502 TIME Suliman, M. 0.15 211.50 3173
10/30/2013 10/30/2013 Revise 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00
Final letier to inmates edit 0.00

e
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412512014 King Halt Civii Rights Clinic
419 PM Slip Listing Page
Slip 1D User Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time  Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description — Reference Variance ) =
56503 ' Suliman, M 0.10 211,56~ 2145 s .
10;'31;}0’5 ««'10;311401 3 Rey ied 000 U « (..’/)( ufl,
~ Edrick 0,00 4
/m/wmwpd Coﬁy'/chart of inmates 7~ .00
56504 TIME .~ Suliman, M. 030 21150 6345~ o0
1073172013 .~ 10/31/201 sszev“’w 0,00 T o i
o " Hedrick _"0.00 ¥
Remeﬂwed Cody's Perry letter. ﬁé’ply 0 0.00
56505  RAE d/ Suliet, M. 7 040 247750 Y 12544
10!31,2613 _ACI3172013 MGt 7000 § //’ A e
> P " Hedrick " 080 '
_Afiexican consylate visit - email P 0.00
66506 TIVE /' Suliman, M.~ 0.75 24150 15862 -
1171720337 11712013 Review .~ 000 .~ U ol LA
P ; Hedrick” 0.00” #
'Réad CRLA letter to theClinic A 0700
56701 TIME Berne. Cody 0.05 24150 1058~ (1 <A
1142013 _~7 11142013 Copf— 0.00~" U 9
o .~ Hedrick 000 ot
Emails ff6m Suliman and thtg;e " 0.00 '
Pe;vy/and CRLA letters o
56702 TiME Berne, Cody 0.20 211.50 42.30
11416/2013 11/8/2013  Conf 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00
Email from Suliman re Hedrick 0.00
meeting: review order from ACLU
Montana jail case
Bernié, Cody 1,00 211.50 21160 A
1162049 Meeting . ~0.00 T .
S Hedrick s 0.00 o Lt NTT
Vééekly Hedrick mesting”™” o 0.00 '
56704 TIME Berne, Cody 0.10 not related to
116712013 11/6/2013 Conf 0.00 relevant portions of

worker names

Hedrick 4] d
Email trail from Suliman and White re 0.00 ecree
Mexican consulate, research consulate

567 FHAE—— - BerAe, Cody 0.05 2T 70,
11/12/2013 -~ 11/1212013 Conf” 000 7 U (A2
e _~Fedrick 0.00” ’
Follow yp’email from Sulimanre < 400

consulate visit
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42512014 King Halt Civil Rigihts Clinic
4:19 PM Slip Listing Page 32
Slip 1D User Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time  Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description Reference Variance
56708 TIME Suliman, M. 0.30  |not shown to
114312013 11/3/2013 S;a;ﬁm (}.gg concern relevant
Read new draft for Perry reply letter 0.00 [portions of decree
56709 HHTE 7 Suliman, Me—— 0.20 211.50 42.30 PR N
11 !4;’/2@1? 117412013 Review 0."03/’ U i b F L A
- 2 _Me&drick o0
,,/ﬁgaci Cappy's eméils re: CRLA recent ~ 0,00
. phong call o
56710 TIME Suliman, M, 0.35  [not shown to
Read Cfappy‘s email about ACLU in 0.00 portions of decree

Montana concerning exercise.
Researched outdoor recreation re:
canstitutional violation

58711 TIME Suliman, M, 0.70: 211.50 148.05
11712013 11/7/2013 Research 0.00 U
adrick 0.00
Check inmate names across different 0.00

databases to find out if they are still
located at Yuba County Jail

: P

56732 JTHVE Berpe,Cody 0.15 211.50 3178~ ot A_
11/12/2073 1171212013 Aeeting 0,00~ Y o

“ Hedrick L~""0.00 cont

JGase conference task list gud’é%ai! 0.00
56733 TIME Berne, Cody 5  [not shown to
114/1212013 11/12/2013 Review ; concern relevant

Hedrick .0 i
o . . ortions of decree
Review emails from White re Mexican 0 P
Consulate and 28 USC 1715b; review
amail from Mifch re consulate meeting

-

oo\oo
SO

T T Bgre Cody .~ 0.05 211.50 2 ¢ i i
1144872013, 11/1 312[31§/Ff;epare e 0.00_~" U - s l¢ v I
¢ 4 - Hedrick—" o006
Printtask list = 0.00
56735 | TTME Berne, Cody 0.80 211.80 126.90
11/13/2013 11/13/2013 Research 6.00 U
| Hedlrick 0.00
. Research 28 USC 1715b 0.00
M
L — S
56736 ‘TIME Berhe, Cody 0.15 7 211.50 A3 ;
w% 13 11:"%3!20&?’%{35% 0,00 u Ve }‘{, Bl i
2 Hedrick A0 “

-
P

T

1.3 j.,
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412512014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic
419 PM Slip Listing
Slip 1D User Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description Reference Variance
Complete reimbursement form-for 0.00
bridge tglj,#rf)’m San Brundg National
Archivés Trip .7
56737 TIME Berne, Cody 1.00 211.50 211.80
1474342043 114152013 Review 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00
Review letters from jail received in 0.00
reply to mass jail mailing; check
custody status of letter writers and i
speak with White about letters :
56738 TIME Berng, Cody 0.10 211.50 21.15
14/13/2013 11/13/2013  Review 0.00 u
Hedrick 0.00
Review emails from White and Suliman 0.00
, Veupcoming jail visit — e

56739
11/13/2013

TIME 015

0.00

Berne, Cody
11/13/2013 Conf

Suliman details of visit

58815 TIME Suliman, M, 0.10

| 11/10/2013 114072013 Conf 0.00

Hedrick (.00

Corresponded with CW about 0.00
Consulate visit

56816 TIVE Sudiman, M. 0.25

111172013 11/11/2013 Draft 0.00

Hedrick .00
Began to draft a cover letter for the visit 0.00

—

i

211.50
U

31.73

Hedrick 0.00 -
| Phone call w/ Wanda at Yuba Jail t
schedule visit; email White and

g i

Page 33

. [ e B '&.3_ ;
e ! T )

not shown to
concern relevant
portions of decree

not shown to
concern relevant
portions of decree

56817 TIME Suliman, M. 0.15

not shown to
concern relevant

portions of decree

1141212013 11/12/2013 Conf 0.
Hedrick .00
Called CW hefore consulate visit and (.00

discussed further guidance

56818 TIME Suliman, M. 1.35
11/12/2013 1111212013 Prepare 0.
Hedrick

not shown to
concern relevant

portions of decree

Prepared for the consulate visit,
paperwork, copies of material to give
them, ete.

1.10
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472512014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic
4:19 PM Stip Listing Page 34
Slip 1D User Units Rate Slip Value

Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info

sting-Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status

Description Reference Variance \
56819 TiME Suliman. M. 2.00 not Shown to

1141242013 1111212013 Meeting 0.00

M concern relevant
Mexican Consulate meeting (including 0.00 |portions of decree

tranqurtaﬁom time})

: —FHAE : Suliman, M. 0.85 /./ 211.50 A 437 2 L
1111242013 ATH212013 Summafize 0.00,~ u iy S
P ¥ Hedfick 0,00
Fma JS..JTI ary oF he Consulate D00 :
/ meeting C‘f?)fﬁﬂﬁ CW - < ; M
56821 TIME Suliman, M. 5.50 Total compensable =
111182013 11/18/2013  Visit 000 [3.43 (see Entry No.
_ — Hedrick 506156929 (below) for
Yuba County Jail visit 0.00 explanation)
56857  EXP CRC 1 OFAU 59,20 V28 48]
102472013 / 10/21/2013 $Car-Fleet Sve e '
s / Hedrick
/Zharges from Floet Services fom.rée of
/" car to congutt client mtemew§ at Yuba
County Jéil in Marysville,CA
56858 EXP CRC 1 7490 7490 5.,
10!22!/2915 /n/ 12212013 SCar‘Fleet Sve ¥ & ?}5
I’*educk ’ "
Chézrges from Flepl’éew:cas for, use of
~carto conduct, efient rewarc_l),m San
< Bruno, CA.~
56859  EXP P CRC .~ 1 20.91 20.94 5k
111122013 /11112120:3 $Mileage  |# of entries: 2 (Travel (2.5 hrs.); Interviews (5.7 -
/ J”!@dl’iCk 2 5 - 3 2))
/?vﬁleage to meetWith Mex;can i Tl _ . ]
/ Consuiate wéardmg mmates bdused at # of interviews: 2 (Pasion (1.6); Holston (1.6))
Yuba Cognty Jail. 100% Travel time compensable (2.5)
0, i =
o Exp” White 25% Pasion compensable (.25 x 1.6 = .4)
117182013 11/18/2013 $Mileage [ [33% Holston compensable (.33 x 1.6 = .528)
~ Hedrick Total compensable =2.5 + .4 +.528 = 3.43

Milggge to to conduct client intgrviews
at Yuba County Jail in Marysville, CA,

56929 TIVE Berne, Lody 5.70 211.50 1205.55
11/18/2013 11/18/2013 Travel 0.00 U
Helri 0.00
Drive to Yuba Jail and back! interviews .00

with Pasion and Holston

6.86 . 3
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Page 35

# of entries = 2 (Holston (.55 hrs);
Pasion (.55 hrs))

33% Holston compensable (.55 x .33
=.1815)

25% Pasion Compensable (.55 x. 25
=.1375)

Total Compensable =.1815 +.1375

=.32

4/2512014 King Hail Civil Rights Clinic
4:19 PM Slip Listing
Slip 1D User Units
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time
Posting Status Client Est. Time
__Description Reference Varignee
56930 ¢ TIME " Berne, Cody 1.10
11716/2013 1141972013 Draft 0.00
Fpdri 0.00
Write up Holston interview notes; begin 0.00
wriling Pasion interview notes T
56931 TIME Berne, Cody .70
11/20/2013 11/20/2013 Draft 0.00
hiedrick 0.00
Write up Pasion notes; revise Holsion : 0.00

and Pasion notes and email to White
and Suliman

56932 TIME _ Berne, Cody
11/20/2013 1112072013 Review
Hedrick
Review Human Rights First
immigration facilities report
56933 7 TIME . Berne?;adf
112045013 1172012013 Prepsfe
e Hedrick
Print motion tg términate and o
‘oppaosition afid prepare mailing fdr
Holston ~
56934 TIME Berne, Cody
11/20/2013 11/20/2013

Review email from Suliman re task list,
LLatham interview, Rackley interview;
research CDCR prisoners held at Yuba
Jail

Review x .33 =.033)
Hedrck M}g? 100% inmate research compensable

S Ix.33=.1155) 25% Pasion

# of entries = 2 (Holston (.35 hrs);
Pasion (.35 hrs))
33% Holston compensable (.35 e

Compensable (.35 x. 25 =.0875)

E'fgg Total Compensable =.1155

0:00 +.0875 = .2

0.00

020 21750 4230 -]

/&gﬁ/ u // Lo N & pind]
60 T . . .
o.oo [# of entries = 2 (review email (.2 hrs);

0.40

research inmates (.2 hrs)
50% Rackley compensable; Rackley is
33% of "review email” sub-entry (.5 x .2

(.2)
Total Compensable = .2 +.033 = .23

56935 ./ TIME i Berne, Gedy 1.00 _~"211.50 '/2)*.5‘0 e 5
112012013 11/20/2013  Megtirig 0.06" U e
_bi6drick ~0.00 2 o
< Weekly Hedri(g;;f( meeting e 0.00
56936 TIME Berne, Cody 0.15 211.50 31.73
1112172013 11/21/2013  Prepare 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00 B prrpeer
Schedule visit o jail w/ Wanda; email < 0.00 (clerical |
White and Suliman )
5 TIME Berne, Cody 006 21150  [notshownto
11/21/2013 1172112013

Email from Taylor and reply letter from
Lentz

Review 0.00 concern relevant
Hedrick T portions of decree

-

! 2. b2
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4/25/2014 King Haill Civil Rights Clinie
4:18 PM Slip Listing Page 36
# of entries = 2 (start drafting (.275);
Slip ID User Units|find sample decl. and review L.R.
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time|(.275))
Posting Status Client Est. Time|33% Holston Compensable (.33
Description Reference Varigace —
58939 TiviE Berne, Cody 0.55 X '235 09075
11/21/2013 11/21/2013 Droft 0.00/100% other tasks compensable
Hedrick 0.00({Total compensable = .09075 + .275
Start drafting MHolston declaration; find 0.00|= 37
sample declarations, review local rules I

on declarations

56940 TIME Berne, Cody
142172013 1172172013 Revise
: —f Hedric 0.00
Finalize Holston declarations re 0.00
exercise, library, and medical
56441 TIME Berne, Ccdy 0.70
1112212013 11/22:2013 Draft
Hedrick

Write Pasion declarations re exercise,
ICE. library, and medical

56942
1172342013

TIME
.00
0.00

-t

_|1 Decl compensable (library)

# Decl = 3

Total compensable = .33 x 1.25
=41
# Decl. =4

1 Decl compensable (library)
Total compensable =.25x .7 =.18

not shown to concern relevant
portions of decree

# of entries = 3 (#1. "Review
email" (.165 hrs) = not shown to
concern relevant portions of

r 56943

Read letters from Villatoro and Bankert 6-:00 decree; #2. Print (.165 hrs) =
TIME Berne, Cody 085 .S clerical; #3. Review ICE_
11/25/2013 11/25/2013 Review 0.00 standards: (ICE recreation
: Hedrick 0.

Review HIPFPA email from White; print .00
declarations and sections of ICE
detention standards manual; unjam-

~printer; review [CE recreation and

library standards

standards (.0825 hrs) not shown to
concern relevant portions of the
decree; ICE library standards
compensable (.0825 hrs))

Total compensable = .08

# of er{tlries: 2 (Travel (2.5 hrs.); vist &
review (5.1 -2.5 = 2.6))

kT

56944 ThE Barne, Cody 5.10
11/25/2013 1112572013 Drive 0.00
Hedrick 0.00
Drive fo and from Yuba Jail; visit 0.00

Holston and review declarations <
56994 TIME Suliman, M. 0.55
1111912013 1111972013 Review 0.00
Hedrick 0.00
Review CW's email with human rights 0.00

watch PDF attachment

56995
111972013

TIME :
0.00
0.00

1111972013 Draft
Hedrick
Drafted Inmate interview notes

m

100% Travel compensable (2.5)
33% Holston compensable (.33 x 2.6
= .858)

Total compensable =2.5 + .858 =
3.36

not shown to concern relevant
portions of decree

not shown to concern relevant
portions of decree (vague as to which
inmates this entry concerns)

4.4 / C ‘. 5
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41252014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic
A19 PM Slip Listing Page 37
Slip ID User Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description Reference Variance - -
56996 TIME Sulimap, M- 0.35 Inot shown to concern relevant portions
112212013 .~ 11/22/2013 Reviéw 0.00 vant p
- _~Hedrick ~lof decree (vague as to which inmates

Revieggd”érody’s Declarations

56497 TIME Sulj
11222013 1172212013 ATraft
Hedrick
Drafted Inmate Declarations e

e e e o sl

55658 TIME Suliman,
{ 11232013 11/23/2013 Rese
: rick
/ Research Tort claim procedure for
} Inmate Rackley
\ 56999 TIME Suliman,
11/23i2018 11/23/2013 Conf

Email Tort ¢laim info to Professor and
Cody

57000 TIME
11/26/2013 1128

Suliman, M.
Visit
Hedrick

Yuba County Jail visit

57001
1125/2013

TIME

1142512013
Hedrick
Reviewed new letters (Villatore,
Blankert, Silva)

57022
11/2612013

TIME
11/26/2013

Two phone calls to Wanda at jail fo
schedule visits; email info fo White and
Suliman

57023
11/29/2013

TIME Berne, Cody
11728/2013 Revise

Hedrick

Update electronic versions of
deciarations for Holston and Pasion;
read Suliman's letter to Rackley: read
jail tetters from Silva and Singh

e

this entry refers)

2.90
0.00

not shown to concern relevant portions

of decree
N

4 45 [not shown to concern relevant portions
of decree

0.00 \

Total compensable = 3.36 (same trip
as Entry No. 56944 on previous page)

0.00 U 7

not shown to concern relevant portions
of decree

clerical 1099.80

# of entries: 3 (update decl. (.15 hrs);
read Suliman's letter (.15 hrs); read
Silva and Singh letters (.15 hrs).
Entry 1: 2 Decls updated: Holston

(.075); Pasion (.075) ;

0.00 1330 Holston compensable (.33 x .075
=.02475)

g-gg 25% Pasion compensable (.25 x .075

=.01875)

|Entry 2: Not shown to be compensable

since unclear whether relates to

consent decree or tort claim procedure

[research referenced in Entry No.

0.00 |56998.

g-gg Entry 3: Not shown to concern relevant
~ |portions of the consent decree.

Total compensable: .02475 + .01875

=.04

T

-

{] b

3.4
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41252014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic

4:19 PM Slip Listing

Slip 1D User Units
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time
Posting Status Client Est. Time
Description Reference Variance

Page 38

Rate
Rate Info
Bill Status

Slip Value

not shown to concern relevant

1172612013

57084 TIME

11/26/2013 1172672013

. Hédrick
Sent clinic mait to Mr, Rackley
8 _FIME e Berne, Cady—

12112673 A2T12013 Copt—

i o _Hedrick

“Text Suliman Wi ifo about oontactmg
jail
57089 TIME
12312013 12/3/2013

Hedrick
Email from Taylor re letters fro
Vargas, Alvarez; read letters
57090 TIME Berne, Cody
12/4i2013 12/4/2013 Draft

Hapdrick
Write letters to Holston, Pasion re
declarations: assemble packets of
declarations to be signed by both; mail
to both

57091
12/6/2013

TIME Berne, Cody

12/6/2013

Assemble materials for trip to jail; drive
to jail with White, Suliman; interview
Shannon Siiva at jail; return to Davis

o

HME———————— Suliman-M.—————0:40—]

17261 11/26/2013 Draﬁ
] 0
Draft letter for Mr. Rackley 0.00

5.65

portions of decree, since unclear
whether relates to consent decree
or tort claim procedure research
referenced in Entry No. 56998.

£ \

not shown to concern relevant
portions of decree

#of entriEes: 3 (write Etters (.467 hrs);
assemble packets (.467 hrs); malil
(.467 hours).

Entry 1: Write letters: Holston
(.2335); Pasion (.2335)

33% Holston compensable (.33

x .2335 = .077055)

25% Pasion compensable (.25

x .2335 =.058375)

Entry 2: Clerical

Entry 3: Clerical

Total compensable = .077055

+.058375 = .14

Prepare 00
Hedrick 0.00
0.00

not shown to concern relevant
portions of decree

57172 . E Berne- Cod o 6.00 600 S
10/22,:@6/1, 10/22/2013 .. §thisc ’ o et - & X[+
" """ Hedrick - '
TolisA0 conduct client researeli at
National Archives. )
N
57178 TIME Berne. Cody 2.15 |not shown to concern relevant
12/13/2013 12i12i2013 Review portions Of decree
Hedrick

Review notes from Silva interview;
write three declarations for Silva from
these notes; email declarations to White

N

14

1.9
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412502014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic
419 PM- Slip Listing Page 39
Slip ID User Units|# of entries: 2 (Perry (.1 hr) ; Review
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time|Decls. (.1 hr))
Posting Status Client Est. Time : . ; .
Dkseition Bor s Vatiafce # decl. reviews: 2 (Pasion (.05); Holston
67179 TIME Berne, Cody 0.20/(.05))
1211512013 1211512013 Review 0.00|Perry not compensable
: Hepdrick 0.00|5e0 ;
Read letter from Patrick Perry re willing .00 25 % Pasion compensable (.25 x .05
io meel; review declarations returned =.0125)
to CRC from Pasion and Holston 33% Holston compensable (.33 x .05
z =.0165)
57200 _BXP e CRC . _
11 !2&5,513 /11,25;2023 spar‘ﬂeetst,c /Total compensable =.0125+ .0165
L “Hedrick - 7[=.03
L u;.ara a fr m‘: net Services for er of '

car to conduct client interview at Yuba

not shown to concern relevant
portions of decree

County Jail.
DL TIME
1112{2014 111212014 ;
0.00
Write three declarations and mem 0.00

jail interview w/ Silva

‘E?’ 26 TIME Berne, Cody 2
1/15/2014 1715/2014 Review 14
- Hedrick 0.00
Read letter from Perry; review Pasion 0.00
and Holston declarations
(57227 TIME Berne. Cody 0.65
11812014 11972014 Conf 0.00
\ Hedrick

Email from White re 1st ¢class; read
FRCP 35 and notes; read 12/12/13
Perry letter; read letters from Lopez,
Wyman; research how an abcessed
tooth is treatad re jail letters ahout
dental care; review letters from
Cropsey. Bechtel; email Taylor re
Cropsey letter

)
)

Review

# of entries: 2 (Perry (.1 hr.) ; Pasion
(.05) & Holston (.05))

Perry not compensable

25% Pasion compensable (.25 x .05
=.0125)

33% Holston compensable (.33 x .05
=.0165)

Total compensable time =.0125
+.0165 =.03

211.50
L

not shown to concern relevant

portions of decree

137.48

not shown to concern relevant
portions of decree

1/10/2014 171072014 U
Hedric 0. 00
Check cusiody status of writers of most 0.00
recent letters received from the jail
/ I_. ~
57240 TiME Befne, Cody '“f 10 2 }y’so 23,’2/.65 {’};{ <o
111442014 1/14/2014 " Meeting O 00 U 55 £
Hedrick 0.00 : o
Meet with CW re Hedrick next ,sl/e?)/s // G.OQ// GRpE
- A L
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412512014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic
4:19 PM Slip Listing Page 40
Slip 1D User Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est Time__ Bill Status
__Bescription Reference Variance
57241 TIME Berne, Cody 105 & 211.50 222.08
1/14/2014 1/14/2014  Prepare 000 YU N /
Hedrick 0.00 f;,;l €| ced
Print-Silva-deciarations; print Perry 0.00 ' ( “

-authorizationrte-visit-ferm: call CDCR
CCC re prison visit w/ Perry; call Yuba
iail to schedule visit for this week;

N clerical |

speak W/ and email RT re CDCR visit \
57242 TIME i "' Rerne, Cody 0.15 211.50 o i
111412014 1/14/2014  Conf 0.00 18] h
Hedrick 0.00 not shown to
Fimail from White re new letters from P 0.00 concern relevant
ﬁila:n‘r:sfad new letters and check CUSdeY ~ portlons Of decree
57243 TIME Berne, Cody 0.15 211.50 31.73
1/15/2014 1/115/2014  Conf 0.00 u
Hedrick 0.00 | . :
Email from RT re visit to CCC: call jail ¢ 000 lvague; clerical |
to add name o visit list
57244 .~ TIME Berne, Cody 2.05 /zﬂ 50 43358 2
116 // 1/16/2014  Resdarch o oo g oltepo.
_Hedrick _ i
Researchdeposition rules including LR /’6?00
250.1;%0 133, FRCP 30, F 458,
FRGP 28, 31, 32; read Ruitér Guide on
? ducting deposmons/ai} of this in
nticipation of deposfng jail officials in
the next few months
57245  AIME o~ Berne, Cody ™™ 045 280 3175 oy
111812074 //’/ 1/16/2014  Preparé 0.00 U 2. cAesies /
e Edrick 0,00
P’rmt 6 6 8 axli/ horization to visit Peryy: 6.00
discuss vi€it and form w/ RT
2 Lo
57246 TIME Berne, Cody.— 020 241500 42300 & ot & ¥
1,1:&2014 111712014 Conf " 0.00,~ U - - A ;1o
_Hedrick 000 k-5
Tall,wﬂ‘ AJ about Hedrick; prmz Sliva’ 0.00
déc!arat:on again -
not shown to
57247 TIME Berne, Cody 5.90 211.50
1117/2014 1417/2014  Travel 0 U congern relevant
Hedrick 0.00 portions of decree
Travel to jail w/ CW and AJ; interviev 0.00

° Ay

g
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Review Bechtel notes, write and edit
Bechiel declarations re medical care
and exercise yard

7 FH= 4 dc‘bbciwa
1!16: ai4 " 1/16/2014 RB‘VIGW
S - o i“"'E?dl"le
fF{évnew/Hednck documents provided
by Cody
57296 THAE Jassawalla, A
1417/2014 111712014

Meeting 30 concern relevant
Hedrick 00 ;
nterview clients at Yuba County Priso 00 portions of decree

41252014 Kirg Hall Civil Rights Clinic
419 PM Slip Listing Page
Slip 1D User Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time  Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est Time  Bill Status
Description Reference Variance
Bechtel and sit in on Cropsey interview;
have Silva sign declarations
57248 TIME ) Berne, Cody 0.20 211,50. 42307 i858
11 moﬁﬂf” _~~TA712014  Draft-” 000 U o -
Hedrick 0.00" /
w’ te and emel - el Hedrick task list for— —0700 T
K’——HE:XYWESG:R'—
\ 57248, TIME Berne, Cody 0.75 not shown to
1172014 1117/2014  Draft .00 concern relevant
Hedrick 00 ti fd \
Write up interview niotes from Bechiel 0.00 portions of gecree
interview
\ 57250 TIME Berne, Cody 145  |notshownto
119/2014 1/119/2014 Review 2 concern relevant
‘Hedrick

portions of decree

200 _-211.50 423.007 2,
/%uef” u /X f},,
P 00 Vo
0.00
6.00 not shown to

57297 TIME Jassawalla, A. 3.00 not shown to
Hedrick 00 .
Reviewed Declaration material and 0.00 portions of decree
drafted interview notes and two
Declarations re: Cropsey
57380—— White, Carter T G486 _""‘55%:58 & 2( ),
112212614 1/22/2074  SMileage™ L e e
i / : Wﬁ v
Mrle;ﬁ to visit wzth G )erifs atYuba -
Cotinty Jail.
57435 TIME Jassawalla, A. 2.20 211.50 465.30
112172014 121/2014  Conf 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00

41
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41252014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic
4:19 PM Slip Listing Page 42
Slip ID User Units Rate Slip Value

Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate info

Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status  [15t shown to

Description Reference Variance =l

Answer emails from Cody re Hedgck/—(éeée/_ concern relevant

case and edit Declaration portions of decree
57483  _TIME e Berne, Cody 040 21150 8460 2

172012044 12012014 Research 0,00~ U Fnel tv s

e _~“"Hedrick _~0.00 FARE
asearch how40 file claim against <7 0.00

Yuba Countf/City, Marysville, and

Sutter Cofinty __’_/,__..__//_’/

V574 «{“ TIME Berne, Cody ,,Qw&,’(%‘ S 21150 180.35 iy
112012014 1202014 Lir 0.00 u ] e
! Hedrick 0.00
write lefter to Bechtel re declaration 0.00 not shown to
and filing tort cfaim; edit Bechtel letter; concern relevant
email Bechtel declaration and letter to <— i
kwm& A noe portions of decree
57485 .. TiME/ _Berne, Cody D65 21450 10.88"
3,!2019014 o 1;20!2,01@’ Conf 000 7 U /’M /f'&-”f? A
~ Hedrick " 0.00°" 4 "
enaf il Mztch to ask if hc;z,s'ént tort claim ' .00
4nfo to Rackley <
57486 TIME Berne. Cody 0.20 211.50 42.30
1/20/12014 1/20/2014 L 0.00 u not shown to
Hedrick 0.00
Write reply letter to Perry re meetingon o ERviv; Con?em relevant
01/31/14 =~ portions of decree
57487 TIME Berne, Cody 1.35 211.50 285.53
12002014 11202014 Prepare 0.00 U
Fedyick 0.00
Create new roster of jail detainees, 0.00
attempt to distribute names to receive
mass mailing randomly amongst the
pads
57488  FIME -~ Berne, £6dy 065 _ 21150 48748 / - [
f20f2;)4’4 L 1!29&014 Adriin, 0,00 U CHey 69
ﬂ/ - ~Hedrick ~6.00 i
méke mafling labels, sventuall get -~ 0.00
labelsgto print /M’ =+
57488 TIME Berne, Cody 015 211.50 31.73
1120/2014 1/20/2014  Review 0.00 u
Hedrick 0.00
review mass mailing letter template 0.00

15 - =
1.1
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412512014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic
4:19 PM Slip Listing Page
Slip 1D User Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
ription __Reference __——Variance
57499 TIME Berne, Cody 0.95 211.50 200:93
172472014 1212014 Lir 0.00 u
\ Hedrick 0.00
reply to 01/08/14 Dymon letter, edit; 0.00
email draft to White and Anisa
’ E i OBy : . 860 ol
11212014 1/21/2074  Review ,/”ﬂ 000 .~ U : '
) : Hedrigk~ %pﬁ”
“Review documents faxed by Rincon .00 s
57501 TIME Berne, Cody 0.25 »4NOt shown to
112112014 172172014 Ltr - concern relevant
M portions of decree
review and maii Dymon letier 0.00
57502 TIME Beme,Cody 035 . 21150 74037 / e
12014 7 172172014 Adiin, 0,00 VR '
/*‘ P " Hedrick ~1.00 g
7 Label, asgémble, check ad%ﬁ_ﬂ_—ﬁ—-—-&e@
__and mail 6Q detainee letters ,'—/\
f/ 57503 TIME Berne, Cody 015  21{notshownto
| 172172014 11212014  Conf 0. concern relevant
k Hedrick 0.00 portions of decree
Emails w/ Anisa re Perry visit, email 0.00
5 : = Berne, Cody 1267 | 211.50 253.80
112312014 1/23/2014 Prepare 0.00 u ;.f;
Hedrick 0.00 24 f o
Re-read Perry documents, including his 0.00 not shown to ;
letters, defendant’s motion to dismiss, concern relevant
and Read's declaration; review jail .
handboek included in Perry fite and- portions of decree
makea-notes-for-areas relevantie-.
deposing Read _
57505 TIME - Berne, Cody 115 . 211.50 24323 /n/ﬂ{1$
1242014 7 112412014 _FPrepare 0.00~" TR E A
¥ i " Hedrick 700 e
Review aif journal notes fromJ&st and " 0.00
tlﬁé}iﬁater re hearing:Meetings,
interviews, iegal research for
“preparation of déclaration of Read;
record deposition ideas
57506 TIME Berne, Cody 0.05 211.50 10.58
112612014 1/126/2014  Conf 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00
- ,2‘
0o L. 7

44
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“visiting sect:p of Title 15 foy F*erry visit;

41252014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic
4:19 PM Stip Listing Page 45
Slip 1D User Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status not shown to
Description Reference Variance concern relevant
Emails to and from Taylor re Nﬂﬁ portions of decree
scheduling meeting w/ Perry
57508 " TIME - Jassawalfa, A, 200 21160 425007 Sage
112813014 ,/‘” 1/28/2014 /Maé’tt/ng 0,00 y =
’ o ~Hedrick ~0.00 . sl
e . g £ o,
# Hedrick teath mig. with Prof. Whit€ and 0.00
Cody «
57509 TiVE ] Jassawslia, A. .fE‘i*,g 2<>?1" 50 _ ‘1*15‘}0‘38 )
112912014 /3512014 Draft 0.00 loiand]
Hedrick 0.00 LA 1 Ced]
Edit Declarations, write client letter, 0.00
prepimail.slientmateriale, read Perry not shown to
material and Dept. of Corrections and  ~ concern relevant
Rehab*‘iﬁﬁ/ﬂw‘,/———— portions of decree
57510 . TIME Jassawalla, A. 0.75 211.50 158.63 \
1/30/2014 1/30/2014  Draft 0.00 9]
Hedrick 0.00 not shown to
Read Perry Declaration and draft 0.00 concern relevant
Piping Declaration < portions of decree
57511 TIME Jassawalla, A. 6.00 211.50 1269.00 \
173172014 1312014 Meeting 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00 not shown to
Visit and Interview Perry < 6-66 concern relevant
portions of decree
57555 TIME Berne, Cody 0.05 211.50 TU.U0 I
112812014 112812014  Conf 0.00 u i
Hedrick 0.00 not shown to
Call CCC re Perry visit < 0.00 concern relevant
57556 TIME Berne, Cody 0.05 211.50 portions of decree
112812014 1/28/2014  Admin. 0.00 ] /
Hedrick 0.00 not shown to
Cheqk Pgrry custody status; confirm Q.00 concern relevant
meeting time w/ White <
—|portions of decree
57567 4 TIME §r Berne, Cody 1707 21150 " 35985 PRz e
1 @ 14 AT2812014 n.;;aéimg 40 i v 7
- edrick 70000 C.onts
Prep for Hedrick méeting by reviewifg - 0.00
task list, depp-tieas; Hedrick méeting
"/TIME A Berne Cody 020 /211.50 /4’2‘30
28 14 L {72812014 pare 0.00 U :
4 E,/ /2 / edrick _ 7 o {{""f
iscuss Hedricktasks w/ Anisa; ,pr’ ﬂt 0.00

0 \\\
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412512014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic
4:19 PM Slip Listing Page 46
Slip 1D User Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time  Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est Time  Bill Status
Description Reference Variance s
57559 TIME” Berne, Cody 0.55 211,50~ 116733 .
11281201 1/28/2014-" Preparg.— 000 -7 U P {,
4 Hegrick 0.00 £ tf? & .
‘:;\!)«t/ e and email memo r /er(fcpc} subject” 700 :
teas and icleas _,’/
57560 _AME - Berne, (,,ody/ """" .45 211.567 85,18~
1,-'28;3;3‘44 1262014 Ur 000 .~ U P i A
Hedrick 0. QD“" ) 7
- z‘*‘w‘rtie second leiterfo Bachtel re tost”" AL00 v
7 claims; mail letfer and info from ) Jegal ' "
sermces f;a( pr:sonsers wif chlidran
57561 TIME Berne, Cody g.15 211.50 31.73
172812014 1/28/2014 Review 8.00 U
Hedrick 0.00
Read new Cropsey letter, and Herrera not shown to
letter; ook up iransiations of some concern relevant
words in Herrera letter portions of decree
57562 TIME Berne, Cody 0.15 211.50 31.73
_ Hedrick 0.00 |
Exchange messages w/ CCC litigation 00 Con(_:em relevant
coordinator; set up Perry visit = portions of decree
57563 ~ TIME Berne, Cody 0.10 211.50 21.15
1129/2014 1/29/2014  Conf 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00 not shown to
Email Taylor, White, and Anisa re Perry <— envis concern relevant
visit portions of decree
57564 7 TIME ~Betne, Cod """""""""""" 0.10 211,50~ 2L A
172942614 112,91’2'614 Conf 0.00 .~ U /’ 7 EREE
A Hedrz{;k 000"
/ Emails w/ White ang élhan re Herrera" —— g0
case and jail col 0
///
/ﬂﬁé‘rﬁ’ TIME Berne, Cody 1.90 211.50 401.85
.- 112912014 142812014 Prepare 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00
Read Perry 1st and 2nd amended 0.00 not shown to

complaints, write declaration re the
attack based on Perry's compiaints;
made it up to py 5 of Perry's 2nd

N_ concern relevant
portions of decree

complaint }
\ 57566 TIME Berne, Cody 0.05 211.50 10.58
\ 1/30/2014 143012014 Conf 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00

X

S
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42502014 King Hall Civil Rignts Clinic
4:19 PM Slip Listing Page
Slip 1D User Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time  Rate Info
Postihg Status Client cst. Time  Bill Status
tion———————— Reference __Variance not shown to
E:maﬂe. w/ Anisa re Perry interview < 565 concern relevant
planning portions of decree
57567 TIME Berne, Cody 0.30 211.50 63.45
13012014 1/30/2014  Prepare 0.00 u
Hedrick 0.00
Reread Newman's dismissal order of 0.00 not shown to
Perry suit and update and begin writing concern relevant
email to White and Anissa re additional portions of decree
deposition ideas based o Periy's case 7 2
57568  TIME Berne, Cody 0.55 211.50 116.33
173072014 17202014 Draft (.00 u
Heclrick 0.00 not shown to
Finish first draft of Perry declaration < 250 concern relevant
57569 TIME Berne, Cody 110 21150  [Portions of decree
173012014 1/30/2014  Revise 0.00 U [
Hedrick 0.00 not shown to
Edit Perry declaration, three 0.00 concern relevant
read-throughs and edits <— portions of decree
- "
57571 TIME . Begag, Cody 7 0.30 241.50 8345 x
173 f{/ 14 o7 13002014 .Fhﬁﬁi / 0.00 7 U _,,./3’ €
/ m// Hedrick 0',,90/
Print direc 6,&(5/% to Deadwood; piint 0.00
decl ﬂﬂr n, Perry complam’cs Newman
order; and assemble malerlafb in three
packets; prin jail handbook
57572 TIME Berne, Cody 0.45 211.50 §5.18
130/2014 1/30/2014 Research 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00
Read through title 15 CDCR visiting 0.00
regs.
57573 TIME Berne, Cody 230 21150 |notshownto
173172014 173112014 Travel 0.00 : concern relevant
Hedrick .00 portions of decree
pick up UC car; drive 1o Lower Lake 0.00
57574 TIME Berne, Cody 0.50 211,50  |Printing = clerical;
1/31/2014 173112014  Prepare 0.00 §) other task not
Hedrick 0.00 shown to concern

Print directions to Konocti; re read :
Perry declaration

45 éj

relevant portions of
decree

2
o 2

47

f eoic / i
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412512014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic
4:19 PM Slip Listing Page 48
Slip 1D User Units Rate Slip Value.
Datesand Time  Activity————BNB-Time——Ratednfo—
T Posting'Statts— Client Est Time  Bill Status
. Description Reference Variance
57575 TIME | Berne, Cady 1.75 211.50 not shown to
13172014 1/31/2014 Meeting 0.00 concern relevant
i .00 i
Mest ! Pery SO0 portions ofldecree
57576 TIME Berne, Cody 2207, 0211.50 not shown to -
_ _ Hedrick 0 fi fd B
Retum to Davis; drop-off Anisa;return 0.00 portions of decree
;JO car-fle-Perty papers : i
# 2 Py -
57577 TIME Berne, Cody i.45 211.50 not shown to
| 413112014 113172014 Summarize 0.00 concern relevant
; Hedrick : portions of decree
| Write memo to file for Perry interview: 0.00
| email to White and AJ {
57665  TIME Berne, Cody 010 21150  [notshown to
21312014 213/2014 Lir 0.00 concern relevant
o o Hedrick - portions of decree
i Email Anisa re task list, ideas for task 0.00
i list
| 57666 TIME Berne, Cody 0.15 211.50 not shown to
Email Anisa again re task list, and read 0.00 portions of decree
Cropsey piping declaration
: 57667 TIME Berne, Cody 0.10 211.50 21.156
Il 2/3/2014 21312014 Admin. 0.00 U
{ — — Hedrick 0.00
| | | Check jail custedy status and email 0.00
|| | Sophie re undeliverable letters
| not shown to
|1 57668 TIME _ Berne, Cody concern relevant
| 21472014 21412014 Rew?w portions of decree
\ 1\, Begin rév{ewing Perry file \L
7069 < TME Berne, Cody™ 0.85 77150 179.76° CaS€
21442014 // 21412014 F&}@aﬁ’ig } U # of entries: 3 (#1 > n
,_, edrick «~0.00 i/
Hedrick weekly meeting 0.00 SCh(_%dU“ng visits;
clerical; #3 Bechtel
57870 TIME Berne, Cody P
21412014 20412014 Admin, declaration: not
_ Hedrick ‘ shown to concern
\ Call Wanda to schedule visit; email info 0.00 relevant portions of
to CW, Anisa; print Bechtel declaration decree)
i e 1

44
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412512014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic
418 PM Slip Listing Page 49
Slip ID User Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Infc
Posting Status Client Est, Time  Bill Status.
Description Reference Variance . St y
57671 TIME- _~Beme, Coalf ‘‘‘‘ 015 _~Z11.50 A3 / .
21412014 // 214;.2;114” Admjp” 0%)/ I I o {od € f‘-z’u{
/" _He’dnck 00 '
Gg}fﬁfé:mps envelopes,tabels from <" 0.00
Sophie .
57672 TIME Berne, Cody 045,75 211.50 9518 i ( Tl o’ %
2/4i2014 214i2014 Lir 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00 not shown to
Write letter to Perry re visit; print—7 0.00 concern relevant
_mailinglabels < . portions of decree
57673 TifE - Berne, Gody 155 244,50 327,85
2;4:{204( 2142614 Agmin, 0. 00 i TN (A€ { C /e (
e ,/Hednck /Qr ’
/{’)’l"gamze materials fm‘i‘ﬁ Perry 0.00
chronologically /m'ake cr}p;zsgor Amsa
and file: correct and reprintPerry
declaratiorf and letter, s€nd to Perry
along w;th his criginal papers
5767 'Fi/E /’ Berne, Cc}dy"‘" 050 21150 105,726 / e e f
;ﬁgm,a/ /,214!2014 Admin.~ 0.007 U CAerca
z Hedfick ./0'00
ma(e copies of F’erﬁr/ materials for " 0.00
_Anisa and file; Lcorrect and reprint Pérry
declaration and letter, send to Pérry
along with'his original papers”
57875 TIME Berne, Cody 0.10 211.50 21.18
2:6/2014 2152014 Lir 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00
Emails w/ CW re time extension and 0.00
new jail letters ' e
57676 TIME Berne, Cody 1.80 211.50 380.70 \
21512014 215120114 Review 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00 not shown to
Finish reviewing Perry docgand writing 0.00 concern relevant
notes based on the docs portions of decree

5 — Berne, Ccdy 0.10 .~ 211.50 7415 ’
21615014 /,2:5;2014 Admin, 000" e W /
27 Hedrick ~0.00 s Crtér1€a
Go ihrough materf'/s in my maitbox,.~ o /'/ 0.00
and print copiés of Perry mater,als 0
be placed’In Hedrick file "
57678 .~ TIME Rerne, 135 211,50 . 53 ’
2/6/2014 16/2014 Rcse‘ﬁ%&?ﬂ 000" U /Qﬁ? f{’ epo,
” ~Hedrick 0,00 el

T ] 2.5
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41252014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic
4:19 PM Slip Listing Page 50
Slip ID User Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time  Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description Reference - Variance ;
Backgroupd-preparation for Dr,.~ /,,:-f'”"" 0.00 g{{»‘f,ﬁ! o,
Ca5§ady depo, mcludzng,se’ﬁrchmg vig” g
Gobgle, Yuba County-Site, Westlaw: M//
57679 TIME Berne, Cody 0.30 211.50 63.45
21612014 2i6iz014 Research 0.00 u
Hedrick 0.00
Research Perry via Westlaw 0.00
57880 - TIME Berne, Cody SUA4C- 21150 84.60
21612014 2/6/2014  Resawch “g.00 U
Hedrick 0.00
Research CA Penal Code 4001 forinfo .00
on Perry housing: review notes of
decision, treafises; research Penal
Code 4011 re inmate medical
57682 TiME _ Berne, Cody 0.15 1.50 31.73
21812014 218i2014 ji?:& g,gg not shown to
Check custody status of letter writers T.00 concern
: ~ [relevant
57683 TIME Berne, Cody 0:10 1.50 2115 portions of
2{8/2014 2i8i2014 Lir 0.00 U
Hedrick 0,00 decree
Email Anisa and CW re new letters 0.00
57684 TIME Berne, Ceody g 211.50 10.58
2{812014 21812014 = (.00 U
' Hedrick 0.00
Call Wanda to add names to visit list 0.00
57885 TIME Berpe, Cody 1.30 211.50 274.95
21812014 21812014 Review 0.00 u
Hedrick 0.00
Read new letters and attachppefits e Q.00
57686 - TIME __, Beme, Cody 840 211,50~ 21,16 (. a5€
21912014 21912014 _Admin. 000 71 o /
/ o ',,.'r’ Hedrick ’M”,M‘"J 0. OQ o i ) A ) ot e
Adeas f6F task list and emailts 5'CW and . L0700
Aniga
57730 TME _Jassawallg, A 200 24150 423:60 a8
21412044 <7 21412014 Meeting” 0.00 " U P : '
S Hedfick 0.60 * /
Hedrick tedim mtq with Prof. White arid ~0.00 Sl R
CO'iy_z/
0
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412512014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic
4119 PM Slip Listing Page 51
Slip ID User Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time  Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Dreseription Réference Variance TR
( [7740 TiME Berne, COGY 0.15 211.50 C|erical; ViSit not
2110/2014 2/10/2014  TCT 0.00 u
| Hedrick 0.00 shown to concern

schedule

Call Wanda twice to set up ac[ditionawﬂ/—
jail visit, get details about visiting decree

relevant portions of

5¥741
2i10/2014

TIME 0.10

0.00

Berne, Cody
Admin.

Hedrick

211072014

Emails wi Anisa and White re
additional people to visit and Cropsey

211.50

not shown to
concern relevant
portions of decree

[not shown to

concern relevant
portions of decree

i

questions
| .
7742 TIME ‘Berne, Cody 6.10 211.5
2i110/2014 211072014 Review
Hedric 0.00
Read Cropsey piping declarati 0.00
/ email from Anisa
57743 TIME Berne, Cody 0.30 2118
/ 2/11/2014 211112014 Meeting 0.00

not shown to
concern relevant

portions of decree

Hedrick .
Speak wi Anisa about next steps i 0.00
case

50

ol e

57744 TIME Beme. Cody T, 21
2/11/2014 2/11/2014  Travel 0.00
Hedrick 0.00

Pick up UC Davis car, drive {o jail<—

not shown to concern
relevant portions of
decree

57745 TIME 00 211.50 834.50
2111/2014 211142014 0.00 U
0.00
Interviews at jail w/ Sanchg: 0.00
and Pendergraph
57746 TIME Berne, Cody 1.30 211.50 27485
2/11/2014 2i11/2014  Travel 0.0¢ U
Hedrick 0.00
n drive to Davis 0.00
57747 TIME Berne, Cody 0.55 211{not shown to
211142014 211172014 Draft 0.00

d concern relevant
: M i fd
Write Tyson declaration re jail intercom 0.00 portions of decree

57748 TIME Berne, Cody 0.15 211.50 31.73
2i12:2014 2112i2014 | Research 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00
15 al

415
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412512014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic
418 PM Slip Listing Page
Slip ID User Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description Reference Variance
Research on Yuba court website about 0.00
how fo search for past cases
57749 TIME Berne, Cody 075  [notshown to
2/1212014 211212014  Draft 0 concern relevant

Hedrick
Write Sanchez cleaning declaration
and Tyson exercise declaration

57750 TiME Berne, Cody
21212014 20122014  Draft
Hedrick

Write Sanchez safely and cle

declaration
57751 TIME Berne, Cody
2/13/2014 2i13/2014  Draft
Hedrick

Write three declarations for
Pendergraph

57752
211372014

TIME Berne, Cody
Review

Hedrick

2/13/2014

Review declarations for Sanchez,
Tyson and Pendergraph and emai
declarations to White and Anisa

0.00

portions of decree
0.00

not shown to
concern relevant
portions of decree

0.85

0.00

not shown to
concern relevant
portions of decree

.85

0.00

0.00

0.80 not shown to

0 concern relevant
0.00 portions of decree

0.60

57753 .~ TIME ) Berne, Cody 0.55 .~"211.50 11633
211372014 2132014 Adnfin. .60 u
. o .~ Hedrick _~70.00
Print labels, gre?}’are mailing, andwrite ¢ 0.00
letter to Sarichez re signing his
/—fﬂéﬂmﬁaﬁsw
e Fis i o i clerical; not shown
5775 erne, y :
2113120114 2/13/2014 TCT ; to concern relevant
, edric 0.00

Two phone calls to Wanda to schedul

0.00

portions of decree/J

\ jail visit for Tuesday
57755 TIME Berne, Cody 0.10 1.50 2115

211372014 211372014 TCT
Heddck
Call and emails from White re picking
LeRER documents from Vacek
57756 TIME Berne, Cody
271412014 211412014 Travel
Hedrick

Pick up LIC Davis car, Drive to and

0.00 U
0.00
0.00

2.60 211.50
0.00 u
0.00

G.00

549.90

2.7

52

i
& VBt 87

radl
{}"' P .,.)
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4125/2014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic
419 PM Slip Listing Page &3
SlipID User Units Rate  Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time  Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time _ Bill Status
—Deseription Reference Variance _
from Yuba County Office and >

Courthouse

§7TST e —— : i GEI e S Y

2182014~ 2i1812014 Afavel 000 A 2 Sondhey
7 ; " Hedrick 7 0.00 0 = ;
" Drop ff rental car - P _ 12.5% Unspecified RFP

compensable

57758 TIME Berne, Cody Total compensable =.125 x 1.20
211412014 211412014  Review | 0.00 - 15
Jedrick 0.00 ===

Review documents obtained via RFP

(.00 0 ore
from Vacek 12.5% Unspecified RFP

compensable

57750 TIME Berne, Cody Total compensable =.125 x .15
2i14/2Q14 2114i2014  Meeling 0.00 |= 02
Hedricl 0.00 /—
Speak wi Vacek at his office, pick up 0.00
RFP documents
57760 TIME Berne, Cody 0.75 211.50 15863
2M14/2014 2/14/2014  Research 0.00 U
Fegrick 0.00
Search for cases at Yuba County 0.00
involving jail, use county computers
and speak with court staff not shown to
pr—— — 5 - concern relevant
57 M eme, Cody ;
201712014 21172014 Revise oigo LROrtions of decree
Hecr 0.00
Read Malone deciarations written by 0.00

Anisa Not shown to concern relevant
portions of decree. See Entries

57797 TIME Jassawalla, A - )
201112014 211112014  Travel 0.00|NOS- 57755-57746.
Hexlr 0.00

Yuba (inunty Jail Visit and Interviews 0.00
57768 TIME _ Jassawalla, A 1.50 211.50 317.25
211412014 2/14/2014  Drait 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00
Draft Malene Declaration 0.00
” - /\L not shown to
5779 “TIME Jassawalla, A. 7
2f18f292’53/r " antenois sl oo |concern relevant Ao p.
25 A o~ Hedrick " ooo [|portions of decree ¢
Pick up discovery from Vacek, Yuta 0.00

ACounty Supetior Court visit, begin to
review digcovery

o2 QT z:i}
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412512014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic

4:14 PM Slip Listing Page 54

Slip D User Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time———— Activity DNB Time  Rate Info w
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status :

mn Reference Variance

57837  TIVE Beme, Cody 211,50 4230 f

2/18/2014 211812014 Admin.

Look up number of jail visits and
interviews during this case and emall
results to White, Anisa

57838
2018/2014

TIME
2/18/2014

Talk to White re RFE documents and
pick upcar from fleet services

# of entries = 2 (Talk to White re
RFP (.1); Pick Up Car (.1))

12.5% of RFP Compensable (.0125)
Pick up car not compensable. See
Entry No. 57840 (below).

Hedrick

Berne, Cody 0.20
0.00[Total = .0125
0.00 SR
0.0¢ [# of entries: 3 ((Travel) (1.25 hr);

Wait (.075); Review (.075)).

Travel & wait not compensable

57839 TIME Berne, Cody 1.40 al

211812014 2/18/2014  Travel 0.00 [because visit not shown to concern

B RFP’f‘td“Ci g-gg relevant portions of decree (2hrs).

ait for Anisa, drive to jail, review :

i See Entry No. _5_7840 (belovy).
——— 12.5% unspecified RFP review
57840 TIME Berne, Cody 3.20 compensable

271872014 2/18/2014  Visit 0.00 _

: Hedrick o.00 |10tal Compensable = 125 x .075

Interview Azevedo, Susoeff, and have 0.00|=.01

Pendergraph sign his declarations

not shown to
57841 TIME Berne, Cody concern relevant B0

2182014 2182014 Travel 0,00 portions of decree

Drive to Davis from jail 0.00
57842 TIME Berne, Cody 0.10 |clerical/not shown |5

2018726014 2”9_!2014 Adimin, p to concern re'evant

Hedrick

Copy Tyson declaration and submit
declarations to be filed B

57843 TIME
211912014 21192014
Write and edit Azevedo dedlaration
57644 TIME
21192014 2119/2014
Write Susoeff safety declaration
57845 TIME
21192014 2/18/2014

Write and edit Susoeff drug use,

portions of decree

0.00
Berne, Cody 0.55 [not shown to 33
Draft 0.00 lconcern relevant
Hedric 0.00 .

0.00 |Portions of decree
Berne, Cody 0.40 |not shown to 50
Draft 0.00 Jconcern relevant
Hedrick .

0.00 |Portions of decree
Berne, 1.45 211.50 306.68
Dr 0.00 U
edrick .00

0.00

02 a, T
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41252014 King Hali Civil Rights Clinic
419 PM Slip Listing Page 55
Slip ID User Units Rate Slip Vaive
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time  Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description Reference Varance
exercise, and revise safety declaration;
email all declarations to White, Anisa __n__uﬂ#ﬂ//ﬁ
e s
57846 TIME Berne, Cody 0.10 clerical / not shown
212002014 2120/2014 I!gz-:li-rick 0.00 to concern relevant
] Two phone calls with Wanda to portions of decree
schedule jail visit for next weekTwo
k phone calls with Wanda to schedule jail
, ¥isit for next week e
57847 TIME Berne, Cody 0.10  |not shown to
21202014 2120/2014  Admin. 0.0 concern relevant
Hedrick 0.00 ;
Emails w/ White and Anisa re jail visit ogp lportions of decree
next week
57848  TIME _~ _ Beme,C 0.05 21150 " 1056~ o
212012014 /,/ 2 014  Admin: ‘3’,1«8{5/ Pl gl oot { Erte f
A Hédrick 70000 7
Refile misfiled jail lettérs 0.00
not shown to
57849 TIME Berne, Cody 0.45
212012014 2120/2014  Drait 3 Con(.:em relevant
Hedrick 0.00 portions of decree
Write letter to Suseceff and include info 0.00
from LSPWC re suing a local public
entity
. ’ o 12.5% unspecified RFP
5785 TIME Berne, Cody e
2125/2014 2/25/2014  Review 000 |compensable
Fediick : Total Compensable
Begin reading through RFP documents 0.00 = 125x4.3= 54
1,2,3, 7, and % of 20
57865 TIME Jassawalla, A. 3.00 211.50 834.50
271812014 2/1812014  Travel 0.00 B
Hedrick 0.00 not shown to
Travel to Yuba COUﬁty for Jail& 000 concern re'evant
interviews .
portions of decree
57866 TIME Jassawalla, A, .30 211.50 697.95
2118/2014 2(18/2014  Visit 0.00 U
_ Hedri 0.00
Conduct Interviews witht Inmates Kiflion 0.00
and Hernandez-Trujiflo
57867 TIME Jassawalla, A, 4.50 211.50 951.75
2{23/2014 22312014  Draft 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00

.54

1465

4
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4/25/2014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic
4:19 PM Slip Listing Page 56
Slip ID User Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description Reference Variance
Draft Declarations for Killion, 0.00
Hernandez-Trujillo and Carranza
ME sawalla, A. 1.50 63
2124/ Revis;/ / 5 A &
‘ Hedri
not shown to
57894 TIME Berne, Cody
2/24/2014 2/24/2014  Review . |concern relevant
o Hedri |portions of decree

Read letters from York and Love

57895
2/24/2014

TIME
2/24/2014

Read declarations from
Hernandez-Truijillo, Killion, and
Carranza; email comments to White

and Anisa

57897
2/25/2014

Texts, emails w/ White and Anisa re jail

visit

57898
2/25/2014

TIME

TIME

2/25/2014

2/25/2014

Review RFP 15, 17, 18

57899

57900
2/25/2014

Talk

TIME
2;25x2011/
Print Yor

2/25/2014

d Love letters

TIME

Anisa about case

Berne, Co
124/2014  Admin- 0.0
drick 00
< 0.00

ideas memo

Berne, Cody
Review
Hedrick

0.25

Berne, Cody
Admin.
Hedric

Aon an

not shown to
concern relevant
portions of decree

.So /52‘138/07(6;/3

not shown to
concern relevant
portions of decree

12.5% RFP compensable
Total Compensable =.125 x .5
=.06

0 1A
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4/25/2014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic
4:19 PM Slip Listing Page 57
Slip ID User Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description Reference Variance
57901 TIME Berne, Cody 1.20 211.50 253.80
2/25/2014 2/25/2014  Travel 0.00 ]
Hedrick 0.00
Drive to jail 0.00
57902 TIME Berne, Co ! 348.98
2/25/2014 2/25/2014  Meeting 0.00
Hedrick not shown to
Meet w/ York, Susoeff and Azevedo concern
£ b kg relevant
57803 TIME Berne, Cod 50 253.8 i f
2/25/2014 2/25/2014 U portions o
Hedrick decree
Drive back from jail
57904 TIME 211.50 52.88
2/26/2014 2/26/2014 0.00 u
0.00
Print and mail letter, packet from 0.00
LSPWC to Susoeff
57905 TIME Berne, Cody 0.10 211.50 21.15
2/28/2014 2/28/2014  Admin. 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00
Email from White re conversation w/ 0.00
Vacek about time extension
57906 TIME Berne, Cody 1.85 211.50 391.28
3/2/2014 31212014 Research 0.00 u
Hedrick 0.00
Research power to modify consent 0.00
decree; read Rule 60b5; review Horne
v. Flores and Rufo v. Inmates of Suffolk
County Jail; write notes about research
57953 TIME Jassawalla, A. 1.25 211.50 264.38
212512014 2/25/2014 \liisiit' ) ggg U not shown to
edric )
Meet with Killion and concern relevant
Hernandez-Trujillo to sign Declarations portions of decree
57954 TIME Jassawalla, A. 0.75 211.50 158 A3
212712014 2/27/2014  Draft 0.00 U not shown to

_ HW— concern relevant
Write letters to Malone and Carranza re . portions of decree

Declarations

57955 TIME Jassawalla, A. 3.75
2/25/2014 2/25/2014  Travel 0.00
Hedrick 0.00

Travel to Yuba County for Jail 0.00

211.50
U

793.13

1.95 1 2.0
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42512014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic
419 PM Slip Listing Page 58
Slip 1D User Units Rate |not shown to
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client E } il Status Con?em relevant
__Description : Variance portions of decree
Interviews and Wai fers at the
Jail e =N
58014 TIME B Cod 0.55 211.50 not shown (o
: erne, Cody 5 11.
3/3/2014 31312014 Review 0, U _|concern relevant
Hedrick 0.00 portions of decree
Read brief in Barrington Lyon v. ICE 0.00 \
58015 TIME Berne, Cody 0.05 211.50 [not shown to
31312014 31312014 Re\éiew 0.00 concern relevant
Hedrigk : .
Read letter from Carranz 0.00 portions of decree
B . Berne, Cody 1.20 - ; L2 '(’-‘_
15/2014 3:5@1’4 Meezmﬁ 0eo Pl : £
3 /Hédrtck 000 D LONT -
Hedrig meeimg dsscuss’RSOb ard 0.00
jointStatement of facts”
!({'} B
58017 TIME Berne, Cody 2k 20~ 211. 50 253.80 { {
315/2014 /2014 Admin, on T R D
s L ng:,}iigk 12.5% Joint Statement Compensable | 4~ €/1¢¢/
Organize joint statement of facts task &Total compensable =.125x 1 =.13
wi Anisa; copy jail policy manual and
all signed-declarations
58018 TIME Berne, Cody™ 0.10 _-211.50 21,15 - (e c
31512018 55 12014 Admirt” 0.00-" TR Gt
> il _~Hedrick 00 !
Ema:l Anisa 2 pe mlsamg Susceff 0.60
/ﬂec’am‘ms‘ 33% of sections drafted concern
58019 TIME Berne, Cody 7.20 |relevant portions of decree
316/2014 3/6i2014  Draft 0.00 (library)
Hedrick : _
\ Write draft of undisputed facts re 0.00 Iotal compensable = .33 x 7.2
hygiene, library, and yard =2.38
5 TVIE Bermne, Cody 0.15 21150 31.73
37014 3712014 Review 0.00 U
_ Hedrick 0.00
Read dkt 1251, 125, and 126 re time 0.00 SN
_——exiension-requests-tocourt
58021 TIME Berne, Cody 0.90 [not shown to 5
3712014 72014 gregt‘ ) 8‘00 concern relevant
adric ; .
Draff part of ICE section of undisputed 0.00 portions of decree
\ facts
1
. I

266 | (f 06
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4125/2014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic
419 PM Slip Listing Pags 59
Slip 1D User Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time  Rate info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status|not shown to
Description Reference Variance concern relevant
58022 TIME - Beme, Cody 50 . Y
21712014 AT2014  RevieW y [portions of decree féxfl__,;;_y_ﬁ
i pHédrick ’

E/fﬁﬂ/court ord?fﬁenyl’ﬂg time &

ktension 7

# of entries: 2 (finished ICE section
W TR geme, Dody 0.191(2.10 hrs); "edit my half" of
372014 4 Review 0.00 .
| _ Hadfick 0.00|undisputed facts (2.10hrs))
/ Read Johnsoryisher ' 0.00|Finish ICE section = not
58024 TIME Berne, Cody Comperlllsat?le .
3/8/2044 3/8/2014  Revise 33% of "edit my half' compensable

0.00|(see Entry No. 58019)

Hedrick
Finish draft of ICE section of 0.00|Total compensable = .33 x 2.10
undisputed facts; revise and edit my — : '
half of the undisputaed facts and email =.69
draft to White and Anisa
. = =
58322?2014 T 31512014 ;:;%sstgvfaila, i %J‘ég not shown to concern relevant
/ J eeting . . . :
Hedrick a.0o |Portions of plecre_e since access to £
~TFeanriMesting-and Prep Documents for 0.00 |legal materials (library) section .
Writing a Statement of Facts already written
68076 TIME Jagsawalla, A. §.00 211.50 asa-na
3/7/2014 37/2014  Draft 0.00 u not shown to
Hedrick 0.00 concern relevant
Draft Statement of Facts for Hedrick 0.00 portions of decree
Case
— — . oo _— 12.5% undisputed facts
erne, Cody 0.
311112014 3/11/2014  Meeting g.0g |compensable
Hedrick 0.00 [Total Compensable =.125 x .05
Speak wi White re Vacek phone call, 0.001= 01
undisputed facts
58082 TIME Berne, Cody 0.90 211.50 190.35
- Hedrick 0.00 |
Begin reading Anisa statement of facts; _ 585 Con(_:em relevant
read through medical reports in RFP 14~ portions of decree
58083 TIME Berne, Cody 120 21150 25386 2 fre
31 mzwf‘ 3112014 Mesting /g,so/ U A A0
. _Hedrick ~0.00 n
i-ledﬁﬁk meeting < 0.00 not shown to
concern relevant
311212014 3/12/2014 Research 0.00 U P
Hedrick 0.00

715
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4i25i2014 King Hali Civil Rights Clinic
419 PM Slip Listing Page 80
Slip ID User Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description Reference Variance
experts
compensable
58085 TIME Berne, Cotly 40 |Total compensable =.125
3/13/2014 3/13/2014  Admin. 0.00 |x 4= 05
_ Hedric 0.00
{\:,:f:;{s from White re facts sent to 0.00 12 5% undipsuted facts
' compensable
58086 TIME i Berng, Cody 0.30 |[Total compensable = .125
311312014 31312014 Mesting 0.00( 3= o4
Hedric (010 ) —
Tallk about fact statement strategy w/ 0.00
Anisa, White
58087 TIME Berne, Cody 020  |nOtshownto
3/14/2014 3/14/2014  Draft concern relevant
Hexdrick 0.00 portions of decree
Write reply letters to Susoeff and Tyson 0.00
58088 TIME Berne, Cody 020  |notshownto
3/14/2014 3i14/2014  Meeting ' concern relevant
Hedric 0.00 portions of decree
Discuss which ICE standards apply 0.00
5808 TIME—— Beme. Coay 5p—{1Ot shown o
3/14/2014 3/14/2014  Review - concern relevant
_ Hedrick 0.00 |portions of decree
Read medical incident reports in RFP 0.00
14
not shown to
58092 TIME Jassawalla, A 3.00 concern relevant
371072014 3/10/2014  Draft 0.00 :
Hednek 0.00 pprtlons of decree
Writing Statement of Facts for Hedrick ¢ g-o—SINCe access to
Case legal materials
58093 FWE » Jassawalla, AJ " 1.00 (library) sections £ A5,
31 /@f o 31172014~ Meeting 0.00 |already written
s Hednck’ 0.00—" e Coowt
Hggnck Team Meeting .~ 0760
58004 _~TIME Jassawalla, A_— 035 |notshownto 2G5k
3;13:20’14 ,f 3/13/2014 fi\ffeet:ng,.« concern relevant SR
4 i He{im‘fk .6 portions of decree s 5
Hedrick Mcé’tmg CRS Semirfar .00 KAgiE
58095 TIME Jassawalla, A. 3.00 211.50 634.50
42014 3472014 Review 0.00 U
Hedrick 0.00
.09
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41252014 King HMall Civil Rights Clinic
4:19 PM Slip Listing Page 61
Slip 1D User Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description Reference Variance
Read Through Medical Incident 0.00
Reports
R
58096 TIME Jassawalla, A. 2.50 211.50  |not shown to
311412014 3/1412014  Revise 0.00 concern relevant
Hedrick : ;
Revise Statement of Facts, 2000 ICE 0.00 portions of decree
Report
i TiRAE | : u\r!l'\v \..r(.)_d? " = 040 , L ! -.3’. 2 3
712014 73712014 Review 0.60 W g™ T i o
f}H/ e -~ Hedrick~ 000" o~ A ‘"”j’ .
Review emaif cham re facts aeni’ o fd 00
Vacek and controliing ICE standards
58188 TIME” BegmeCody 0.30 24150 6345 .t 2
%117!2014 /ME 3;1?90‘14,/1?&3?& 0.00_~" U o k>
<7 Hedrick 40
Reé’l Vacek's praposed Jomt’ statement <« 0.00
-6f facts
58189 TINE Berne, Cody 0.70 24150 148,06~ ,,;7(‘;__, L
3!18:’20)4/ //”1'%'}1812014 Rewew’ 0.00 U g o #ﬂ
P _Medrick 0.60 Lihuc,
}ead joint szt of factflaw _~0.00
updated by White
58190 Tl _~Beme, Cody _—"T10 211.50.~"" 23285 PaSe€
311812014, 3113%%14 Meeting 000 e e
P Hedrick.~ 0.00.~" okt -
Hedfick weekly maeting < 000
58191 TIME Berne, Cody 0.85 21450 17978~ . :
3/18/2014 3/1812014 _ RéSearch 0.00~" U /71 ﬁhf“f?«"'!ﬁ-}{
il """ Hedrick B0 :
Reseg:}rch law re enforcmg,c&r‘tsent -7 0.00
rees
58192 TIME .~ -~ Beme, Cady 0.50 244:50 10875 i B it
1872014 .~ 3;1§¢2U1’5 Draft” 000 " U /./M PREBLREN
~Hedrick 0. 00 g
Wnte,short outline re- ern‘orcmg gongent 00
detfee, include edse cites
58193  TIME . _Befiie. Cody” 085 21150 A%7.48 /
3190Md 311912014 Review” gﬁof U Pty Ea
R - Herick 700 il {
Read ACLU info on ICE standards .~ < 0.00
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4125602014 King Hall Civil Rights Clinic
418 PM Slip Listing Page 63
Slip 1D User Units Rate Slip Value
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info
Posting Status Client Est. Time  Bill Status
Description Reference Variance .
58243 TIME Bere, Cody -~ 1.05 211,507 22308 Ve e
41112014 / 41112014~ Meeting " 0.00 o W
pd Hedrick” 0.00 2 e
Hedriek weekly meeting 080 = SeerIRET
58244 TIME Berne, Cody 0.25 211.50 52.88
41172014 4{1/2014 Admin. ¢.00 u
Hedrick 0.00
Q}ordinate wi Anisa re G0b reply ¢.00
58245 L AIME e aine, Cody 0.20 31150 4340 -
41112044 ~TA2014 Admine” = 060" U v 2 1‘/ &lcat
el 7 eﬁ/ﬁg{ck ~0.00 % e
" Download Hedfick files needed for60h v 0.00
58246 TIME Berne, Cody 0.90 211.50 not shown to
41112014 4/1/2014 Draft 0.00 U concern relevant

[
/
f
a

Qutline my portion of 80b argument

58247
41172014

TIME

writing safety section

Berne, Cody

1.70

58248
47212014

TIME
4/212014

Continue working on safety section

not shown to
58249 TIME Berne, Cody 0.90 211.50
4212014 41212014 Draft 0.00 concem relevant
: Hedriek 00 portions of decree
Write hygiene and safety sections 0.00
58250 E _ .~ Beme, Cody 030 211.50,~" 6345 //
41212014 4/2{2014" Research 5 0.00 o Z P )
% P Hedrick .~ 0.00 J
Read Burrell's order re no-ieed for 60b 0.00
jiir1g; research LR 240~
58251 TIME . Beme, Cody™™" 0.90 214.50 190:35 s e
4731204 7 4l312014  Meeting 000 .~ U 7 TR
il _Hédrick 000 ‘ ;
Hedrick neeting after Yuba's motior fo 7 0:00 Lo A

termindie denied ’

Berna, Cody

1.10

Hedrick
0.00 T

211.50

41112014 Draft .00
Hedrick ;
Write exercise 60b section, begin 0.00

211.50

portions of decree

not shown to
concern relevant
portions of decree

-|not shown to
concern relevant
portions of decree

Draft 0.00
Hedrick ;
0.00

25 ,_/;} b g c;




	I. Motion foR an Extension of Time
	II. Attorney’s Fees Motion
	a. Legal Standard
	b. Discussion
	i. Whether Plaintiffs Are Prevailing Parties for the Purposes of § 1988
	ii. Whether the Prison Litigation Reform Act Limits the Amount of Attorney’s Fees Plaintiffs Recover
	iii. Whether Law Students Worked Reasonable Hours Defending Relevant Portions of The Consent Decree
	iv. Hourly Rate For Plaintiffs’ Counsel and Law Students
	v. Whether Adjustment to the Loadstar is Warranted
	vi. Whether Travel Expenses Should be Reimbursed
	vii. Whether Plaintiffs Are Awarded Fees for Time Expended on The Fee Motion
	viii. Whether Plaintiffs Are Awarded Interest on Their Fee Award
	ix. Total Attorney’s Fees Award
	Appendix 1

		Superintendent of Documents
	2023-09-14T17:06:27-0400
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




