
Program No. 0322-S Term Date of Award To May 31, 2012
Title:     Servicewide Park Specific Passes

Gray Graphics Knightsbridge Graphics Vanguard ID System
BASIS OF Capitol Heights, MD High Point, NC West Chester, PA

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AWARD UNIT RATE COST UNIT RATE COST UNIT RATE COST
I. PRINTING AND BINDING:
   (a) Category 1- Rigid Vinyl 25 to 100 passes

……………………….…...………………………...per pass
      (1) Makeready and/or Setup 8 450.00 3,600.00 25.00 200.00 50.00 400.00
      (2) Running Per 100 Copies 4 244.00 976.00 89.00 356.00 1.00 4.00
   (b) Category 2- Rigid Vinyl over 100 up to 500 passes

……………………….…...………………………...per pass
      (1) Makeready and/or Setup 9 450.00 4,050.00 25.00 225.00 50.00 450.00
      (2) Running Per 100 Copies 27 244.00 6,588.00 89.00 2,403.00 0.90 24.30
   (c) Category 3 - Rigid Vinyl - over 500 up to 1,000 passes

……………………….…...………………………...per pass
      (1) Makeready and/or Setup 14 450.00 6,300.00 25.00 350.00 50.00 700.00
      (2) Running Per 100 Copies 112 228.00 25,536.00 89.00 9,968.00 0.75 84.00
   (d) Category 4 - Rigid Vinyl - over 1,000 up to 5,000 passes

……………………….…...………………………...per pass
      (1) Makeready and/or Setup 10 450.00 4,500.00 25.00 250.00 50.00 500.00
      (2) Running Per 100 Copies 400 215.00 86,000.00 89.00 35,600.00 0.55 220.00
   (e) Category 5 - Rigid Vinyl - over 5,000 up to 10,000 passes

……………………….…...………………………...per pass
      (1) Makeready and/or Setup 8 450.00 3,600.00 25.00 200.00 50.00 400.00
      (2) Running Per 100 Copies 560 200.00 112,000.00 89.00 49,840.00 0.45 252.00
   (f) Category 6 - Rigid Vinyl - over 10,000 passes 

……………………….…...………………………...per pass
      (1) Makeready and/or Setup 3 450.00 1,350.00 25.00 75.00 50.00 150.00
      (2) Running Per 100 Copies 500 185.00 92,500.00 89.00 44,500.00 0.40 200.00
   (g) Category 1 - Corn Card  25 to 100 passes 

……………………….…...………………………...per pass
      (1) Makeready and/or Setup 4 450.00 1,800.00 25.00 100.00 No Bid 0.00
      (2) Running Per 100 Copies 2 244.00 488.00 91.00 182.00 No Bid 0.00
   (h) Category 2 - Corn Card  over 100 up to 500 passes

……………………….…...………………………...per pass
      (1) Makeready and/or Setup 4 450.00 1,800.00 25.00 100.00 No Bid 0.00
      (2) Running Per 100 Copies 12 244.00 2,928.00 91.00 1,092.00 No Bid 0.00
   (i) Category 3 - Corn Card  over 500 up to 1,000 passes

……………………….…...………………………...per pass
      (1) Makeready and/or Setup 6 450.00 2,700.00 25.00 150.00 No Bid 0.00
      (2) Running Per 100 Copies 48 228.00 10,944.00 91.00 4,368.00 No Bid 0.00
   (j) Category 4 - Corn Card over 1,000 up to 5,000 passes

……………………….…...………………………...per pass
      (1) Makeready and/or Setup 5 450.00 2,250.00 25.00 125.00 No Bid 0.00
      (2) Running Per 100 Copies 100 215.00 21,500.00 91.00 9,100.00 No Bid 0.00
   (k) Category 5 - Corn Card over 5,000 up to 10,000 passes

……………………….…...………………………...per pass
      (1) Makeready and/or Setup 3 450.00 1,350.00 25.00 75.00 No Bid 0.00
      (2) Running Per 100 Copies 240 200.00 48,000.00 91.00 21,840.00 No Bid 0.00
   (l) Category 6 - Corn Card over 10,000 passes 

……………………….…...………………………...per pass
      (1) Makeready and/or Setup 1 450.00 450.00 25.00 25.00 No Bid 0.00
      (2) Running Per 100 Copies 200 185.00 37,000.00 91.00 18,200.00 No Bid 0.00
II. PACKING AND DISTRIBUTION:
   (a) Bundling in units of 50……………………………

……………………………………….per container 4,410 1.00 4,410.00 0.15 661.50 0.50 2,205.00
   (b) Packing and sealing shipping containers……..

……………………………………….per container 250 2.00 500.00 1.50 375.00 No Charge 0.00

CONTRACTOR TOTALS $483,120.00 $200,360.50 $5,589.30
DISCOUNT 5.00% $24,156.00 0.02% $40.07 0.00% $0.00

DISCOUNTED TOTALS $458,964.00 $200,320.43 $5,589.30

AWARDED 
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