1704-M

1. Regular, White Writing 20# or White Wove 24#
Categories 1

(2) 3-T/8 X 8-7/8", H#O..oeeoeeeeeeeeeeeeeereeeen

(b) 4-1/8 X 9-1/2", #10.....ccvvecririiiciieeeee

(C) 4-1/2 X 10-3/8", #1 L.
Categories 2

(2) 3-T/8 X 8-7/8", H#O..oeeoeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeer

(b) 4-1/8 x 9-1/2", #10....

() 4-1/2 X 10-3/8", #1 L.
Categories 3

(2) 3-T/8 X 8-7/8", #9..oeeoeeeeeeeeeeeeeereees

(b) 4-1/8 X 9-1/2", #10.....ccvvecririieiieeecee

(C) 4-1/2 X 10-3/8", #1 L.
Categories 4

(2) 3-T/8 X 8-7/8", #9...eeeeeeeeeeeeeeeereeeen

(b) 4-1/8 x 9-1/2", #10....

(C) 4-1/2 X 10-3/8", #1 L.,
2. Window, White Writing 20# or White Wove 24#
Categories 1

(a) 3-7/8 x 8-7/8", #9...

(b) 4-1/8 x 9-1/2", #10....

(C) 4-1/2 X 10-3/8", #1 L.
Categories 2

(2) 3-T/8 X 8-7/8", #O...oeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeees

(b) 4-1/8 X 9-1/2", #10.....ccvicrireiiciieeeee

(C) 4-1/2 X 10-3/8", #1 L.
Categories 3

(2) 3-T/8 X 8-7/8", #9..oeeoeeeeeeeeeeeeeereeenen

(b) 4-1/8 x 9-1/2", #10....

(c) 4-1/2 x 10-3/8", #11
Categories 4

(2) 3-T/8 X 8-7/8", H#O..oeeoeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeer

(b) 4-1/8 X 9-1/2", #10.....ccvecririiieciieeee

(C) 4-1/2 X 10-3/8", #1 L.

3. Regular, White Writing 20# or White Wove 24#

Security Tint

Categories 1

(2) 3-T/8 X 8-7/8", #9...oeeoeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeene

(b) 4-1/8 X 9-1/2", #10.....ccvveririiiciieeee

(C) 4-1/2 X 10-3/8", #1 L.
Categories 2

(2) 3-T/8 X 8-7/8", #O...oeeoeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeen

(b) 4-1/8 x 9-1/2", #10....

(€) 4-1/2 X 10-3/8", #1 Lo,

PAPER & ENV.

@ B P @ B P @ B P P H B @ B h @ B P @ B P

@ B h

@ B H

@ B P

DESERT

29.74
28.69
53.84

26.79
25.74
50.56

23.56
22.51
46.77

22.46
21.41
45.35

32.04
31.74
57.13

29.09
28.79
53.84

25.86
25.57
50.05

24.76
24.47
48.65

32.08
31.49
68.84

29.13
28.54
55.30

ST LOUIS
PRINT

$36.00
$35.00
$47.00

$34.00
$31.10
$42.30

$23.75
$19.25
$34.00

$15.75
$15.25
$26.10

$39.10
$41.20
$48.00

$36.20
$33.10
$46.00

$28.50
$24.10
$36.20

$18.25
$15.75
$28.10

$39.10
$38.20
$50.10

$36.00
$32.90
$47.90

CENVEO

$29.57
$29.89
NO BID

$20.21
$20.53
NO BID

$19.03
$19.36
NO BID

$18.34
$18.66
NO BID

NO BID
$32.36
NO BID

NO BID
$23.00
NO BID

NO BID
$21.83
NO BID

NO BID
$21.13
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NOCONA
ENV & TAG

$30.00
$30.00
$48.00

$28.00
$28.00
$45.00

$27.00
$27.00
$43.00

$26.00
$26.00
$40.00

$32.00
$32.00
$50.00

$30.00
$30.00
$48.00

$28.00
$28.00
$46.00

$26.00
$26.00
$44.00

$36.00
$36.00
$58.00

$34.00
$34.00
$56.00

N. AMERICAN
ENVELOPE

&+ B P &+ B P B B H ¥ B &+ B H &+ BB &+ B P

* BB

&+ B H

&+ B H

24.10
24.10
36.50

23.10
23.10
35.50

22.10
22.10
33.10

17.50
17.50
29.85

26.10
25.10
38.50

25.10
24.10
37.50

24.10
23.60
35.10

19.50
19.50
31.80

25.60
24.60
43.50

24.60
23.60
42.50

THE PRINT

B P BB B+ N ¥ B &+ B+ &+ B H &+ B P

&+ B P

&+ B H

&+ B H

HOUSE

30.00
30.00
40.00

23.75
23.75
33.75

20.00
20.00
30.00

17.25
17.25
27.25

32.50
32.50
42.50

26.25
26.25
36.25

22.50
22.50
32.50

19.75
19.75
29.75

31.50
31.50
45.00

25.25
25.25
38.75

TAYLOR
TEX

$36.04
$37.03
$48.42

$26.92
$28.24
$39.42

$25.80
$23.94
$33.98

$24.75
$23.00
$33.67

$38.67
$39.30
$51.00

$29.55
$30.17
$47.50

$26.22
$29.05
$39.03

$25.28
$26.55
$37.72

$37.99
$38.67
$59.60

$28.86
$29.55
$51.70

PRINGING

BOWERS

RESOURCES ENVELOPE

$35.00
$35.00
$50.00

$30.00
$30.00
$45.00

$22.00
$22.00
$38.00

$18.00
$18.00
$34.00

$37.00
$37.00
$54.00

$32.00
$32.00
$49.00

$24.00
$24.00
$42.00

$20.00
$20.00
$38.00

$37.00
$37.00
$54.00

$32.00
$32.00
$49.00

$56.00
$56.00
$85.00

$32.00
$32.00
$46.00

$26.00
$26.00
$26.00

$22.00
$22.00
$35.00

$59.50
$59.50
NO BID

$41.00
$41.00
NO BID

$33.00
$33.00
NO BID

$25.00
$25.00
NO BID

$58.00
$58.00
NO BID

$39.00
$39.00
NO BID




Categories 3
(a) 3-7/8 X 8-7/8", #9...ceeeeeeieieeeeeee
(b) 4-1/8 X 9-1/2", #10.....ccvecriiiiiiiiieieee
() 4-1/2 X 10-3/8", #11L....cccuiieiiiiiieeeeeeneen
Categories 4
(a) 3-7/8 X 8-7/8", #9...ceeeeiiiiiieeeeee
(b) 4-1/8 X 9-1/2", #10.....ccvveririiiecnieeeeee
() 4-1/2 X 10-3/8", #11.....ccvviriiiiirireeseeneeee
4. Window, White Writing 20 Ib. or White Wove 24 |b.
Security tint
Categories 1
(@) 3-7/8 X 8-7/8", #9...oev e
(b) 4-1/8 X 9-1/2", #10.....cceiriiiiiiiieeeee
() 4-1/2 X 10-3/8", #11L.....ccviriiiiiiereeeecneenee
Categories 2
(@) 3-7/8 X 8-7/8", #9....eveeeeeeeeee e
(b) 4-1/8 x 9-1/2", #10
() 4-1/2 X 10-3/8", #11L.....ccvviriiiiirireeeeeeeee
Categories 3
(@) 3-7/8 X 8-7/8", #9...oev e
(b) 4-1/8 X 9-1/2", #10.....ccueiriiiiiieieeeee
() 4-1/2 X 10-3/8", #11L.....ccvviririiirireeeeceeene
Categories 4
(@) 3-7/8 X 8-7/8", #9...eveeeeeeeeee e
(b) 4-1/8 X 9-1/2", #10.....ccveriiiiiieiieeeeee
() 4-1/2 X 10-3/8", #11L.....ccviviiiiirireeeeceenee
5 Light Brown Kraft Env. 24 Ibs to 28 Ib, Open Side
Categories 1
(@) 3-9/16 x 7-7/8", check...........coooiiii .
(b) 3-7/8 X 8-7/8", #9...coeevieririeiceeee
() 4-1/8 X 9-1/2", #10...ccueeeeeieieeieee e
(d) 6-1/2 x9-1/2
(€) 7-1/2 X 10-1/2...ceiiiiiiiiieieiee e
(F) 9OXL2uiiiie e
(9) 9-1/2x 12
(h) 9-1/2 x 12-1/2
Categories 2
(a) 3-9/16 x 7-7/8", check..........ccovvviviiiann,
(b) 3-7/8 X 8-7/8", #9...c.eeeeeieicieeeeeee
(b) 4-1/8 X 9-1/2", #10.....ccvveririiiiieeeeee
(d) 6-2/2 X 9-1/2..cciiiiiiieieiee e
(€) 7-1/2 X 10-2/2ucceieeieeieeeeeee e
f) 9x 12,
(9) 9-1/2 X 12..ieiiieieeeeeeeee e
(h) 9-2/2 X 12-L/2.ceeiiiiiiiiiieee

* B P

®» B+

*» B s LR LR ®» B s

R R R R R

25.90
25.32
32.36

24.80
24.21
28.61

34.66
36.65
71.03

31.70
33.69
64.24

28.49
30.47
37.46

27.38
29.37
33.09

54.84
35.58
35.56
75.76
118.23
100.60
130.89
107.59

45.01
30.56
30.81
64.95
95.72
96.46
116.08
102.26

$24.75
$21.10
$35.00

$15.35
$15.84
$26.12

$42.00
$43.00
$51.10

$38.50
$35.00
$48.10

$30.20
$24.50
$38.30

$19.90
$15.90
$30.50

NO BID
$54.00
$54.00
$72.00
NO BID
$120.00
$120.00
$120.00

NO BID
$46.00
$46.00
$64.00
NO BID
$98.00
$98.00
$98.00

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$33.00
$33.00
$54.00

$32.00
$32.00
$53.00

$37.00
$37.00
$59.00

$35.00
$35.00
$57.00

$34.00
$34.00
$55.00

$33.00
$33.00
$54.00

$45.00
$42.00
$35.00
$57.00
$85.00
$74.00
$74.00
$74.00

$42.00
$39.00
$34.00
$55.00
$80.00
$70.00
$70.00
$70.00

B H B B P B PP B P B P B B P B H BB BB

&+ B P

23.60
23.10
40.10

19.10
19.10
36.80

27.60
26.60
45.50

26.60
25.60
44.50

25.00
25.10
42.10

21.10
21.10
38.80

73.40
37.50
25.90
54.80
NO BID
79.50
88.40
89.40

68.40
34.50
24.90
52.80
NO BID
75.50
78.50
79.50

B H B P B H BB B BB

B P

LR A

LR A A R

21.50
21.50
35.00

19.25
19.00
32.25

34.00
34.00
47.50

27.75
27.75
41.25

24.00
24.00
37.50

21.75
21.50
34.75

95.00
37.50
37.50
65.00
90.00
85.00
87.50
85.00

75.00
31.25
31.25
47.50
80.00
75.00
77.50
75.00

$27.74
$26.30
$39.52

$26.25
$25.55
$34.52

$40.01
$41.02
$61.80

$35.76
$31.89
$56.60

$28.79
$29.35
$40.10

$27.75
$28.05
$37.40

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$24.00
$24.00
$42.00

$20.00
$20.00
$38.00

$39.00
$39.00
$60.00

$34.00
$34.00
$54.00

$26.00
$26.00
$48.00

$22.00
$22.00
$44.00

$99.00
$99.00
$79.00
$80.00
$100.00
$90.00
$85.00
$90.00

$79.00
$79.00
$59.00
$75.00
$90.00
$85.00
$80.00
$85.00

$32.00
$32.00
NO BID

$24.50
$24.50
NO BID

$62.00
62
NO BID

$44.00
$44.00
NO BID

$36.00
$36.00
NO BID

$28.00
$28.00
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
$56.00
NO BID
NO BID
$110.00
$125.00
$131.00

NO BID
NO BID
$33.00
NO BID
NO BID
$107.00
$115.00
$120.00




Categories 3
(a) 3-9/16 x 7-7/8", check.........c.ccviiiiiiiiiii,
(a) 3-7/8 x 8-7/8", #9..........

(b) 4-1/8 x 9-1/2", #10....
(d) 6-1/2x9-1/2...........
(€) 7-1/2 X 10-1/2...ceiiieiiiiiieieieee e
(F) 9OXL2uiiiie e
(9) 9-1/2x 12
(h) 9-1/2 X 12-1/2....coiiiiiiiiiiiiiieeeeeeeee

Categories 4
(a) 3-9/16 x 7-7/8", check
(b) 3-7/8 x 8-7/8", #9..........
(c) 4-1/8 x 9-1/2", #10.
(d) 6-2/2 X 9-1/2..cciiiiiiiiieee e
(€) 7-1/2 X 10-1/2.ceeieiieeeeeeeee e
(f) 9x 12
(9) 9-1/2 X 12.ieiiieeeieeeeeeee e
(h) 9-2/2 X 12-1/2...ccoiiiiiiiieeeeeeee e
6. Light Brown Kraft 32# to 40# open side

Categories 1
() OXA2uiiiiiiie e
(D) 9-2/2 X 12
(C) 9-1/2 X 12-1/2..eoeeieeeeee e

Categories 2
() OXA2uiiiiiiiee e
(D) 9-2/2 X 12
(€) 9-1/2 X 12-1/2..eeeeeeeeeee e

Categories 3
() OXA2uiiiiiiiece e
(b) 9-1/2x12........
(c) 9-1/2 x 12-1/2

Categories 4
() OXA2uiiiiiiiiee e
(D) 9-2/2 X 12
(C) 9-1/2 X 12-1/2..eeeiieeeeee e
7. Light Brown Kraft 32# to 40# open end

Categories 1
(2) 9 X L2
(b) 9-1/2x12........
(c) 9-1/2x 12-1/2

Categories 2
(2) 9 X L2
(b) 9-1/2x 12
(€) 9-1/2 X 12-1/2..ccieeiiieieeieee e

Categories 3
(2) 9O X L2
(b) 9-1/2x12........
(c) 9-1/2 x 12-1/2

LR R R LR R o e

28.17
24.73
2531
52.21
67.38
91.70
82.86
95.81

25.14
22.00
22.65
47.89
62.91
89.91
82.38
93.23

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
$42.00
$42.00
$53.00
NO BID
$84.00
$86.00
$86.00

NO BID
$34.00
$34.00
$48.00
NO BID
$81.00
$83.00
$83.00

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$40.00
$36.00
$28.00
$51.00
$75.00
$65.00
$65.00
$65.00

$39.00
$35.00
$26.00
$50.00
$70.00
$63.00
$63.00
$63.00

$85.00
$85.00
$85.00

$83.00
$83.00
$83.00

$75.00
$75.00
$75.00

$73.00
$73.00
$73.00

$90.00
$90.00
$95.00

$88.00
$88.00
$92.00

$86.00
$86.00
$90.00

&+ B P &+ B H B P B P B P B P B B H B BB B P B PP

B BB

64.40
32.50
23.90
50.80
NO BID
72.50
75.50
76.50

54.40
28.50
22.40
49.80
NO BID
69.50
72.50
73.50

82.50
91.40
92.40

77.50
80.50
81.50

74.50
77.50
78.50

70.50
73.50
74.50

81.50
90.40
91.40

76.50
79.50
80.50

73.50
76.50
77.50

LR A

LR AR R

B P B P B P B P B P B P

BB

50.00
27.25
27.25
42.50
70.00
70.00
75.00
70.00

45.00
24.50
24.50
40.00
65.00
67.50
70.00
67.50

90.00
92.50
90.00

80.00
82.50
80.00

75.00
80.00
75.00

72.50
75.00
72.50

85.00
110.00
110.00

75.00
100.00
100.00

70.00
95.00
95.00

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$59.00
$59.00
$39.00
$65.00
$80.00
$80.00
$75.00
$80.00

$49.00
$49.00
$29.00
$60.00
$70.00
$75.00
$70.00
$75.00

$120.00
$120.00
$120.00

$110.00
$110.00
$110.00

$100.00
$100.00
$100.00

$90.00
$90.00
$90.00

$130.00
$130.00
$130.00

$120.00
$120.00
$120.00

$110.00
$110.00
$110.00

NO BID
NO BID
$27.00
NO BID
NO BID
$95.00
$100.00
$110.00

NO BID
$24.00
$24.00
NO BID
NO BID
$89.00
$93.00
$99.00

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID




Categories 4

() DX A2u i NO BID NO BID NO BID $85.00 $ 69.50 $ 67.50 NO BID $100.00
(D) 9-1/2 X 12..ueiiiiieiieeeeee e NO BID NO BID NO BID $85.00 $ 7250 $ 92.50 NO BID $100.00
(€) 9-L/2 X 12-1/2.ceeiiiiiiiieee e NO BID NO BID NO BID $89.00 $ 7350 $ 92.50 NO BID $100.00
Il. SHIPPING CHARGES:
(€Y
(A) Shipments up to and including 120#............ $ 42.00 $62.00 $65.80 $35.00 $ 39.00 $ 95.00 $50.00 $85.00
(B) Shipments over 120# but not exceeding 1,000%.... $ 40.00 $29.00 $35.15 $30.00 $ 30.00 $ 70.00 $35.00 $75.00
(C) Shipments over 1,000# but not exceeding 10,000# $ 10.00 $24.00 $23.03 $20.00 $ 22.00 $ 25.00 $15.00 $75.00
(D) Shipments exceeding 10,000# $ 8.00 $22.00 $14.42 $15.00 $ 18.00 $ 15.00 $12.00 $60.00
(b)
(A) Shipments up to and including 120#............ $ 46.00 $62.00 $65.80 $35.00 $ 39.00 $ 85.00 $50.00 $85.00
(B) Shipments over 120# but not exceeding 1,000#.... $ 45.00 $29.00 $35.15 $30.00 $ 30.00 $ 65.00 $35.00 $75.00
(C) Shipments over 1,000# but not exceeding 10,000# $ 12.00 $24.00 $21.45 $20.00 $ 22.00 $ 23.00 $15.00 $75.00
(D) Shipments exceeding 10,000# $ 9.00 $22.00 $13.64 $15.00 $ 18.00 $ 15.00 $12.00 $60.00
(c)
(A) Shipments up to and including 120#............ $ 46.00 $62.00 $65.80 $35.00 $ 39.00 $ 85.00 $50.00 $85.00
(B) Shipments over 120# but not exceeding 1,000%.... $ 45.00 $32.00 $35.15 $30.00 $ 30.00 $ 65.00 $35.00 $75.00
(C) Shipments over 1,000# but not exceeding 10,000# $ 12.00 $26.00 $21.53 $20.00 $ 22.00 $ 25.00 $15.00 $75.00
(D) Shipments exceeding 10,000# $ 10.00 $24.00 $14.03 $15.00 $ 18.00 $ 15.00 $12.00 $60.00
(d)
(A) Shipments up to and including 120#............ $ 42.00 $62.00 $65.80 $35.00 $ 39.00 $ 95.00 $50.00 $85.00
(B) Shipments over 120# but not exceeding 1,000#.... $ 40.00 $32.00 $35.15 $30.00 $ 30.00 $ 70.00 $35.00 $75.00
(C) Shipments over 1,000# but not exceeding 10,000# $ 9.00 $26.00 $24.53 $20.00 $ 22.00 $ 25.00 $15.00 $75.00
(D) Shipments exceeding 10,000# $ 7.00 $24.00 $15.42 $15.00 $ 18.00 $ 15.00 $12.00 $60.00
(e
(A) Shipments up to and including 120#............ $ 46.00 $52.00 $65.80 $35.00 $ 39.00 $ 85.00 $50.00 $80.00
(B) Shipments over 120# but not exceeding 1,000%.... $ 45.00 $27.00 $35.15 $30.00 $ 30.00 $ 65.00 $35.00 $70.00
(C) Shipments over 1,000# but not exceeding 10,000# $ 11.00 $22.00 $19.43 $20.00 $ 22.00 $ 25.00 $15.00 $70.00
(D) Shipments exceeding 10,000# $ 9.00 $20.00 $12.29 $15.00 $ 18.00 $ 15.00 $12.00 $55.00
®
(A) Shipments up to and including 120#............ $ 46.00 $52.00 $65.80 $35.00 $ 39.00 $ 85.00 $50.00 $80.00
(B) Shipments over 120# but not exceeding 1,000#.... $ 45.00 $27.00 $35.15 $30.00 $ 30.00 $ 65.00 $35.00 $70.00
(C) Shipments over 1,000# but not exceeding 10,000# $ 11.00 $22.00 $17.55 $20.00 $ 22.00 $ 25.00 $15.00 $70.00
(D) Shipments exceeding 10,000# $ 9.00 $20.00 $11.18 $15.00 $ 18.00 $ 15.00 $12.00 $55.00
()]
(A) Shipments up to and including 120#............ $ 61.00 $62.00 $65.80 $35.00 $ 39.00 $ 90.00 $50.00 $80.00
(B) Shipments over 120# but not exceeding 1,000%.... $ 56.00 $28.00 $35.15 $30.00 $ 30.00 $ 65.00 $35.00 $70.00
(C) Shipments over 1,000# but not exceeding 10,000# $ 15.00 $23.00 $18.75 $20.00 $ 22.00 $ 27.25 $15.00 $70.00
(D) Shipments exceeding 10,000# $ 12.00 $21.00 $11.74 $15.00 $ 18.00 $ 16.00 $12.00 $55.00
(h)
(A) Shipments up to and including 120#............ $ 52.00 $52.00 $65.80 $35.00 $ 39.00 $ 85.00 $50.00 $80.00
(B) Shipments over 120# but not exceeding 1,000#.... $ 53.00 $26.00 $35.15 $30.00 $ 30.00 $ 65.00 $35.00 $70.00
(C) Shipments over 1,000# but not exceeding 10,000# $ 15.00 $21.00 $16.73 $20.00 $ 22.00 $ 27.25 $15.00 $70.00
(D) Shipments exceeding 10,000# $ 12.00 $19.00 $10.59 $15.00 $ 18.00 $ 16.00 $12.00 $55.00
0]
(A) Shipments up to and including 120#............ $ 61.00 $62.00 $93.13 $45.00 $ 49.00 $ 60.00 $50.00 $85.00
(B) Shipments over 120# but not exceeding 1,000%.... $ 56.00 $31.00 $48.82 $40.00 $ 39.00 $ 45.00 $35.00 $75.00
(C) Shipments over 1,000# but not exceeding 10,000# $ 15.00 $25.00 $35.29 $35.00 $ 33.00 $ 15.00 $15.00 $75.00
(D) Shipments exceeding 10,000# $ 12.00 $23.00 $24.05 $25.00 $ 19.00 $ 10.00 $12.00 $60.00
Discount: 5.00% 1.00% 0.00% 1.00% 0.00% 0.25% 0.00% 0.00%\




